TABULATION

ANNUAL BIDS # 2520 - ROAD DRAINAGE MATERIALS
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON DECEMBER 7, 2021 AT 11:00 A.M.

FROM: MARCH 16, 2022 TO: MARCH 15, 2023 W/OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR ONE ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL
OPEN MARKET (COST ONLY) PRICE INCREASES ALLOWED

VENDOR'S NAME CONTECH ENGINEERED SOLUTIONS RIO VALLEY PIPE dba CAPA
ADDRESS 2201 W. ROYAL LANE, SD#260 3609 W. PALNA VISTA DRIVE,
DESCRIPTION IRVING, TX. 75063 PALMVIEW, TX. 78572
(972) 482-0045 (956) 580-2502
A [CORRUGATED METAL PIPE, POLYMER COATED CPM,
DELIVERED TO THE JOB SITE (AASHTO M246) PRICE PER L.F. PRICE PER L.F.
(1) 18" X 2 2/3 X 1/2 " CORRUGATIONS - 16 G — 5 40.05 NO BID
(2) 24" X2 2/3X 1/2" CORRUGATIONS - 16 G — 3 52.25 NO BID
(3) 30" X 22/3 X 1/2" CORRUGATIONS - 16 G — 5 55.88 NO BID
(4) 36" X 2 3/4 X 1/2 " CORRUGATIONS - 14 G — 5 70.38 NO BID
5) 48" X 2 2/3 X 1/2" CORRUGATIONS - 14 G — 3 99.25 NO BID
(6) 60" X 2 2/3 X 1/2" CORRUGATIONS - 12 G — 3 248.67 NO BID
(7) 72" X 3" X 1" CORRUGATIONS - 12 G — 3 344.30 NO BID
(8) 84"X_3" X 1" CORRUGATIONS - 12 G — 5 395.52 NO BID
(9) 96" X 3" X 1" CORRUGATIONS - 10G — 3 579.04 NO BID
(10) # BAND COUPLER COMPLETE W/ BOLTS PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH
(A) 18" — 3 37.88 NO BID
(B) 24"/ — 3 47.88 NO BID
(C) 30/ — 3 55.88 NO BID
(D) 36" — 3 70.38 NO BID
(E) 48" — 3 99.25 NO BID
(F) 60"/ — 3 238.75 NO BID
(G) 72" —  $ 321.13 NO BID
(H) 84" — 3 381.50 NO BID
(1) 86"/ —  § 523.25

NO BID
RECOMMENDATION — / L M
CONTECH Frefght - $1,605.00 per Truck load
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TABULATION

ANNUAL BIDS #2520 - ROAD DRAINAGE MATERIALS
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON DECEMBER 7, 2021 AT 11:00 A.M.

FROM: MARCH 16, 2022 TO: MARCH 15, 2023 W/OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR ONE ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL
OPEN MARKET (COST ONLY) PRICE INCREASES ALLOWED

VENDOR'S NAME FONTECH ENGINEERED SOLUTIONS RIO VALLEY PIPE dba CAPA
ADDRESS 2201 W. ROYAL LANE, SD#260 3609 W. PALNA VISTA DRIVE,
DESCRIPTION IRVING, TX. 75063 PALMVIEW, TX. 78572
(972) 482-0045 (956) 580-2502
B | CONCRETE PIPE W/JOINTING MATERIALS
REINFORCED T & G - CLASS Ill_TO ASTM (C-76) PRICE PER L.F. PRICE PER L.F.
(A) 187 X 8LF. NO BID — $ 21.28
(B) 24"/ X BLF. NO BID — 3 29.05
(C) 30"/ X 8LF. NO BID — 3% 46.26
(D) 36"/ X 8LF. NO BID — 3 65.18
(E) 42°/ X BLF. NO BID —> 3 82.88
(F) 48"/ X BLF. NO BID —> §  108.47
(G) 54"/ X BLF. —> $ _ 127.84
C |CONCRETE PIPE REINFORCED GASKET PRICE PER LF. PRICE PER LF.
(Flex Joint)- CLASS Il CONFORM w/ ASTM C-76
A) 187X 8L.F. NO BID — 24.29
B) 24/X 8 LF. NO BID — 3 30.88
C) 30X 8 LF. NO BID — $ 47.45
D) 36" X8 LF. NO BID — $ 70.05
E) 48"/ X8 LF. NO BID —» § _ 111.14
F) 54"/ X 8 LF. NO BID —> §  132.92
G) 607X 8 LF. NO BID — § __ 168.11
H) 727X8LF. NO BID —> §  232.53
RECOMMENDATION—
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TABULATION

ANNUAL BIDS #2520 - ROAD DRAINAGE MATERIALS
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON DECEMBER 7, 2021 AT 11:00 A.M.

FROM: MARCH 16, 2022 TO: MARCH 15, 2023 W/OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR ONE ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL
OPEN MARKET (COST ONLY) PRICE INCREASES ALLOWED

VENDOR'S NAME CONTECH ENGINEERED SOLUTIONS RIO VALLEY PIPE dba CAPA
ADDRESS 2201 W.ROYAL LANE, SD#260 3609 W. PALNA VISTA DRIVE,
DESCRIPTION IRVING, TX. 75063 PALMVIEW, TX. 78572
(972) 482-0045 (956) 580-2502
D. |PRECAST CONCRETE DRAIN INLETS TYPE "AA" PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH
TO CONFORM W/ TXDOT 2004, ITEM 465 OR ASTM C 478
A) IX5X3 NO 8ID — 3 463.87
B) I X§X4 NO BID —> § 530.26
C) 3IX5XS5 NO BID —> $ 662.68
D) 3X5X¥# NQO BID —> 831.44
E) 3IX&§XT NO BID —» 3 996.80
F) 33X5&X8 NO BID —> § 113756
G) TYPE "AA" INLET TOP W/ SIDEWALK RING & COVER NO BID —> 541.05

E. |PRECAST CONCRETE DRAIN INLETS TYPE "CC"

TO CONFORM w/ TXDOT 2004, ITEM 465 OR ASTM C 478 PRICE PER EACH PRICE PER EACH
A) 3'X5 X3 W/2 grates NO BID —> § 1,322.28
B) 3' X5 X4' W/2 grates NO BID —> § 1.358.72
C) 3 X5 X5 W/2grates NO BID —» $ 1,491.18
D) 3' X5 X6 W/2 grates NO BID —> § 1.660.00
E) 3' X5 X7 W/2 grates NOQ BID —> $ 1,823.10
F) 3 X5 X8 Wi2grates NO BID —+ $ 1,966.20
G) TYPE "ACC"MOD INLET GRATES - 2 PER INLET NO BID —> § 830.00
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ANNUAL BIDS #2520 - ROAD DRAINAGE MATERIALS
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON DECEMBER 7, 2021 AT 11:00 A.M.

TABULATION

FROM: MARCH 16, 2022 TO: MARCH 15, 2023 W/OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR ONE ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL

OPEN MARKET (COST ONLY) PRICE INCREASES ALLOWED

VENDOR'S NAME CONTECH ENGINEERED SOLUTIONS RIO VALLEY PIPE dba CAPA
ADDRESS 2201 W. ROYAL LANE, SD#260 3609 W. PALNA VISTA DRIVE,
DESCRIPTION IRVING, TX. 75063

(972) 482-0045

PALMVIEW, TX, 78572
(956) 580-2502

F. |PRECAST CONCRETE BOX CULVERTS

PRICE PER EACH

PRICE PER EACH

TO CONFORM w/ TXDOT 2004 ltem 462 OR ASTM C789 OR C 850
A) 6 (W)X 6 (H) X 8 (L) NO BID —» § 3,920.00
B) 6 (W)X 4' (H) X 8' (L) NO BID —» $ 3501.20
C) 8 (W)X 6 (H) X6 (L) NO BID — $ 359514
D) 8 (W)X 4 (H) X 6' (L) NO BID — §$ 3,742.08
E) 10' (W) X 10' (H) X 6' (1) NO BID — $_6,192.42
F) 10 (W)X 7 (H) X6 (L) NO BID —» § 523422
G) 10 (W) X 6 (H) X 6' (L) NO BID —— $ 4,987.26
H) 4' (W) X3 (H) X 8' (L) —— § 232544
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TABULATION

ANNUAL BIDS # 2520 - ROAD DRAINAGE MATERIALS
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON DECEMBER 7, 2021 AT 11:00 A.M.

FROM: MARCH 16, 2022 TO: MARCH 15, 2023 W/OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR ONE ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL
OPEN MARKET (COST ONLY) PRICE INCREASES ALLOWED

VENDOR'S NAME CONTECH ENGINEERED SOLUTIONS RIO VALLEY PIPE dba CAPA
ADDRESS 2201 W.ROYAL LANE, SD#260 3609 W. PALNA VISTA DRIVE,
DESCRIPTION IRVING, TX. 75063 PALMVIEW, TX. 78572
(972) 482-0045 (956) 580-2502
G. |[CONCRETE PIPE REINFORCED (T & G) CLASS I
A)12"X 8L.F. NO BID —» 15.35 PRILF
B) 12" X 8 L.F. REINFORCED GASKET (FLEX JOINT) NO BID —» 18.37 PRILF
MISC OFF NA 0%
RECOMMENDATION —
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