

TABULATION

ANNUAL BID # 2580 - ROAD SURFACING MATERIALS

AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON DECEMBER 7, 2021 AT 11:00 A.M.

FROM: MARCH 16, 2022 TO MARCH 15, 2023 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL.

OPEN MARKET (COST ONLY) PRICE INCREASES ALLOWED

BIDDER'S NAME AND ADDRESS	UPPER VALLEY MATERIALS 3609 W. PALMA VISTA DRIVE, PALMVIEW, TX. 78572 (956) 432-0600	FRONTERA MATERIALS P.O. BOX 1449, ELSA, TX. 78543 (956) 316-8952	VULCAN MATERIALS P.O. BOX 791550, SAN ANTONIO, TX. 78279 (210) 524-3567
A. HOT MIX- ASPHALTIC CONCRETE			
1. Type "D" - Gravel / Limestone	PER/TON	PER/TON	PER/TON
"Paving & Speed Humps"			
(1) Zone 1	\$82.00	→	\$71.77
(2) Zone 2	\$82.00	→	\$71.77
(3) Zone 3	\$82.00	→	\$70.90
(4) Zone 4	\$82.50	→	\$69.40
(5) Zone 5	\$84.00	→	\$69.40
(6) Hold for pick-up	\$74.00	→	\$65.00
B. LIMESTONE ROCK ASPHALT (CLASS A)			
1. Type "CC" - natural cold - coarse	PER/TON	PER/TON	PER/TON
(a) Public Works Brownsville P1	NO BID	NO BID	→ \$123.49
(b) Public Works Brownsville P2	NO BID	NO BID	→ \$123.49
(c) Public Works San Benito P3	NO BID	NO BID	→ \$119.79
(d) Public Works Harlingen P4	NO BID	NO BID	→ \$118.68
(e) Zone 1	NO BID	NO BID	→ \$118.68
(f) Zone 2	NO BID	NO BID	→ \$119.79
(g) Zone 3	NO BID	NO BID	→ \$120.16
(h) Zone 4	NO BID	NO BID	→ \$121.83
(i) Zone 5	NO BID	NO BID	→ \$123.49
2. TYPE "D" - natural cold - fines			
(a) Public Works Brownsville P1 & P2	→ \$109.00	NO BID	\$124.49
(b) Public Works San Benito	→ \$105.00	NO BID	\$120.79
(c) Public Works Harlingen	→ \$103.00	NO BID	\$119.68
(d) Zone 1	→ \$102.50	NO BID	\$119.68
(e) Zone 2	→ \$105.00	NO BID	\$120.79
(f) Zone 3	→ \$105.50	NO BID	\$121.16
(g) Zone 4	→ \$106.00	NO BID	\$122.83
(h) Zone 5	→ \$109.00	NO BID	\$124.49

RECOMMENDATION BY COUNTY ENGINEER:


 BENJAMIN L. WORSHAM, P.E., P.T.O.E. DIRECTOR OF TRANSPORTATION DATE 1/24/2022

I HEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED:


 MICHAEL FORBES, ASST. AUDITOR / PURCHASING DATE 1/19/22


 CARLOS A. SANCHEZ, COUNTY ROAD ENGINEER DATE 1/24/2022

**Awarded by Commissioners' Court
on 02/01/2022**

TABULATION

ANNUAL BID # 2580 - ROAD SURFACING MATERIALS

AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON DECEMBER 7, 2021 AT 11:00 A.M.

FROM: MARCH 16, 2022 TO MARCH 15, 2023 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL.

OPEN MARKET (COST ONLY) PRICE INCREASES ALLOWED

BIDDER'S NAME AND ADDRESS	UPPER VALLEY MATERIALS 3609 W. PALMA VISTA DRIVE, PALMVIEW, TX. 78572 (956) 432-0600	FRONTERA MATERIALS P.O. BOX 1449, ELSA, TX. 78543 (956) 316-8952	VULCAN MATERIALS P.O. BOX 791550, SAN ANTONIO, TX. 78279 (210) 524-3567
DESCRIPTION	PER/TON	PER/TON	PER/TON
C. AGGREGATE FOR SURFACE TREATMENTS			
1. Type P.E. Grade 3			
(a) Zone 1	NO BID	→ \$53.08	NO BID
(b) Zone 2	NO BID	→ \$54.71	NO BID
(c) Zone 3	NO BID	→ \$56.38	NO BID
(d) Zone 4	NO BID	→ \$57.76	NO BID
(e) Zone 5	NO BID	→ \$58.11	NO BID
2. Type P.E. Grade 4 Non Coated Aggregate			
(a) Zone 1	NO BID	→ \$30.08	NO BID
(b) Zone 2	NO BID	→ \$31.71	NO BID
(c) Zone 3	NO BID	→ \$33.38	NO BID
(d) Zone 4	NO BID	→ \$34.76	NO BID
(e) Zone 5	NO BID	→ \$35.11	NO BID
3. Type P.E. Grade 5			
(a) Zone 1	NO BID	→ \$53.08	NO BID
(b) Zone 2	NO BID	→ \$54.71	NO BID
(c) Zone 3	NO BID	→ \$56.38	NO BID
(d) Zone 4	NO BID	→ \$57.76	NO BID
(e) Zone 5	NO BID	→ \$58.11	NO BID
4. Type P.E. Grade 5 Non Coated Aggregate			
(a) Zone 1	NO BID	→ \$30.08	NO BID
(b) Zone 2	NO BID	→ \$31.71	NO BID
(c) Zone 3	NO BID	→ \$33.38	NO BID
(d) Zone 4	NO BID	→ \$34.76	NO BID
(e) Zone 5	NO BID	→ \$35.11	NO BID

RECOMMENDATION BY COUNTY ENGINEER: →

BENJAMIN L. WORSHAM, P.E. P.T.O.E. DIRECTOR OF TRANSPORTATION DATE 1/24/2022

I HEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED: 1/19/22

MICHAEL FORBES, ASST. AUDITOR / PURCHASING DATE

CARLOS A. SANCHEZ, COUNTY ROAD ENGINEER DATE 1/24/2022

**Awarded by Commissioners' Court
on 02/01/2022**

TABULATION

SECONDARY (BACK-UP) SUPPLIER

ANNUAL BID # 2580 - ROAD SURFACING MATERIALS

AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON DECEMBER 7, 2021 AT 11:00 A.M.

FROM: MARCH 16, 2022 TO MARCH 15, 2023 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL.

OPEN MARKET (COST ONLY) PRICE INCREASES ALLOWED

	BIDDER'S NAME AND ADDRESS	UPPER VALLEY MATERIALS 3609 W. PALMA VISTA DRIVE, PALMVIEW, TX. 78572 (956) 432-0600	FRONTERA MATERIALS P.O. BOX 1448, ELSA, TX. 78543 (956) 316-8952	VULCAN MATERIALS P.O. BOX 791550, SAN ANTONIO, TX. 78279 (210) 524-3567
A.	DESCRIPTION	PER/TON	PER/TON	PER/TON
	HOT MIX- ASPHALTIC CONCRETE			
	1. Type "D" - Gravel / Limestone			
	"Paving & Speed Humps"			
	(1) Zone 1	→ \$84.00	\$71.77	NO BID
	(2) Zone 2	→ \$84.00	\$71.77	NO BID
	(3) Zone 3	→ \$84.00	\$70.90	NO BID
	(4) Zone 4	→ \$84.50	\$69.40	NO BID
	(5) Zone 5	→ \$86.00	\$69.40	NO BID
	(6) Hold for pick-up	→ \$76.00	\$65.00	NO BID

RECOMMENDATION BY COUNTY ENGINEER: →

[Signature] 1/24/2022
BENJAMIN L. WORSHAM, P.E., P.T.O.E. DIRECTOR OF TRANSPORTATION DATE

I HEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED.

[Signature] 1/19/22
MICHAEL FORBES, ASST. AUDITOR / PURCHASING DATE

[Signature] 1/24/2022
CARLOS A. SANCHEZ, COUNTY ROAD ENGINEER, DATE

**Awarded by Commissioners' Court
on 02/01/2022**