ANNUAL BIDS - ROAD MACHINERY RENTAL # 1710
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON DECEMBER 7, 2021,

AT 11:00 A.M.

TABULATION

FROM: FEBRUARY 19, 2022 TO: FEBRUARY 18, 2023 W/OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL.

BIDDER'S NAME ROMCO ANDERSON EQUIPMENT NUECES POWER EQUIPMENT
AND 1519 W. BELT LINE ROAD, 700 WEST INTERSTATE 2 1 INDUSTRIAL WAY,
ADDRESS CARROLLTON, TX. 75006 PHARR, TX. 78577 SAN BENITO, TX. 78586
DESCRIFTION (214) 8194100 {956) 7615098 {956) 361-0086
RAINY DAY RAINY DAY RAINY DAY
DALY WEEKLY MONTHLY CREDIT DALY WEEKLY MONTHLY CREDIT DAILY WEEKLY MONTHLY CREDIT
A EXCAVATOR SM. $ 705.00|% 211500 | % 6,345.00 | <§705.00>| NOBID |[$ 190000 ]|$ 5,700.00 N/A $ 74000 | $ 213000 |$ 6,390.00 N/A
B. EXCAVATOR LRG. $ 8750018 2625.00|% 7,875.00| <$875.00>| NOBID {$ 2,700.00 | $ 8,100.00 N/A $ 901.00 [ $ 2703.00|% 8,109.00 N/A
C. ROLLER Single Drum Shesp Foot Vibratory 84 12-13 Ton $ 54300 3% 162700 | % 4.880.00 | <8543.00>| NOBID |3 1,40000|% 4,200.00 N/A $ 510.00 [ $ 1,530.00 | $ 4,530.00 N/A
D. ROLLER Prneumatic w/ Vibratory 84 12-13 Ton $ 366.00|8% 1,097.00|% 3,290.00 | <§366.00>| NOBID |{$ 1,200.00|$ 3,600.00 N/A $ 500.00 | $ 1,500.00 | 3 4,500.00 N/A
E. ROLLER Double Smooth Drum Vibratory 74-84° 10-13 Ton $ 513.00|% 1,537.00|§ 4,609.00 | <§513.00>| NOBID |$ 160000 |3 4,800.00 N/A $ 670.00 | $ 200000 | % 6,000.00 N/A
F. ROLLER Double Smooth Drum Vibratory 50-60* 4-8 Tan $ 59500 |3 1.785.00 |$ 5.350.00 | <§595.00>| NOBID [$ 1.000.00|% 3,000.00 N/A $ 25500 |$ 76500 % 2.295.00 N/A
G. ROLLER Single Smooth Drum /Vibratory 74-84" 10-13 Ton $ 513.00|$ 1.537.00|F 4609.00| <§5713.00>] NOBID |$ 1.600.00|% 4,800.00 N/A $ 450.00 | § 1.350.00 | § 4,050.00 N/A
H. MOTORGRADER 27,000 Op. WL/Lb. 125 H.P. minl NO 8BID NO BID NO BID N/A NOBID |$ 2,500.00|% 7,500.00 N/A $ 750.00 | § 2,250.00 | $ 6,075.00 N/A
1. BACKHOE / LOADER, 23,800 Op. Wt./Lb. and 97H.P. ml NO BID NO 8ID NO BID N/A NOBID | $ 1,000.00| $ 3,00000 NIA $ 30000|$ 900.00}|% 2700.00 N/A
J. LOADER FRONT END, 31,800 Op. Wt./Lb, and 172 H.P. mlnimum | NO BID NO BID NO BID N/A NOBID |$ 200000|% 6.000.00 N/A $ 730.00 |$ 2,190.00 | $ 6,570.00 NI/A
K. MILLING MACHINE Small, 4105 ft. Drum, front loading conveyor NO BID NO BID NO 8ID N/A NO BID NO BID NO BID N/A $ 250000|% 7.,50000|% 22500.00 N/A
L. MILLING MACHINE Large, 6ft & Sinch to 7f & 3 inch drum NO 8ID NO BID NO BID N/A NOBID |$ 850000|% 25000.00 N/A $ 312500 | % 9.375.00 [ $ 28,000.00 N/A
MISC % OFF LIST 15% N/A 5%
RECOMMENDATION —
1 HEREBY CE 5? THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED. 01/27/22
DATE
( % _ le1]2v a7
MICHAEL ES, PURCHASING AGENT DATE DA

Approved by Commissioners'
on 02/15/2022




TABULATION

ANNUAL BIDS - ROAD MACHINERY RENTAL # 1710
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON DECEMBER 7, 2021, AT 11:00 A.M.
FROM: FEBRUARY 18, 2022 TO: FEBRUARY 18, 2023 W/OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL.

BIDDER'S NAME DOGGETT HEAVY MACHINERY SERVICES, LLC
AND 901 EAST INTERSTATE 2
ADDRESS SAN JUAN< TEXAS 78539
DESCRIPTION 056-342-5228
RAINY DAY
DAILY WEEKLY MONTHLY CREDIT

A EXCAVATOR SM. NO BID $ 2,200.00 | $ 6,000.00 N/A
B. EXCAVATOR LRG. NO BID $ 2700.00|$ 7,500.00 N/A
C. ROLLER Single Drum Sheep Foot Vibratory B4" 12-13 Ton NO BID $ 1,400.00|% 4,200.00 N/A
D. ROLLER P! ic w! Vibratory 84" 12-13 Yon NO 81D $§ 2,100.00 | $ 5,800.00 N/A
E. ROLLER Double Smooth Drum Vibratory 74-84" 10-13 Ton NOBID $ 1,500.00| % 4,100.00 N/A
F. ROLLER Double Smaoth Drum Vibratory 50-60" 4-6 Ton NO BID $ 1,600.00 | NOBID N/A
G. ROLLER Singla Smooth Drum /Vibratory 74-84" 10-13 Ton NQO BID NO BID NO BID N/A
H. MOTORGRADER 27,000 Op, WL/Lb. 125 H.P. mini NO BID NO BID NO BID N/A
i. BACKHOE / LOADER, 23,800 Op. Wt./Lb, and 87H.P. NO BID NO BID NO BID N/A
J. LOADER FRONT END, 31,800 Op. Wt./Lb. and 172 H.P. minimum | NO BID $ 2000003 650000 N/A
K. MILLING MACHINE Small, 4to5 ft. Drum, front loading conveyor NO BID NO BID NO BiD N/A
L. MILLING MACHINE Largs, 6fl & Sinch 1o 7# & 3 Inch drum NO BID NO BID NO BID NIA
MISC % OFF LIST N/A

RECOMMENDATION —»

/

| HEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED,

i~ s

C
MICHAEL FORBES, PURCHASING AGENT DATE ' CARLOS K. SAMCHEZ, P.E. -COUNTY ROAD ENGINEER DIV. DIRECTOR E

Approved by Commissioners'
on 02/15/2022



