

## **TABULATION**

ANNUAL BIDS - LUBES, OILS, GREASES & ANTI-FREEZE. # 1993
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON FEBRUARY 8, 2022, AT 11:00 A.M.
FROM: MARCH 31, 2022 TO: MARCH 30, 2023 W/OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL.
OPEN MARKET PRICE INCREASES ALLOWED.

BIDDER'S NAME AND ADDRESS DESCRIPTION	MONTHLY	ARGUNDEGUI OIL 105 PENNZOIL LPP EDINBURG, TX. 78542 (956) 722-5251	OIL PATCH FUEL 1905 BAYOU COURT RD., BROWNSVILLE, TX. 78526 (956) 831-4839
DESCRIPTION	USAGE	TOTAL PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
CATEGORY A:	UGAGE	TOTALTRIOL	TOTALTIMOL
1. Engine Oil 5w30 api-sn	500 gls	\$2,147.50	\$4,110.00
2. Engine Oil 5w30 api-sh	1/55gl	\$527.21	\$518.35
3. Engine Oil 15w40 api-sii	500 gls	\$2,810.00	\$5,595.00
4. Engine Oil 15w40 api-cg4	1/55gl	\$673.36	\$681.70
5. Gear Oil 85/140 85w-140 api-gl5	.5/55ql	\$412.50	\$854.40
6. Dextron III - ATF	500 gls	\$778.33	\$5,885.00
7. Dextron III - ATF	1/55gl	\$284.43	\$727.35
8. Fully syntetic Oil 0w20	1/55gl	\$766.07	\$849.45
9. A.W. Hydraulic Oil ISO.68 DENISION HFO	1/55gl	\$504.43	\$584.90
10. Universal Tractor Fluid General Purpose J20C/C-4	55 gl	\$764.17	NO BID
11. Universal Tractor Fluid General Purpose J20C/C-4	1/55gl	\$279.72	NO BID
12. Grease-NLGI-2 Multi-PurposeEP2 Lithium Complex	50 each	\$66.60	NO BID
13. Grease-NLGI-2 Multi-PurposeEP2 Lithium Complex	120lbs.	\$218.15	NO BID
14. Power Steering Fluid - Reg.	12 qts.	NO BID	NO BID
TOTAL CATEGORY A:		→ \$10,232.47	INC
CATEGORY B:			
Anti-Freeze-Winter/Summer- Green-Regular - non freezing to 20 degrees below zero Fahrenheit	Jug gl.	NO BID	\$443.94
2. Anti-Freeze- Winter/Summer- DexCool 100% -non freezing to 20degrees below zeroFahrenheit	Jug gl.	NO BID	\$1,045.88
TOTAL CATEGORY B:		NO BID	> \$1,489.82
CATEGORY C:			
Degreaser & Tar Remover Arrow Magnolia – ARCS- 250 or	55 gls	NO BID	NO BID
Miscellaneous discount off catalog list price for Lubes, Oils, Greases		0%	0%

RECOMMENDATION

I HEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED.

MICHAEL FORBES, PURCHASING AGENT

DATE

Z-11- % T

Approved by Commissioners' Court on 03/01/2022