

TABULATION

ANNUAL BID # 2430 - MOSQUITO INSECTICIDE

AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON: FEBRUARY 23, 2022 AT 11:00 A.M.

FROM: MARCH 16, 2022 TO: MARCH 15, 2023 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL.

VENDOR'S NAME & ADDRESS		CLARKE MOSQUITO 675 SIDWELL CT., ST. CHARLES, IL. 60174 (800) 323-5727	VESERIS 125 NORTH G. ST., HARLINGEN, TX. 78550 (713) 203-0436	ADAPCO 100 COLONIAL CENTER , S#170 LAKE MARY, FL. 32746 (407) 328-6519	TARGET SPECIALTY 1225 N. POST OAK RD., HOUSTON, TX. 77055 (225) 241-5670
DESCRIPTION	U/M				
1. 18% Resmethrin, 54% Piperonyl Butoxide - 5 gal/pail	GAL	NO BID	NO BID	→ \$539.33	NO BID
2. 4% Resmethrin, 12% Piperonyl Butoxide - (Ready to use = RTU) 55 gal/drum	GAL	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
3. Oil - base Permethrin RTU, min 4% Permethrin, 8% Piperonyl Butoxide - (55 gal Drum)	GAL	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	→ \$44.50
4. Oil-based Pyrethroids - min. 1.5% Oil-based Permethrin, 7.5% Piperonyl Butoxide - Ready to use (55 gal Drum)	GAL	→ \$58.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
5. Oil-based Permethrin RTU, min. 4% Permethrin and 4% Piperonyl Butoxide - - Ready to Use (55 gal) Drum	GAL	\$29.50	→ \$17.61	\$23.22	\$19.30
6. Oil-based Permethrin RTU, min. 4% Permethrin and 4% Piperonyl Butoxide - Ready to Use - 2 X 2.5 gal/p	GAL	\$37.90	→ \$17.61	\$24.79	\$24.58
7. Oil-based Permethrin RTU, min. 4% Permethrin and 4% Piperonyl Butoxide - Ready to Use - (275 gals) Mini	GAL	\$29.50	→ \$17.61	\$22.39	\$18.65
8. Oil-based Permethrin Concentrate, min. 30% Permethrin, 30% Piperonyl Butoxide - 5 gal/pail	GAL	\$178.50	\$70.98	\$93.50	→ \$67.00
9. Oil-based Permethrin Concentrate min. 31% Permethrin, 66% Piperonyl Butoxide - per/gal	GAL	\$119.70	→ 108.97	\$136.17	\$150.00
10. Chlorpyrifos 1.5 lb/gal RTU - 55 gal drum	GAL	→ \$71.00	NO BID	\$74.37	NO BID
11. Chlorpyrifos 1.5 lb/gal RTU - 2.5 gal drum	GAL	NO BID	NO BID	→ \$78.09	NO BID
12. Altosid Briquets (220 cnt.) - 150 days (Open Market Price Increases allowed)	BX	\$787.60	→ \$787.60 *1	NO BID	\$787.60
13. Altosid Briquets (400 cnt.) - 30 days (Open Market Price Increases allowed)	BX	\$500.00	→ \$500.00 *1	NO BID	\$500.00
14. Altoside Pro G 1.5% Methoprene (24 pr cs) - xx days (Open Market Price Increase allowed)	CS	→ \$140.00	\$174.98	NO BID	\$171.60
15. Altoside Pro G 1.5% Methoprene (12 pr cs) - xx days (Open Market Price Increase allowed)	CS	→ \$288.00	\$359.98	NO BID	\$366.00
16. Bactimos Briquets (100 pr/box) - 30 days	BX	\$99.20	→ \$92.97	NO BID	\$103.75
17. Briquets - 6% Bacillus Sphaericus, 1% Bacillus thuringiensis (200 cnt) - 45 day	BX	→ \$302.00	NO BID	\$1,330.00	NO BID
18. EPA Approved Diluent Oil for Mosquito Control - 55 gal/drum	GAL	\$19.01	→ \$8.34	\$13.75	\$14.25
19. Aquabac (200G) Bacillus Thuringiensis 2.86%	BAG	\$432.58	→ \$74.23	\$90.00	\$92.00

*1 - LOCAL VENDOR

RECOMMENDATION →

I HEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED

MICHAEL FORBES, ASST. AUDITOR / PURCHASING DATE: 3/7/22

GUSTAVO OLIVARES, ENVIRONMENTAL HEALTH DEPT. DATE: 3/7/22

**Awarded by Commissioners' Court
on 03/15/2022**