GALLS, LLC

UNIFORMS' COST - ANNUAL BID

(Awarded A, B, B-4 & E)

PRICE
A. SHERIFE'S DEPT, USAGE PR/YR (EACH) EACH @
PATROL UNIFORMS:
A-1:  Shirts - Long Sleeve - Male 210 $58.00
A-2: Pants - Male 210 $52.00
A-3: Shirts — Long Slecve — Female 210 _$58.00
A-4: Pants — Female 60 $52.00
A-5 Shirts — Short Sleeve — Male 60 $42.00
A-6: Shirts — Short Sleeve - Female 60 $42.00
A-7: Patrol Armor Skin X-P 250 9900
CATEGORY A TOTAL
B. JAIL
GUARD UNIFORMS:
B-1: SHIRTS - SHORT SLEEVE — MALE & FEMALE 330 $30.00
B-2: SHIRTS - LONG SLEEVE - MALE & FEMALE 50 _$32.00
B-3: PANTS - MALE 10 small $30.00
10 med $£30.00
20 Irg. _$30.00
10 X-lrg _$30.00
10 2X $30.00
B-4: PANTS - FEMALE 10 small _$30.00
10 med _$30.00
20 lrg. $30.00
10 X-Irg $30.00
10 2X $30.00
$24 50
B-5: Flannel Lined Windbreaker
CATEGORY B TOTAL
C. INMATE COVERALILS AND UNJFORMS:
C-1: COVERALLS
(White, Dark Blue)
S .-XL 70 _NO BiD
2X 5 NOBID.
3X _NOBID
4X _NOBID _
5X _NOEBID
6X NO BID
(Orange, Green)
S-XL 600 NO BID
2X 100 NO BID
3X NO BID
4X NO BID
5% NO BID
6X NO BID
(Red, Siiver, Tan)
S-XL 15 NO BID
2X 10 NO BID
3X NO BIO
4x NO BID
5% NO BID
6X NO BID

Bid #2660

TOTAL
$12,180.00

$10.920.00
'$12.180.00

—%3,12000
_$2.62000
- $2.520.00
$24.750.00

 $300.00
—$300.00
__$600.00
__ $300.00

~$300.00

$24.50
E————————
_$15,124.50

NO BID
'NO BID
NOBID

NO BID
NOBID

NOBID

NOBID
NOBD_
noBD
_NOBD |

NOBID

NO BID ,
NO BID

_NOBID
NO BID

_NOBID _
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GALLS, LLC
(Awarded A, B, B-4 & E)

DELIVERY PERIOD AFTER RECEIPT OF ORDERS: _20-30 days ARO
WARRANTY PERIOD OF ALL CLOTHING (by Category): See attached

This Bid includes all costs, material, delivery and/or labor, as set forth in the attached Spe

C-2: V-NECK SHIRTS

PRICE PAGE (CONTINUED)

{Orange, Red, Green)

S-2X 10
3X
4X
5X
6X

(White, Blue, Silver, Tan)

C-3: WORK PANTS
ELASTIC WASTE

S-2X 150
X
4X
5X
6X

(Orange, Red, Green)

(White, Blue, Silver, Tan)

INMATE SANDALS - SHOWER:
SANDALS - SHOWER

PATROL JACKETS

S-2X 10
3X-4X
5X-6X
S-2X 150
3X-4X
5X-6X
2000
S 2
M 5
L 5
XL 5
2X 3

NOBID
NOBID
_NOBID

NO BID
NOBID_

NOBID
NO BID
NOBD
NOBID
s

NOBID
NOBD
_NOBID

NO BID
NQO BID
_NOBID

CATEGORY C TOTAL

NO BID

CATEGORY D TOTAL

__$135.00
$135.00

_$135.00
$135.00

$135.00

CATEGORY E TOTAL

have read and agree to comply with all these requirements.

Firm's Representative: David Scheve

Name of Bidder:  Galis, LLC

Title; CFO

Address of Bidder: 1340 Russell Cave Rd.

_Lexington, KY 40505

Telephone No.:( 800 ) 876-4242

(City, State, Zip Code)

Bid #2660

NOBID
NO BID
_NOBID

NO BID
_NO BID

_NOBID
_NoBD
_NOBID

NO BID

“NOBID

NOBID
NoBID
NC BID

NO BID

NOBID
NO BID

NO 81D

NosiD

NO BID

-$270.00

__§675.00
$675.00_

367500

_$405.00

$2,700.00

cifications’ Packet and Instructions. [
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GALES SELC Bid #2660
(Awarded A, B, B-4 & E)
UNIFORMS' COST - ANNUAL, BID

MISCELLANEOUS LIST

*‘4' fi= ‘l«\

On all other miscellaneous Uniform related items not listed Cameron Cournty will recewe 9% off our catalog list prices.

CATALOG WITH LIST PRICES MUST ACCOMPANY ALL BIDS SUBMITTED.,

Bidder Galls, LLC - ] -

Address_ 1340 Russell Cave Rd.

Lexington, KY 40505

(Cllyr‘StaﬂLf? ? /L /

Signature

Telephone 800-876-4242 ~ Date_5/20/2021
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VICTORY SUPPLY
(Awarded C, C-1, C-2 & C-3)

UNIFORMS' COST - ANNUAL BID

A, SHERIFE'S DEPT. USAGE PR/YR(EACIT
PATROL UNIFORMS:
A-1: Shirts - Long Sleeve - Male 210
A-2: Pants - Male 210
A-3: Shirts — Long Sleeve — Female 210
A-4: Pants — Female 60
A-5 Shirts — Short Sleeve — Male 60
A-6; Shirts — Short Sleeve — Female 60
A-T: Patrol Armor Skin X-P 250
B. JAL
GUARD UNIFORMS:
B-1: SHIRTS - SHORT SLEEVE — MALE & FEMALE 330
B-2: SHIRTS - LONG SLEEVE — MALE & FEMALE 50
B-3: PANTS - MALE 10 small
10 med
20 Irg.
10 X-lrg
102X
B-4: PANTS - FEMALE [0 small
10 med
20 Irg.
10 X-lrg
102X
C. INMATE COVERALLS AND UNIFORMS:
C-1: COVERALLS
(White, Dark Blue)
S—-XL 70
2X 5
3X
4X
5X
6X
(Orange, Green)
S-XL 600
2X 100
3X
4X
5X
6X
(Red, Silver, Tan)
S-XL 15
2X 10
3X
4X
5X
6X

CATEGORY A TOTAL

13.69

Bid #2660
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VICTORY SUPPLY
(Awarded C, C-1 C-2 & C-3) PRICE PAGE (CONTINULED)
C-2: V-NECK SHIRTS (Orange, Red, Green)
S-2X 10 5.74
3X 6.09
4X 6.44
5X 6.82
6X 711
(Mhite, Blue, Sitver, Tan)
$-2X 150 5.74
3X 6.09
4X 6.44
5% 6.82
6X 741
C-3: WORK PANTS (Orange, Red, Green)
ELASTIC WASTE $-2X 10 5.66
3X-4X 5.89
5X-6X 6.57 _
(While, Blue, Silver, Tan)
S-2X 150 5.66
3X-4X 5.89
5X-6X 6.597 .
CATEGORY C TOTAL
D. INMATE SANDALS - SHOWER:
SANDALS - SHOWER 2000 217
CATEGORY D TOTAL
E. PATROL JACKETS
S 2 NB
M 5 — =
L 5 .
XL 5 |
2X 3 v o

CATEGORY E TOTAL

DELIVERY PERIOD AFTER RECEIPT OF ORDERS: _14daysARO

WARRANTY PERIOD OF ALL CLOTHING (by Category): _

Bid #2660

R
~
o

ooo|x
[(D!

ol® NOK
9 Looh
o
|

— N

‘8:.

|

it

56.60
589
657

_849.00
589
657
1308372

4340.00
4340.00

___NB

Please see attached warranty information.

This Bid includes all costs, material, delivery and/or labor, as set forth in the attached Specifications’ Packet and Instructions. I

have read and agree to comply with all these requirements.

Firm's Representative: Kathleen Trommeritle: LLC Manag_ing_Me_mbgr_ -

Name of Bidder: _Victory Supply LLC - - -
Address of Bidder: 7025 Industrial P_a_rk Rd -

_Mount Pleasant, TN 38474
(City, State, Zip Code)
Telephone No.:( 8884376-1205 — .
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VICTORY SUPPLY Bid #2660
(Awarded C, C-1, C-2 & C-3)

UNIFORMS' COST - ANNUAL BID

MISCELLANEQUS LIST

On all other miscellaneous Uniform related items not listed Cameron County will receivelz__% off our catalog list prices.

CATALOG WITH LIST PRICES MUST ACCOMPANY ALL BIDS SUBMITTED.

Address 7025 Industrial Park Rd - S
Mount Pleasant, TN 38474 _ e

'(c"iuyzs\:747.ip)
Signature_____ M o

Telephone_888-376-1205 Date  9/20/ 2_021
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CHARM TEX
INTF §' COST - ANNUAL BID
(Awarded D) UNIFORMS' COST - ANNLU 1
PRICE
A. SHERIFF'S DEPT. USAGE PR/YR (EACH) EACH @
PATROL UNIFORMS:
A-1:  Shirts - Long Sleeve - Male 210 il
A-2:  Pants- Male 210 oo
A-3: Shirts — Long Sleeve — Female 210 L
A-4: Pants - Female 60 7
A-5 Shirts — Short Sleeve - Male 60 S
A-6: Shirts — Short Sleeve — Female 60 i
AT Patrel Armor Skin X-P 250 _a¥ile
CATEGORY A TOTAL
B. JAIL
GUARD UNIFORMS: _
B-1: SHIRTS - SHORT SLEEVE - MALE & FEMALE 330 PNLS
B-2: SHIRTS - LONG SLEEVE -- MALE & FEMALE 50 S
B-3: PANTS - MALE 10 small J
10 med s
20 Irg. L
10 X-Irg
102X . ,»;,
B-4: PANTS - FEMALE 10 small N {
10 med D i
20 lrg. N ____.af _
10 X-Irg Y
102X S L
CATEGORY B TOTAL
C. INMATE COVERALLS AND UNIFORMS:

C-1:  COVERALLS
{White, Dark Blue)
S-XL 70
2X 5
3X
aX
5X
6X
(Orange. Green)
S-XL 600
2X 160
3X
4X
5X
6X
(Red, Siiver, Tan)
S-XL 15
2X 10
3X
4X
5X

CHARM-TEX 2

1618 Coney Island Ave
Brooklyn, NY 11230
Phone (718} 252-8100
WWW.CHARM-TEX.COM

Bid #2660

A%, 00

C4-CY
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Bid #2660

CHARM TEX
(Awarded D) PRICE PAGE (CONTINUED)
C-2;:  V-NECK SHIRTS (Orange, Red, Green) ‘
S-2X 10 . i (AN,
3X [
4X 6.7
5X Lo
6X e
(White, Blue, Silver, Tan) _
S-2X 150 D! HAzAwov
3X b
4X L SY
5X sy
x RE
C-3: WORK PANTS (Orange, Red, Green) _
ELASTIC WASTE $-2X 10 ¢ b GO
3X-4X _LsY
5X-6X G
(White, Blue, Silver, Tan)
§5-2X 150 (26 Q500
3X-4X G Y - -
5X-6X e

CATEGORY CTOTAL  {®\2L.Ho

D. INMATE SANDALS - SHOWER: ,
SANDALS - SHOWER 2000 ok 2o, .

N,

CATEGORY D TOTAL BAFO, VO

E. PATROL JACKETS ,_
S 2 1 L —
M 5 )
L 5 L N
XT. 5 /
2X 3 I\ 1
CATEGORY E TOTAL =
DELIVERY PERIOD AFTER RECEIPT OF ORDERS: 7_ '_3_'__ __‘) L R -

WARRANTY PERIOD OF ALL CLOTHING (by Category): J 35__‘_-__ Ry «'-.“1_; AT Lo ek

This Bid includes all costs, material, delivery and/or labor, as set forth in the attached Specifications’ Packet and Instructions. 1
have read and agree to compty with all these requirements.

Firm's Representative: E:}tpn Decvrne  Title: (F . «F Sohes
7

Name of Bidder: Xy cin ~Tos ) -

Address of Bidder:  \“\o\5 (o0 N MR pen R -

ok o 15_\’\0\ N\Y ===
(City, State, Zip Code)
Telephone No.:(WN& ) 2452 Foo
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CHARM TEX Bid #2660
(Awarded D)

UNIFORMS' COST - ANNUAL BID

MISCELLANEOUS LIST

On all other miscellaneous Uniform related items not_listed Cameron County will receive S % off our catalog list prices.

CATALOG WITH LIST PRICES MUST ACCOMPANY ALL BIDS SUBMITTED.

Bidder  (lnagen- TRz
Address | W8 o0ey s Py

Scookan ¥ 1920
(City/State/Zip)

Signaturc% L .

Telephone &~ 172- K00 Date )12
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