

TABULATION



ANNUAL BIDS - ROAD MACHINERY RENTAL # 1710-B

AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON JANUARY 10, 2023, AT 11:00 A.M.

FROM: JANUARY 31, 2023 TO: JANUARY 30, 2024 W/OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL.

BIDDER'S NAME AND ADDRESS	BIG D TRACTOR CO. LLC dba FRONTERA EQUIPMENT/BLUE CAT RENTALS 2300 E. EXPRESSWAY 83 DONNA, TX 78537 (956) 464-0123					NUECES POWER EQUIPMENT 1 INDUSTRIAL WAY, SAN BENITO, TX. 78586 (956) 245-6372				
	DESCRIPTION	WEEKLY	ADDITIONAL DAILY COST AFTER ONE WEEK-PR/DAY	MONTHLY	ADDITIONAL DAILY COST AFTER ONE MONTH-PR/DAY	RAINY DAY CREDIT	WEEKLY	ADDITIONAL DAILY COST AFTER ONE WEEK-PR/DAY	MONTHLY	ADDITIONAL DAILY COST AFTER ONE MONTH-PR/DAY
A. ROLLER Double Smooth Drum Vibratory 50-60" 4-6 Ton	\$2,600.00	\$ 466.66	\$ 5,400.00	\$ 466.66	N/A	\$ → 775.00	\$ → 250.00	\$ → 2,295.00	\$ → 250.00	N/A
B. MOTORGRADER 27,000 Op. Wt./Lb. 125 H.P. minimum	\$3,833.33	\$ 744.44	\$ 7,900.00	\$ 744.44	N/A	\$ → 2,250.00	\$ → 750.00	\$ → 6,750.00	\$ → 750.00	N/A
C. BACKHOE / LOADER, 23,800 Op. Wt./Lb. and 97H.P. minimum	\$3,200.00	\$ → 666.66	\$ → 7,200.00	\$ → 666.66	N/A	NO BID		NO BID		N/A
D. LOADER FRONT END, 31,800 Op. Wt./Lb. and 172 H.P. minimum	\$3,133.33	\$ 644.44	\$ 7,000.00	\$ 644.44	N/A	\$ → 2,950.00	\$ → 985.00	\$ → 8,850.00	\$ → 985.00	N/A
E. MILLING MACHINE Small, 4to5 ft. Drum, front loading conveyor	NO BID		NO BID		N/A	\$ → 7,825.00	\$ → 2,600.00	\$ → 23,500.00	\$ → 2,600.00	N/A
F. MILLING MACHINE Large, 6ft & 5inch to 7ft & 3 Inch drum	NO BID		NO BID		N/A	\$ → 9,675.00	\$ → 3,225.00	\$ → 29,000.00	\$ → 3,225.00	N/A
MISC % OFF LIST	15% DISCOUNT					0% DISCOUNT				

RECOMMENDATION →

3% MAX. ANNUAL PRICE INCREASE.

28 DAYS

I HEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED.

Ignacio Amezcua 1/25/23
IGNACIO AMEZCUA, PURCHASING AGENT DATE

Benjamin L. Worsham
BENJAMIN L. WORSHAM, P.E., P.T.O.E. - DIRECTOR OF TRANSPORTATION
Carlos A. Sanchez
CARLOS A. SANCHEZ, P.E. - COUNTY ROAD ENGINEER AND DIRECTOR

1/25/23
DATE
1-23-23
DATE

[Tabulation Road Machinery Rental 1710-B - Brakedown.xlsx](#)

**Award by Commissioners' Court
on 01/31/2023**