

## **TABULATION SHEET**

BID # 230202 - PURCHASE OF VEHICLES FOR CAMERON COUNTY DEPARTMENTS AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON FEBRUARY 22, 2023 AT  $\,$  3:00 P.M.

		SPIKE <b>S</b> FORD	BOSWELL ELLIFF FORD	BOGGUS TIPTON MOTORS LLC	GRAPEVINE DCJ, LLC	CHARLES CLARK CHEVROLET
PARTICIPATING VENDOR'S NAME & ADDRESS		805 E. EXPRESSWAY US HWY 83 MISSION, TX 78572 (956) 519-5521	1401 W. BUS, HWY 77 SAN BENITO, TX 78586 (956) 399-2468	2101 CENTRAL BLVD. BROWNSVILLE, TX 78520 (956) 546-2288	2601 WILLIAM TATE AVE. GRAPEVINE, TX 76051 (812) 410-7500	801 W. HWY BUSINESS McALLEN, TX 78501 (956) 686-5441
DESCRIPTION	QTY					
CATEGORY A  2022 OR NEW MODEL MID SIZE PICKUP TRUCK, CREW CAB, 4X4, WHITE COLOR.	1		2023 Ford F150, V6-2.7L Ecoboost, Crew Cab, 4WD, Short bed, White or any color.	2023 Ram 1500, V8, 4WD, Crew Cab, White Color, Short bed.	2023 Ram 1500, V6- 3.6L, Classic, Crew Cab, 4WD	2023 Chevrolet Colorado, 4WD, Crew Cab
		NO BID	\$51,380.00 each	\$39,000.00 each	\$43,055.00 each	\$37,720.00 each
DELIVERY TIME			90-120 DAYS	7/22/2023	150-210 DAYS	8/31/2023
CATEGORY B	11					
2022 OR NEW MODEL FULL SIZE, FORD F150 ONLY, PICKUP TRUCK, 4x4, CREW CAB, DARK BLUE COLOR		2023 Ford F150,V8-5.0L, Super Crew, 4WD, Regular bed, Dark Blue Color.	2023 Ford F150, V8-5.0L, Crew Cab, 4WD, Regular Bed, Blue Metallic.	2023 Ram 1500, V8, 4WD, Crew Cab, Blue Color	2023 Ram 1500,V6- 3.6L, Classic, Crew Cab, 4WD	NO BID
DELIVERY TIME		\$48,390.00 each TBD	\$52,480.00 each 90-120 DAYS	\$39,000.00 each 8/22/2023 N/R	\$43,995.00 each 150-210 DAYS N/R	NO BID NO BID
DELIVERY TIME  CATEGORY C	1	T TBD	1 90-120 DATS	0/22/2020 14/10	100 210 3/110 14/1	I INO DID
2022 OR NEW MODEL FULL SIZE, PICKUP TRUCK, 4x4, CREW CAB, WHITE COLOR (PREFERRED)		2023 Ford F150,V8-5.0L, Super Crew, 4WD, Regular bed, White Color.	2023 Ford F150, V8-5.0L, crew Cab, 4WD, Regular Bed, White Color.	2023 Ram 1500, V8, Crew Cab, 4WD, White color, Regular bed.	2023 Ram 1500, V6- 3.6L, Classic, Crew Cab, 4WD	2023 Chevrolet Silverado, 4wd, crew cab
	1	\$48,390.00 each	\$52,480.00 each	\$39,000.00 each	\$43,910.00 each	\$46,103.00 each
DELIVERY TIME		TBD	90-120 DAYS	8/22/2023	150-210 DAYS	8/31/2023
CATEGORY D	1			2023 Ram 2500, V8-		
2022 OR NEW MODEL NOT UNDER OR OVER 3/4 TON, PICKUP TRUCK, 14 FULL SIZE DOORS,4X4, SHORT BED, WHITE COLOR OR DARK BLUE		2023 Ford F250, V8-6.0L, Crew Cab, 4WD, Short bed, White or Dark Blue color.	2023 Ford F250, V8-7.3L Gas, Crew Cab, 4WD, Short bed, White or Blue color.	6.4L, Crew Cab, 4WD, White or Blue Color, Short Bed.		
DELIVERY TIME	1	\$51,980.00 TBD	\$59,705.00 120-160 DAYS	\$52,100.00 8/22/2023	NO BID	NO BID
CATEGORY E	1	155	120-100 BA10	0/22/2020		
022 OR NEW MODEL NOT UNDER OR OVER 3/4 TON, PICKUP TRUCK, 4 FULL SIZE DOORS,4X4, LONG BED, WHITE COLOR OR DARK BLUE	·	2023 Ford F250, V8-6.8L, Crew Cab, 4WD, Long Bed, White or Dark Blue color.	2023 Ford F250, V8-7.3L Gas, Crew Cab, 4WD, Long bed, White or Blue color.	2023 Ram 2500, V8- 6.4L, Crew Cab, 4WD, White or Blue Color, Long Bed	2023 Ram 2500, V8- 6.4L, Crew Cab, 4WD, White only	
	1	\$52,200.00	\$59,915.00	\$52,100.00	\$54,100.00	NO BID
DELIVERY TIME	1	TBD	1200-160 DAYS	8/22/2023	June 2023	I
CATEGORY F		2000 5 15050 100001 0	2000 54 5050 1/0 0 01 0	2000 D 2500 V/8 6 4		
2022 OR NEW MODEL ONE (1) TON, PICKUP TRUCK, 4 FULL SIZE DOORS,4X2, REGULAR BED, WHITE COLOR		2023 Ford F350, V8-6.8L, Crew Cab, 2WD, Regular bed, White color.	2023 Ford F350, V8-6.8L Gas, Crew Cab, 4WD,Regular bed, White Color,	2023 Ram 3500, V8-6.4, Crew Cab, 4WD, White color, Regular bed. \$53,850.00	NO BID	NO BID
DELIVERY TIME	7	\$49,989.00 TBD	\$51,820.00 120-160 DAYS	9/22/2023	NO BID	NO BID
CATEGORY G	1					
2022 OR NEW MODEL FULL SIZE SUV, 4X4, MUST SEAT A MINIMUM OF 8 ADULTS, WHITE COLOR		2023 Ford Expedition,V6-3.5L EcoBoost, 4WD, White color.	2023 Ford Expedition, 4WD, White Color.	2023 Jeep Wagoneer, V8-5.7, 4WD, White color.	2023 Jeep Wagoneer, V8-5.7L, 4WD, seat 8	2023 Chevy Tahoe LS 4WD
DELINIERY TIME	1	\$62,779.00	\$66,380.00 120-160 DAYS	\$67,000.00 8/22/2023	\$65,000.00 120-180 DAYS	\$54,420.00 8/31/2023
DELIVERY TIME  CATEGORY H	1	TBD	120-160 DAYS	6/22/2023	120-100 DATS	0/31/2023
2022 OR NEW MODEL , TRANSIT 150, MEDIUM CARGO VAN, DARK BLUE OR WHITE COLOR			2023 Ford Transit 150, 6 cyl., 3.5L, Gas, Cargo Van, Blue or White color.			
DELIVERY TIME		NO BID	\$47,425.00 120 DAYS	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
DELIVERY TIME  CATEGORY I	1		IZU DATO			
2022 OR NEW MODEL , TRANSIT 350, MEDIUM CARGO VAN, DARK BLUE OR WHITE COLOR	•		2023 Ford T350, V6-3.5L Gas, Cargo RWD, Van, Blue or White color.			
				NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
DELIVERY TIME		NO BID	\$51,435.00 120 DAYS			1
DELIVERY TIME CATEGORY J	1	NO BID	120 DAYS			
CATEGORY J	1	2023 Ford Edge SE,2.0L Ecoboost, AWD, Dark Blue or White color.	120 DAYS  2023 Ford Escape Active, 4 cyl- 1.5L, Gas, White color	2023 Jeep Compass, 4cyl, 4WD, 4door, White or Blue color.		2023 Chevrolet Traverse, seats 7
CATEGORY J  2022 OR NEW MODEL CROSSOVER (MEDIUM SIZE) SUV,2WD, MUST SEAT A MINIMUM OF 5 ADULTS, DARK BLUE OR WHITE COLOR	1	2023 Ford Edge SE,2.0L Ecoboost, AWD, Dark Blue or White color. \$39,440.00	120 DAYS  2023 Ford Escape Active, 4 cyl- 1.5L, Gas, White color \$30,840.00	4cyl, 4WD, 4door, White or Blue color. \$35,000.00	NO BID	Traverse, seats 7 \$35,970.00
CATEGORY J 2022 OR NEW MODEL CROSSOVER (MEDIUM SIZE) SUV,2WD, MUST SEAT A MINIMUM OF 5 ADULTS, DARK BLUE OR WHITE COLOR  DELIVERY TIME		2023 Ford Edge SE,2.0L Ecoboost, AWD, Dark Blue or White color.	120 DAYS  2023 Ford Escape Active, 4 cyl- 1.5L, Gas, White color	4cyl, 4WD, 4door, White or Blue color.		Traverse, seats 7
CATEGORY J  2022 OR NEW MODEL CROSSOVER (MEDIUM SIZE) SUV,2WD, MUST SEAT A MINIMUM OF 5 ADULTS, DARK BLUE OR WHITE COLOR	1	2023 Ford Edge SE.2.0L Ecoboost, AWD, Dark Blue or White color. \$39,440.00 2/18/2023	120 DAYS  2023 Ford Escape Active, 4 cyl- 1.5L, Gas, White color \$30,840.00 120 DAYS	4cyl, 4WD, 4door, White or Blue color. \$35,000.00 7/22/2023 2023 Dodge Durango, V8-5.7, (Destroyer Gray)	NO BID	Traverse, seats 7 \$35,970.00 8/31/2023
CATEGORY J  2022 OR NEW MODEL CROSSOVER (MEDIUM SIZE) SUV, 2WD, MUST SEAT A MINIMUM OF 5 ADULTS, DARK BLUE OR WHITE COLOR  DELIVERY TIME CATEGORY K  2022 OR NEW MODEL FULL SIZE SUV, PPV, 4X4, MUST SEAT A MINIMUM OF 5 ADULTS, GOLD CHAMPAGNE COLOR		2023 Ford Edge SE,2.0L Ecoboost, AWD, Dark Blue or White color. \$39,440.00	120 DAYS  2023 Ford Escape Active, 4 cyl- 1.5L, Gas, White color \$30,840.00	4cyl, 4WD, 4door, White or Blue color. \$35,000.00 7/22/2023 2023 Dodge Durango, V8-5.7, (Destroyer Gray) \$52,000.00 N/R	NO BID	Traverse, seats 7 \$35,970.00
CATEGORY J 2022 OR NEW MODEL CROSSOVER (MEDIUM SIZE) SUV,2WD, MUST SEAT A MINIMUM OF 5 ADULTS, DARK BLUE OR WHITE COLOR  DELIVERY TIME CATEGORY K 2022 OR NEW MODEL FULL SIZE SUV, PPV, 4X4, MUST SEAT A MINIMUM OF 5 ADULTS, GOLD CHAMPAGNE COLOR  DELIVERY TIME	1	2023 Ford Edge SE.2.0L Ecoboost, AWD, Dark Blue or White color. \$39,440.00 2/18/2023	120 DAYS  2023 Ford Escape Active, 4 cyl- 1.5L, Gas, White color \$30,840.00 120 DAYS	4cyl, 4WD, 4door, White or Blue color. \$35,000.00 7/22/2023 2023 Dodge Durango, V8-5.7, (Destroyer Gray)	NO BID	Traverse, seats 7 \$35,970.00 8/31/2023
CATEGORY J  2022 OR NEW MODEL CROSSOVER (MEDIUM SIZE) SUV,2WD, MUST SEAT A MINIMUM OF 5 ADULTS, DARK BLUE OR WHITE COLOR  DELIVERY TIME CATEGORY K  2022 OR NEW MODEL FULL SIZE SUV, PPV, 4X4, MUST SEAT A MINIMUM OF 5 ADULTS, GOLD CHAMPAGNE COLOR  DELIVERY TIME CATEGORY L		2023 Ford Edge SE.2.0L Ecoboost, AWD, Dark Blue or White color. \$39,440.00 2/18/2023	120 DAYS  2023 Ford Escape Active, 4 cyl- 1.5L, Gas, White color \$30,840.00 120 DAYS	4cyl, 4WD, 4door, White or Blue color. \$35,000.00 7/22/2023 2023 Dodge Durango, V8-5.7, (Destroyer Gray) \$52,000.00 N/R	NO BID	Traverse, seats 7 \$35,970.00 8/31/2023
CATEGORY J  2022 OR NEW MODEL CROSSOVER (MEDIUM SIZE) SUV,2WD, MUST SEAT A MINIMUM OF 5 ADULTS, DARK BLUE OR WHITE COLOR  DELIVERY TIME  CATEGORY K  2022 OR NEW MODEL FULL SIZE SUV, PPV, 4X4, MUST SEAT A MINIMUM OF 5 ADULTS, GOLD CHAMPAGNE COLOR  DELIVERY TIME	1	2023 Ford Edge SE.2.0L Ecoboost, AWD, Dark Blue or White color. \$39,440.00 2/18/2023	120 DAYS  2023 Ford Escape Active, 4 cyl- 1.5L, Gas, White color \$30,840.00 120 DAYS  NO BID	4cyl, 4WD, 4door, White ord Blue color. \$35,000.00 77,22/2023  2023 Dodge Durango, V8-5.7, (Destroyer Gray) \$52,000.00 N/R 9/22/2023  2023 Dodge Durango, V8-5.7, Black, Silver	NO BID  NO BID	Traverse, seats 7 \$35,970.00 8/31/2023  NO BID
CATEGORY J 2022 OR NEW MODEL CROSSOVER (MEDIUM SIZE) SUV,2WD, MUST SEAT A MINIMUM OF 5 ADULTS, DARK BLUE OR WHITE COLOR  DELIVERY TIME CATEGORY K 2022 OR NEW MODEL FULL SIZE SUV, PPV, 4X4, MUST SEAT A MINIMUM OF 5 ADULTS, GOLD CHAMPAGNE COLOR  DELIVERY TIME CATEGORY L 2022 OR NEW MODEL MID-SIZE SUV, PPV, 4X4, MUST SEAT A MINIMUM OF 5 ADULTS, BLACK, SILVER OR DARK BLUE COLOR	1	2023 Ford Edge SE.2.0L Ecoboost, AWD, Dark Blue or White color. \$39,440.00 2/18/2023	120 DAYS  2023 Ford Escape Active, 4 cyl- 1.5L, Gas, White color \$30,840.00 120 DAYS	4cyl, 4WD, 4door, White or Blue color. \$35,000.00 7/22/2023 2023 Dodge Durango, V8-5.7, (Destroyer Gray) \$52,000.00 N/R 9/22/2023 2023 Dodge Durango, V8-5.7, Black, Silver \$51,000.00	NO BID	Traverse, seats 7 \$35,970.00 8/31/2023
CATEGORY J  2022 OR NEW MODEL CROSSOVER (MEDIUM SIZE) SUV,2WD, MUST SEAT A MINIMUM OF 5 ADULTS, DARK BLUE OR WHITE COLOR  DELIVERY TIME CATEGORY K  2022 OR NEW MODEL FULL SIZE SUV, PPV, 4X4, MUST SEAT A MINIMUM OF 5 ADULTS, GOLD CHAMPAGNE COLOR  DELIVERY TIME CATEGORY L  2022 OR NEW MODEL MID-SIZE SUV, PPV, 4X4, MUST SEAT A	1	2023 Ford Edge SE.2.0L Ecoboost, AWD, Dark Blue or White color. \$39,440.00 2/18/2023	120 DAYS  2023 Ford Escape Active, 4 cyl- 1.5L, Gas, White color \$30,840.00 120 DAYS  NO BID	4cyl, 4WD, 4door, White ord Blue color. \$35,000.00 77,22/2023  2023 Dodge Durango, V8-5.7, (Destroyer Gray) \$52,000.00 N/R 9/22/2023  2023 Dodge Durango, V8-5.7, Black, Silver	NO BID  NO BID	Traverse, seats 7 \$35,970.00 8/31/2023  NO BID

I HEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED IGMICIO AMEZCUA, DURCHASING AGENT
LEE LOZANG CHICL AND CHANGE SUPERVISOR

8/21/23

Regular delivery as per each category

N/R - "Non Responsive"

Marwillo In Fig. Biologic

## **ALTERNATE BID**

BID # 230202 - PURCHASE OF VEHICLES FOR CAMERON COUNTY DEPARTMENTS AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON FEBRUARY 22, 2023 AT  $3:00\ P.M.$ 

			SPIKE <b>S</b> FORD
			805 E. EXPRESSWAY US HWY 83
PARTICIPATING VENDOR'S NAME & ADDRESS			MISSION, TX 78572
			(956) 519-5521
DESCRIPTION	COLOR	QTY	(930) 313-3321
CATEGORY A	OOLOIX	4.1	
2022 OR NEW MODEL MID SIZE PICKUP TRUCK, CREW CAB, 4X4,			
WHITE COLOR.			
2023 FORD RANGER, SUPERCREW, 4X4,XLT, TRIMMED SEATS	WHITE	1	\$44,280.00
2023 FOR RANGER, SUPERCREW, 4X4, XLT, PREMIUM CLOTH SEATS	WHITE	1	\$43,530.00
2023 FOR RANGER, SUPERCREW, 4X4, XLT, PREMIUM CLOTH SEATS  2023 FORD RANGER. SUPERCREW, 4X4, XLT, PREMIUM CLOTH SEATS	CACTUS GRAY	1	\$43,860.00
2023 FORD RANGER, SUPERCREW, 4A4, XL1, PREMIUM CLOTH SEATS  2023 FORD RANGER. SUPERCREW, 4X4, XL1, PREMIUM CLOTH SEATS	CACTOS GIVAT	1	\$42,325.00
2023 FORD RANGER, SUPERCREW, 4A4, XLT, PREMIUM CLOTH SEATS  2023 FORD RANGER, SUPERCREW, 4X2, XLT, PREMIUM CLOTH SEATS	CARB GRAY	1	\$38,415.00
DELIVERY TIME	CAILD GIVII	·	<b>\$33,113.33</b>
CATEGORY C		I	
2022 OR NEW MODEL FULL SIZE, PICKUP TRUCK, CREW CAB, WHITE			
COLOR (PREFERRED)			1
2023 FORD F150. SUPERCREW. 4X4, V6. BLACK SPORT CLOTH SEATS	HOT PEPER RED	1	\$51,380.00
2023 FORD F150, SUPERCREW, 4X4, V6, BLACK SPORT CLOTH SEATS	WHITE	1	\$51,380.00
2023 FORD F150, SUPERCREW, 4X4, V6, BLACK SPORT CLOTH SEATS  2023 FORD F150, SUPERCREW, 4X4, V6, BLACK SPORT CLOTH SEATS	SILVER METALLIC	1	\$51,380.00
2023 FORD F150, SUPERCREW, 4X4, V8, BLACK SPORT CLOTH SEATS	CARB GRAY MET	1	\$52,480.00
2023 FORD F150, SUPERCREW, 4X4, V6, BLACK SPORT CLOTH SEATS	SILVER METALLIC	1	\$51,480.00
2023 FORD F150, SUPERCREW, 4X4, V6, BLACK SPORT CLOTH SEATS	AVALANCHE	1	\$51,480.00
2023 FORD F150, SUPERCREW, 4X4, V6, BLACK SPORT CLOTH SEATS	AVALANCHE	1	\$51,380.00
2023 FORD F150, SUPERCREW, 4X4, V8, BLACK SPORT CLOTH SEATS	CARB GRAY MET	1	\$52,480.00
2023 FORD F150, SUPERCREW, 4X4, V8, BLACK SPORT CLOTH SEATS	ATLAS BLUE METALLIC	1	\$52,480.00
DELIVERY TIME	/ TE TO BEOL WILL ! / TELLO		
CATEGORY D			
2022 OR NEW MODEL NOT UNDER OR OVER 3/4 TON, PICKUP TRUCK,			
4 FULL SIZE DOORS,4X4, SHORT BED, WHITE COLOR OR DARK BLUE			
4 1 OLE 0122 BOOKO, 17(1), OHOKI BEB, WILL BOTOK GKE, II KK 1999			
2022 FORD F250, CREWCAB, V8-6.2L, 4X4, GRAY CLOTH SEATS	WHITE	1	\$52,560.00
2022 FORD F250, CREWCAB, V8-6.2L, 4X4, GRAY CLOTH SEATS	WHITE	1	\$52,560.00
2022 FORD F250, CREWCAB, V8-7.3L, 4X4, GRAY CLOTH SEATS	WHITE	1	\$56,720.00
2022 FORD F250, CREWCAB, V8-7.3L, 4X4, GRAY CLOTH SEATS	ICONIC SILVER	1	\$57,415.00
2022 FORD F250, CREWCAB, V8-6.7L DIESEL, 4X4, GRAY CLOTH SEATS	WHITE	1	\$65,965.00
2022 FORD F250, CREWCAB, V8-6.2L, 4X4, GRAY CLOTH SEATS	WHITE	1	\$52,560.00
2022 FORD F250, CREWCAB, V8-6.2L, 4X4, GRAY CLOTH SEATS	WHITE	1	\$52,560.00
2022 FORD F250, CREWCAB, V8-6.7L DIESEL, 4X4, GRAY VINYL SEATS	WHITE	1	\$64,835.00
DELIVERY TIME			
CATEGORY J			
2022 OR NEW MODEL CROSSOVER (MEDIUM SIZE) SUV, MUST SEAT			
A MINIMUM OF 5 ADULTS, DARK BLUE OR WHITE COLOR			
2023 FORD EDGE AWD, SE	DARK BLUE OR WHITE	1	\$39,440.00
2023 FORD EDGE , SE, AWD, 5 PASSENGERS, 2.0L, CLOTH SEATS	CARB GRAY	1	\$39,705.00
2022 FORD EDGE, SEL, AWD, 5 PASSENGERS, 2.0L	ICONIC SILVER	1	\$42,400.00
2022 FORD ESCAPE, SEL, FWD, 1.5L, ACTIVEX TRIM SEATS	BLUE SILVER METALIC	1	\$33,640.00
2022 FORD ESCAPE, SE, FWD, 1.5L, GRAY CLOTH SEATS	ICONIC SILVER	1	\$31,360.00
2022 FORD ESCAPE, S, FWD, 1.5L, GRAY CLOTH SEATS	CARB GRAY	1	\$29,365.00
2022 FORD ESCAPE, S, FWD, 1.5L, GRAY CLOTH SEATS	ATLAS BLUE METALLIC	1	\$28,770.00
2022 FORD ESCAPE, S, FWD, 1.5L, GRAY CLOTH SEATS	WHITE	1	\$28,770.00
2022 FORD ESCAPE, S, FWD, 1.5L, GRAY CLOTH SEATS	CARB GREY	1	\$28,770.00
2022 FORD ESCAPE, SE, FWD, 1.5L, GRAY CLOTH SEATS	ICONIC SILVER	1	\$32,495.00
2022 FORD ESCAPE SEL, FWD, 1.5L, ACTIVEX TRIM SEATS	CARB GRAY	1	\$32,645.00
DELIVERY TIME			
ADDENDUM:			YES
,			
SPECIFICATION CRITERIA:		l	L

RECOMMENDATION	<b></b>
HEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED:	3/21/23
IGNACIO AMEZQUA PURCHASING AGENT	525-2-7827
LEE LOZANS WEHICLE MAINTENANCE SUPERVISOR	DATE