DESCRIPTION/COST PAGE
OPEN MARKET PRICE INCRE ALLOWED

APPROX. ANNUAL QUANTITY

DES OF S: TOBEUSED
Total usage for combined chemicals 330 gallons & 55 Gallon /drum

1. 18% Resmethrin, 54% Piperonyl Butoxide - 5 gal/pail ~ Ex.: Scourge

2. 4% Resmethrin, 12% Piperonyl Butoxide — Ready to use 55 gal/ drum
Ex: Scourge - (Ready to use) 55 gal/drum

3. Oil- base Permethrin RTU, minimum 4% Permethrin, 8% Piperonyl Butoxide
Ex: Permanone 4-8 - (Ready to use) 55 gal drum

4. Oil-based pyrethroids - min. 1.5% Oil-based Permethrin, 7.5% Piperonyl Butoxide
Ex: Biomist - Ready to use (55 gal Drum)

5. Oil-based Permethrin RTU, minimum 4% Permethrin and 4% Piperonyl Butoxide
Ex: Prentox: Perma-X, Permanone, Kontrol, Omega Mist OSC - Ready to Use (55 gal) Drum

6. Qil-based Permethrin RTU, minimum 4% Permethrin and 4% Piperonyl Butoxide
Ex: Prentox: Perma-X, Permanone, Kontrol, Omega Mist OSC - Ready to Use - 2 X 2.5 gal/pail

7. Oil-based Permethrin RTU, minimum 4% Permethrin and 4% Piperony! Butoxide

PRICE

$_NOBID per/gal.
$_ NOBID per/gal.

$_ NOBID er/gal,

Biomist 1.5-7.5
$7421  per/gal.

Perm-X ULV 4-4
$ 2645 per/gal.

Perm-X ULV 4-4
$3145  per/gal

Perm-X ULV 4-4
$ 2290 per/gal.

Ex: Prentox: Perma-X, Permanone, Kontrol, Omega Mist OSC - Ready to Use - (275 gals) Mini Bulk

8. Oil-based Permethrin Concentrate, minimum 30% Permethrin, 30% Piperonyl Butoxide
Ex: Bio mist, Prentox: Perma x, Omega Mist Mac, Permanone, Kontrol - 5 gal/pail

9. Oil-based Permethrin Concentrate
Minimum 31% Permethrin, 66% Piperonyl Butoxide
Ex: Prentox: Perma- or Permanone or Kontrol - per/gal

10. 1.5 Ib/gal Chlorpyrifos, RTU -55 gal drum
Ex: Pyrofos 1.5 ULV or Mosquitomist 1.5

11. 1.5 Ib/gal Chlorpyrifos, RTU—2.5 gal drum  Ex: Pyrofos 1.5 ULV or Mosquitomist 1.5

12. Altosid Briquets (220 cnt.)— 150 days (Open Market Price Increases allowed)

13. Altosid Briquets (400 cnt.)— 30 days  (Open Market Price Increases allowed)

16. Altosid Pro G 1.5% Methoprene (24 pr/case) - 30 days (Open Market Price Increases allowed)
17. Altosid Pro G 1.5% Methoprene (12 per/case) - 30 days (Open Market Price Increases allowed)
16. Bactimos Briquets (100 pr/box) - 30 days

17. 6% Bacilus sphaericus, Bacillus thuringiensis 1% (200cnt) 45 day Briquets
Ex: Fourstar Briquets

18 . EPA Approved Diluents Oil for Mosquito Control

Ex: Envirotech 13T/BVA 13 or Supar 107 or Golden West or equivalent - 55 gal/drum
19. Aquabac (200G) Bacilus Thuringiensis 2.86%

BIDDER: _Clarke Mosguito Control Praducts, Inc.

Perm-X ULV 30-30
$ 9150  per/gal

Perm-X ULV 31-66
$ 139.00 per/gal.

Mosquito Mist 1.5
% 13900 per/gal.
$ NOBID per/gal.
$_g18.40 per/box
$ 52000  per/box.
$ 39180  perfcase
$ 19032  perfcase
Summit Bti briquets/dunks
$ 106.40 per/box.
Fourstar 45 Day Briquets
$ 32000  perlbox

Envirotech Qil
$ 2148  per/gal

$_NOBID  perbag

ADDRESS: §75 Sidwell Court

(City/State/Zip Code) PHONE#: 800-123-5727

SIGNATURE: DATE:_2Z]2¢22

BID # 2430 Mosquito Insecticide
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DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS:

Total usage for combined chemicals
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10.
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. Oil- base Permethrin RTU, minimum 4% Permethrin, 8% Piperonyl Butoxide

DESCRIPTION/COST PAGE

OPEN MARKET PRICE INCREASES ALLOWED

APPROX. ANNUAL QUANTITY
TO BE USED
330 gallons & 55 Gallon /drum
18% Resmethrin, 54% Piperonyl Butoxide - § gal/pail  Ex.: Scourge

4% Resmethrin, 12% Piperonyl Butoxide — Ready to use 55 gal/ drum
Ex; Scourge - (Ready to use) 55 gal/drum

Permanone RTU
Ex: Permanone 4-8 - (Ready to use) 55 gal drum

. Oil-based pyrethroids - min. 1.5% Oil-based Permethrin, 7.5% Piperonyl Butoxide

Ex: Biomist - Ready to use (55 gal Drum)

. Oil-based Permethrin RTU, minimum 4% Permethrin and 4% Piperonyl Butoxide Perm-X UL 44

Ex: Prentox: Perma-X, Permanone, Kontrol, Omega Mist OSC - Ready to Use (55 gal) Drum

PRICE

gNoBid perrgal.

¢ No Bid per/gal.

$ $40.52 per/gal.

$ No Bid per/gal.

s $26.84 per/gal.

Oil-based Permethrin RTU, minimum 4% Permethrin and 4% Piperonyl Butoxide Perm-XUL44 § $31.86 per/gal.

Ex: Prentox: Perma-X, Permanone, Kontrol, Omega Mist OSC - Ready to Use - 2 X 2.5 gal/pail

. Oil-based Permethrin RTU, minimum 4% Permethrin and 4% Piperony! Butoxide Perm-X UL44 $ $27.29 per/gal.

Ex: Prentox: Perna-X, Permanone, Kontrol, Omega Mist OSC - Ready to Use - (275 gals) Mini Bulk

Permanone 30-30

Qil-based Permethrin Concentrate, minimum 30% Permethrin, 30% Piperonyl Butoxide
Ex: Bio mist, Prentox: Perma x, Omega Mist Mac, Permanone, Kontrol - 5 gal/pail

Qil-based Permethrin Concentrate
Minimum 31% Permethrin, 66% Piperonyl Butoxide
Ex: Prentox: Perma- or Permanone or Kontrol - per/gal

1.5 Ib/gal Chlorpyrifos, RTU -55 gal drum
Ex: Pyrofos 1.5 ULV or Mosquitomist 1.5

1.5 Ib/gal Chlorpyrifos, RTU—2.5 gal drum  Ex: Pyrofos 1.5 ULV or Mosquitomist 1.5
Altosid Briquets (220 cnt.) — 150 days (Open Market Price Increases allowed)

Altosid Briquets (400 cnt.) — 30 days  (Open Market Price Increases allowed)

Altosid Pro G 1.5% Methoprene (24 pr/case) - 30 days (Open Market Price Increases allowed)
Altosid Pro G 1.5% Methoprene (12 per/case) - 30 days (Open Market Price Increases allowed)
Bactimos Briquets (100 pr/box) - 30 days Summit Bti Briquets

6% Bacilus sphaericus, Bacillus thuringiensis 1% (200cnt) 45 day Briquets
Ex: Fourstar Briquets Sumilarv WSP

. EPA Approved Diluents Oil for Mosquito Control ~ BVA-13
Ex: Envirotech 13T/BVA 13 or Supar 107 or Golden West or equivalent - 55 gal/drum
. Aquabac (200G) Bacilus Thuringiensis 2.86%  Summit BT| Granules

Permanone 31-66 ¢122.00  per/gal.

g $77.00 per/gal.

s No Bid per/gal.

s No Bid per/gal,
§81840 Lemex
$ 520.00  permox.
$194.88 ericase
$398.28 per/case
1021260 1 sermex.

$_6ﬂ_perfbox

$13.97 per/gal.
$ 7637 perfbag

BIDDER: Rentokil North America Inc., DBA Target Specially Products
ADDRESS: 1225 N. Post Qak Rd
(City/State/Zip Code)  Housjon, TX 77055 - PHONE#: 318-254-3330 David or 225-989-8307 Kirsti
SIGNATURE: &) DATE: 02/28723

BID # 2430 Mosquito Insecticide
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DESCRIPTION/COST PAGE

OPEN MARKET PRICE INCREASES ALLOWED

APPROX. ANNUAL QUANTITY

DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS: TO BE USED
Total usage for combined chemicals 330 gallons & 55 Gallon /drum
1. 18% Resmethrin, 54% Piperonyl Butoxide - 5 gal/pail ~ Ex.: Scourge

2.

10.

11.

12.

13.

16.

17.

16.

17.

18 .

19

4% Resmethrin, 12% Piperonyl Butoxide — Ready to use 55 gal/ drum
Ex: Scourge - (Ready to use) 55 gal/dram

. Oil- base Permethrin RTU, minimum 4% Permethrin, 8% Piperonyl Butoxide

Ex; Permanone 4-8 - (Ready to use) 55 gal drum

. Oil-based pyrethroids - min. 1.5% Qil-based Permethrin, 7.5% Piperonyl Butoxide

Ex:Bio mist - Ready to use (55 gal Drum)

. Oil-based Permethrin RTU. minimum 4% Permethrin and 4% Piperonyl Butoxide

Ex: Prentox: Perma-X, Permanone, Kontrol, Omega Mist OSC - Ready to Use (55 gal) Drum

Qil-based Permethrin RTU, minimum 4% Permethrin and 4% Piperonyl Butoxide
Ex: Prentox; Perma-X, Permanone, Kontrol, Omega Mist OSC - Ready to Use - 2 X 2.5 gal/pail

Oil-based Permethrin RTU, minimum 4% Permethrin and 4% Piperonyl Butoxide

PRICE
$ N R per/gal.
s NB  pergal

s NK  pergal

s NA rigal,

$ 62‘ ¢ 58' per/gal.
$ 0?'55 per/gal.

$ 071-58 per/gal.

Ex: Prentox: Perma-X, Permanone, Kontrol, Omega Mist OSC - Ready to Use - (275 gals) Mini Bulk

Qil-based Permethrin Concentrate, minimum 30% Permethrin, 30% Piperonyl Butoxide
Ex: Bio mist, Prentox: Perma x, Omega Mist Mac, Permanone, Kontrol - 5 gal/pail

Oil-based Permethrin Concentrate
Minimum 31% Permethrin, 66% Piperonyl Butoxide
Ex: Prentox: Perma- or Permanone or Kontrol - per/gal

1.5 1b/gal Chlorpyrifos, RTU -55 gal drum
Ex: Pyrofos 1.5 ULV or Mosquitomist 1.5

1.5 Ib/gal Chlorpyrifos, RTU - 2.5 gal dum  Ex: Pyrofos 1.5 ULV or Mosquitomist 1.5
Altosid Briquets (220 ¢nt.) — 150 days  (Open Market Price Increases allowed)

Altosid Briquets (400 cnt.) —30 days  (Open Market Price Increases allowed)

Altosid Pro G 1.5% Methoprene (24 pr/case) - 30 days (Open Market Price Increases allowed)
Altosid Pro G 1.5% Methoprene (12 per/case) - 30 days (Open Market Price Increases allowed)
Bactimos Briquets (100 pr/box) - 30 days

6% Bacilus sphaericus, Bacillus thuringiensis 1% (200cnt) 45 day Briquets
Ex: Fourstar Briquets

EPA Approved Diluents Oil for Mosquito Control
Ex: Envirotech 13T/BVA 13 or Supar 107 or Golden West or equivalent - 55 gal/drum
. Aquabac (200G) Bacilus Thuringiensis 2.86%

BIDDER: \/eam %

5. 80.00 pergal

s_1 3a, 24 perg

$_M_pcn‘gal.

s NH __per/gal,
s 3 0 perbos
$ 520.90 pertvox.

$ '3‘1.3Q perfease
s 413.64

$ 10 3-07 ‘, per/box.

r/case

$ Np perfbox

$ '|.3¥ per/gal.

3 ‘7;1, /fz per/bag

ADDRESS: HO0Z North resSway T3

F13- 203-04Y 3k

(City/State/Zip Code) W inge :@ PHONE# (]
SIGNATURE: DATE:
- M

ity < 2430 Mosquito Insecticide



