ANNUAL BID # 2430 - MOSQUITO INSECTICIDE
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON: MARCH 7TH, 2023 AT 3:00 P.M.

TABULATION

FROM: MARCH 29, 2023 TO: MARCH 28, 2024 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL.

VENDOR'S NAME CLARKE MOSQUITO ADAPCO Rentokli North America Inc,, DBA Target Spaclalty Products ES OPCO USA LLC DBA Veserls
& 675 SIDWELL CT. 100 COLONIAL CENTER , S#170 1225 N. POST OAK RD. 402 North Expressway 77
ADDRESS ST CHARLES. IL. 60174 LAKE MARY, FL. 32746 HOUSTON, TX. 77055 Harlingen, TX 78556
(800} 3235797 {407) 328-8519 {318} 354:3030 - | 2251355307 {7131 2030436
DESCRIPTION ) BRAND NAME UNIT PRICE BRAND NAME UNIT PRICE BRAND NAME UNIT FRICE BRAND NAME UNIT PRIGE
1.18% win, 54% Piperonyl - 5 gal/pail GAL
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2. 4% Resmethrin, 12% Piperonyl Buloxide, - (Ready lo use = RTU} 55 eatl
gal/drum NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3, Oil - base Permelhrin RTU, min 4% Permethrin, 8% Piperonyl AL —
|Buloxide - (55 gal Drum) NOQ BID NO BID Poemanong $40.52 NO BID
4, Oil-based Pyrelhroids - min, 1.5% Oil-based Permethrin, 7.5% =l Biomist 1.5-7.5 — -
Piperony! Butoxide - Ready to use (55 gal Drum) $74.21 NO BID NQ BID NO BID
5. Ol-based Permethrin RTU, min. 4% Permelhnn and 4% Piperonyl GAL Perm-X ULV 4-4 PermaSease 4-4
Butoxide - - Ready to Use (55 gal) Drum $26.45 {55g! drwm) $31.25 Perm-X UL 4-4 $26 84 $21.58
6. Of-based Permethrin RTU, min. 4% Permelhrin and 4% Piperonyl aad|l  Permx ULV a4 PermaSease 4-4 (2x2 —_—
Buloxide -ReadytoUse - 2X 2.5 galipail $31.45 55gl drum) $31.50 Perm-X UL 4-4 $31.86 $21.58
7. Ol-based Permethrin RTU, min. 4% Permelhrin and 4% Piperonyl oat | PormX ULV 44 e S 44 —
Buloxide - Ready lo Use - ( 275 gals) Mini Bulk $22.90 [275g! lote} $31.00 Perm-X UL 4-4 $27.29 $21.58
i-based o i 5 o PermaSease 3030 N
g'. O! P Pe'f;"emsnn TI i minz30% Permalhrin, 30% GAL | Perm-X ULV 30-30 2x2glcs 30gldr. J—
iperonly Butoxide - 5 galfpail $91.50 275 gl lole $90.00 Pormanang 30-30 $77.00 $80.00
. . PermaSease 3030
B. Oil-based Permethrin Concenlrate min. 31% Permethrin, 66% GAL | Perm-X ULV 31-66 2x2 gl cs 30 gl dr, b
Piperonyl Buloxide - per/gal $139.00 275 gl lote $165.00 Parmanone 31-66 $122.00 $132.24
10. Chiorpyrifos 1.5 |b/igal RTU - 56 gal drum GAL | Mosqullo Mist 1.5 > $139.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
11. Chlorpyrifos 1.5 Ibigal RTU - 2.5 gal drum [GAL] NOBID NQ BID NO BID NO BID
12. Allosid Briquets (220 cnt.)— 150 days {Open Market Price - —_— —_— —
Increases allowed) $818.40 NO BID $818.40 $B18 40
13, Altosid Briquets (400 cnt)—30days (Open Market Price ax —_— —_— _—
|Increases allowed) $520.00 NO BID $520.00 $520.00
14. Alloside Pro G 1.5% Melhoprene (24 pr cs} xx days (Open cs —
Market Price Increase aliowed) $391.80 NO BID $194.88 $189.36
15. Altoside Pro G 1.5% Melhoprene (12 pr cs) - xx days {Open . —_—
Marhet Price Increase allowed) $190.32 NO BID $398.28 $413.64
= Summit By —
16. Baclimos Briguets {100 pribox) - 30 days briquetaidusks $106.40 NO BID Summil Bl Bnguels $102.25 $103.24
17. Bri - 6% Bacilus icus, 1% Bacillus thuringiensis (200 ex Fourstar 45 day
cnt) - 45 day Driguets $320.00 $1,400.00 Sumiary WSP $646.10 NO BID
18. EPA A i il i ilo Control - 55 galld GAL Ervirolech O Vetbac GIGS
pproved Diluent Oil for Mosquile Cantrol galidrum ativro! $21.48 PR $18.21 A1 $13.97 §11.87
—
; o o
19. Aquabac (200G) Bacilus Thuringeiensis 2,86% BAG NO BID $115.00 . i 57637 §75.14
“1 - LOCAL VENDOR DOptional
BuyBoard §11-20 Buy Board §23-20
RECOMMENDATION —_— BuyBeoard pricing higher than
this bid pricing
alia]ion

Awarded by Commissioners' Court
on 03/28/2023
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