Renewed to 05/03/2024

TABULATION

ANNUAL. BIDS # 2540 - ROAD EMULSION OILS
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON JANUARY 26, 2021 AT 11:00 A.M.
FROM: MAY 3, 2021 : TO: MAY 3, 2022 W/ TWO RENEWAL OPTION FOR ONE ADDITICNAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL.

OPEN MARKET (COST ONLY) PRICE INCREASES ALLOWED
SECONDARY PRINMARY

VENDOR'S NAME ERGON ASPHALT MARTIN ASPHALT CLEVELAND ASPHALT P SQUARED EMULSION PLANTS |
& 11612 RM 2244, BLDG. 1 S#250 3 RIVERWAY, S# 400 P O BOX 1440, 516 SOUTH McLENNAN LOOP, |
AD_DBESS AUSTIN, TX 78738 HOUSTON TX. 77056 SHEPHCRD, TX 77371 ELM MOTT, TX 76640
OESCRIPTION (612) 489-9252 (Fi3)3s0e85z | 1800) 3140177 (264} 829-0330 !
PRIGE PERIGAL. L PRICE PLIVGAL PiCE SEAGAL PRICE PER/GAL.
o |POLYMER - MODIFIED ASPHALT CEMENT Update -Fﬁwl Updated Pricing
* 120,000 ga! - SoioX sy b 05[1_0}2022 i 05/03[2022 o .
AC-10 Not Available -— § 263 _— $—63$3.31 NO BID - NO BID
|EMULSIFIED ASPHALT HFRS-2 — $ 241 $3.31 — NOBID __NOBID NO BID
0 |MEDIUM CURING CUTBACK ASPHALT (30.000 apgrox_priyr)
MC-30 NO BID NO BID T § 384 NO BID "1
ANIONIC EMULSICN TYPE AE-P — § 2918371 — % $ 3.81 § 229 NQ BID *1
- RAPID - CURING CUTBACK ASPHALT EMULSIFIED ASPHALT 5S+1
{80,000 gal - approx priyr) — $ 231 %281 - $—2:333 2.86 $ 224 ) NO BID 2
DELIVERY { DAYS 24 hrs ARO 48 hrs ARO \ 24 hrs ARO 24 hrs ARO
[INIMUM ORDER QTY. TO AVOID DELIVERY CHARGES - GALS 5.500 5,500 | 2 5.000 ‘4
PUMP & HOSE CHARGE. - PER LOAD $90.00 o smo0 | 50.00 $80.00
DROP & DIVERSION CHARGE - PER LOAD £200.00 ‘[ $0.00 : $2,145.00 "3
DEMURRAGE CHARGE AFTER - 2 FREE HOURS - $90.00 | $70.00 $380.00 580 00 _:
LAYOVER CHARGE PER NIGHT $800.00 | £100.00 ! $0.00 "4 ]
3 1
FEDERAL ENVIRONMENTAL FEES: I B {
Asphalt & Polymer loads  (PRITON) $0.48770 ]_ $0.49770 50.49770 £0.49770 '
| Jemusiontoads (priGAL s00015 | ~ $0.0015 500015 $0.0015 L
RECOMMENDATION BY COUNTY ENGINEER: — *1 ALT: P2 PRIME CONCENTRATE - 2.04 PER / GAL.
“2 ALT: P2 51~ 269 PER/ GAL.
GERTIFY THE ABOVE TO 8E THE CORRECT BIOS RECEIVED: ~1 ALSO BID ALTERNATE - RC 250 - $3.29 PRIGAL.
*4 PLUSH CHARGE (TRUCKING) $8D PR/HR
g-[f[2) DELIVERY OVER 250 MILES - ADDITIONAL CHARGES

x RETURN LOADS (TRUCKING} SUBJECT TO CHARGE FROM DELIVERY FRE(GHT LINE,

- Awarded by Commissioners' Court
on 03/02/2021



