



TABULATION

ROAD MACHINERY, FARM IMPLEMENT, H/D TRUCK O.E.M. PARTS - ANNUAL BID # 2507

AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON March 28, 2023 AT 3:00 P.M..

FROM: AWARD DATE TO: APRIL 30, 2024 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR (ONE) ADDITIONAL YEAR W/ EACH RENEWAL.

VENDOR ADDRESS	DOGGET FREIGHTLINER 3799 INTERNATIONAL BLVD. BROWNSVILLE, TX 78521 956-504-2065	H & V EQUIPMENT SERVICES, INC. 5627 E. HWY 281 PROGRESO, TX 78579 956-565-3788	TELLUS EQUIPMENT SOLUTIONS 3555 W. ALTON GLOOR BLVD. BROWNSVILLE, TX 78521 956-350-9865	NUECES POWER EQUIPMENT 1 INDUSTRIAL WAY SAN BENITO, TX 78586 956-361-0066
DESCRIPTION	TOTAL PRICE - PR/YR DISCOUNT	TOTAL PRICE - PR/YR DISCOUNT	TOTAL PRICE - PR/YR DISCOUNT	TOTAL PRICE - PR/YR DISCOUNT
GROUP				
1. JOHN DEERE - Farm Implement	(2 TO 6) → \$9,878.33 37.60%	NO BID	C → \$11,377.78 0%	NO BID
2. JOHN DEERE - Road Machinery	NO BID	NO BID	(3 TO 8) → \$4,878.01 0%	NO BID
3. CATERPILLAR - Road Machinery	C → \$12,116.99 34.50%	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
4. CASE-VOGEL-ETNYRE - Road Machinery	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
5. BOMAG-HYPAC-BLAU-KNOX - Road Machinery	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	C → \$6,681.04 5%
6. SAMURAI (BOOM MOWER), DOOSAN (LOADER), MODERN (SHREDDERS) - Road Machinery	NO BID	C → \$38,933.62 5%	(5,6) \$7,744.50 0%	NO BID <i>Rg</i>
7. DOGGETT FREIGHTLINER TRUCKS	C → \$9,612.62 32.50%	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
8. CATERPILLAR TRUCKS & MOTORS	C → \$10,185.22 34.5	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
ARBITRARY ORDER GRAND TOTAL	\$41,793.16	\$38,933.62	\$24,000.29	\$6,681.04

RECOMMENDATION →
ALSO RECOMMEND REBIDDING SECTION 2 & 6

"C" = COMPLETE LINE ITEMS

I HEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED:

Ignacio Amezcua
IGNACIO AMEZCUA, PURCHASING AGENT

4/3/2023
DATE

[Signature]
LEE LOZANO - FLEET MAINTENANCE DEPT.

4/5-2023
DATE

**Awarded by Commissioners' Court
on 04/11/2023**