ANNUAL BID # 1452A7 - HURRICANE (PRE-POSITIONED) AERIAL SPRAYING (MOSQUITO CONTROL)

AS PER RECE!VED ON JUNE 30, 2022 AT 11:00 A.M.
EROM: AWARD DATE TO: JULY 14, 2023 W/OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE - EACH RENEWAL ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR.

TABULATION

Renewed to 07/14/2024

Contract 2023C06015

VENDOR'S NAME SUN VALLEY DUSTING CO. VECTOR DISEASE CONTROL INTL. | CLARKE ENVIRO. MOSQUITO MGMT.
& 28125 NORMA LINDA RD., 4320 BROOKWOOD DR., S # H 675 SIDWELL CT,,
ADDRESS SAN BENITO, TX. 78586 LITTLE ROCK, AR. 72202 SAINT CHARLES, IL 60174
DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED QTY. (956) 399-5323 (866) 920-4246 {630) 894-2000
ACERAGE RANGE OF SPRAYING ACRES UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
FYFANON FYFANON FYFANON
10,000 TO 19,000 19,098 $2.00 $39,998.00 $1.80 $35.998.20 NO BID NO BID
20,000 TO 49,999 49,999 $2.00 $089,998.00 $102 $95,998.08 NO BID NO BID
50,000 TO 79,998 79,999 $2.00 $159,998.00 $2.04 $163,197 96 NO BID NO BID
80,000 TO 100,000 100,000 $2.00 $200,000.00 "$2.10 $210,000.00 NO BID NO BID
—T> $499,994.00 ) $505,194.24 NO BID
DIBROM .75 ANVIL 10+10 —
[RECOMMENDATION <o $2.34 $46,797.66 $3.09 $61,796.91
$2.34 $116,997.66 $2.54 $126,997.46
1 HERERS CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORBCT DS RECEIVED: $2.34 $187,197.66 $2.36 $188,797.64
ﬁ; { > 77, $2.34 $234,000.00 $2.16 $216,000,00
TLE o ARSI AsenT DATE $584,992 98 $593,582.01
/ DIBROM 66 DUET HD
7L $2.34 $46,797 66 $3.14 $62,796.86
s 10 - g . ¢ e T BIEATT $2 34 $716,097 66 $2.57 $128,407.43
~ - ' §2.34 $187,197.66 $2.37 $189,597.63
Al PAALIN M il : $2.34 $234,000.00 $2.16 $216,000.00
REMERALDA GILAJARIND -/ oA v OR PLERL HEA DATE $584,992,98 $506,891 92
DIBROM .50 MERUS 3.0
o 2 $2.34 $46,797 66 $3.78 $75,596.22
OUARDS ENVIRONMENTA DATE $2.34 $116,097 66 $3.21 $160,496.79
$2.34 $1B7,197 66 $3,01 $240,796.99
’ $2.34 $234,000.00 $2.80 $280,000.00
$584,992.98 $756,890.00

ST ewd ROAD E

Awarded by Commissioners' Court

on 07/19/2022
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