

## **TABULATION**

VENDING MACHINE SERVICES - ANNUAL BID # 1955
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON: OCTOBER 31, 2023 AT 3:00 P.M.

FROM: DECEMBER 1ST, 2023 TO: DECEMBER 31, 2026 W/OPTION TO RENEW ONCE FOR TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS

	EL VALLE CANTEEN (FORMERLY, CENTRAL VENDING SERVICES) 401 B. JAMES RICHARD CLOSNER DR. LA FERIA, TX. 78559 (956) 264-0524	STX SNACK TIME VENDING 2801 MID VALLEY DR., WESLACO, TX. 78596 (956) 520-8028	COCA-COLA SOUTHWEST BEVERAGES 2400 W. EXPRESWAY 83 McALLEN, TX. 78501 (956) 374-5481
DESCRIPTION	COMMISSIONS RATE (PAID MONTHLY) % OF SALES	COMMISSIONS RATE (PAID MONTHLY) % OF SALES	COMMISSIONS RATE (PAID MONTHLY) % OF SALES
CATEGORY A - OPTION 1 BY LOCATION	CALEG	ONEED	J. 3. 3. 3.
	050/	15% - 21%	10% - 15%
Beverages: soft drinks, water, juices, health drinks	25%		
Snacks	25%	15% - 16%	NO BID
CATEGORY A - OPTION 2 TO 4			
For all beverage machines County wide	25%	NO BID	NO BID
For all snack machines County wide	25%	NO BID	NO BID
For all beverage and snack machines County wide	25%	NO BID	NO BID
CATEGORY A - OPTION 5 BY CITY			
BROWNSVILLE - Beverage only - snack only - both combined	25% both combined	NO BID	NO BID
LOS IND!OS - Beverage only - snack only - both combined	25% both combined	NO BID	NO BID
OLMITO - Beverage only - snack only - both combined	25% both combined	NO BID	NO BID
SOUTH PADRE ISLAND - Beverage only - snack only - both combined	25% both combined	NO BID	NO BID
SAN BENITO - Beverage only - snack only - both combined	25% both combined	NO BID	NO BID
HARLINGEN - Beverage only - snack only - both combined	25% both combined	NO BID	NO BID
BEVERAGES (SODAS) 20 OZ	\$2.25	\$2.10 1st year - \$2.50 3rd year	\$2.50 1st year \$2.75 3rd year
BEVERAGES (SODAS) 12 OZ	\$1.25	\$1.85 16.9oz. 1st year - \$2.25 3rd year	NO BID
BEVERAGES (ENERGY DRINKS)	\$3.25 16oz.	\$2.60 to \$3.60 1st year - \$3.15 to \$4.40 3rd year	\$3.50 1st year \$3.75 3rd year
BEVERAGES (ISOTONICS - POWERAIDE)	\$2,75 20 oz.	\$2.25 1st year - \$2.75 3rd year	\$2.50 1st year \$2.75 3rd year
BEVERAGES (JUICES)	\$2.75 12oz.	\$2.25 1st year - \$2.75 3rd year	\$2.50 1st year \$2.75 3rd year
BEVERAGES (WATER)	\$2.25 20oz.	\$2.25 1st year - \$2.75 3rd year	\$2.50 1st year \$2.75 3rd year
BEVERAGES (COLD COFFEE)	\$3.25 12OZ	\$3.30 to \$4.00 - 1st year - \$4.00 to \$4.85 3rd year	NO BID
CHIPS	\$1.50 1.5oz to 2oz	\$1.50 to \$3.00 - 1st year \$1.80 to \$3.60 3rd year	NO BID
PASTRY	\$2.00 2oz. up to 5oz.	\$1.75 to \$2.50 - 1st year \$2.15 to 3.00 3rd year	NO BID
COOKIES, CRACKERS & NUTS / BARS	\$1.15 1oz. to 1.7oz.	\$1.50 to \$1.80 - 1st year \$1.80 to \$2.20 3rd year	NO BID
CANDY	\$2.25 1.45oz to 2oz.	\$1.80 - \$3.25 - 1st year \$2.20 to \$4.00 3rd year	NO BID

RECOMMENDATION

I HEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOME TO BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED

ROBERTO C. LUNA / INT. PURCHASING AGENT / DAT

PEDRO HINOJOSA DATE

Awarded by Commissioners' Court on 11/21/2023