TABULATION

TIRES: AUTOMOTIVE, POLICE PATROL, OFFROAD & HEAVY DUTY - ANNUAL BID #1997

AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON AUGUST 22,2023 AT 3:00 P.M.
FROM: DECEMBER 16, 2023 TO: DECEMBER 15, 2024 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE - (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR EACH RENEWAL.

THE GOODYEAR TIRE & RUBBER

VENDOR'S NAME FIRESTONE T&W TIRE COMPANY SOUTHERN TIRE MART LLC
& 1054 FM 802, 3302 SPUR, 6501 N. EXPRESSWAY 281, U-E 800 HWY. 98,
ADDRESS BROWNSVILLE, TX. 78521 HARLINGEN, TX. 78552 EDINBURG, TX. 78542 COLUMBIA, MS. 39429
DESCRIPTION (956) 541-5556 (956) 412-0690 (956) 316-4722 (877) 786-4681
Javier Torres Filiberto Alvarado Chris Campbell Richard Conwill
TOTAL PRICE PR/YR TOTAL PRICE PR/YR TOTAL PRICE PR/YR TOTAL PRICE PR/YR
CAT A VEHICLE (CAR & TRUCK) (pg 11 of 37) $36,495.94 $35,631.46 $43,608.48 #7no-bid $30,781.47
CAT A VEHICLE (CAR & TRUCK) (pg 12 of 37) $11,105.39 $12,696.39 $52,332.21 #12 & #13 no-bid $10,014.66
CAT B (PERSUIT PATROL) (pg 15 of 37) $89,326.00 $101,888.00 $104,492.00 $98,910.00
CAT C OFF ROAD (IE: TRACTOR, GRADER, BACKHOE, TRUCK H/D (pg 15) $320,717.04 $307,694.64 $473,434.92 3, #6 & #8 no-bid $239,869.36 #11 no-bid
TOTAL PRICE: $457,644.37 $457,910.49 $673,867.61 —>  $379,575.49
A. MISC. TIRES % OFF LIST PRICE 10% 20% various by type 0%
B. MISC. TIRES % OFF LIST PRICE 10% 20% various by type 0%
C. MISC. TIRES % OFF LIST PRICE 10% 15% various by type 0%
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TABULATION

TIRES: AUTOMOTIVE, POLICE PATROL, OFFROAD & HEAVY DUTY - ANNUAL BID #1997
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON AUGUST 22, 2023 AT 3:00 P.M.
FROM: DECEMBER 16, 2023 TO: DECEMBER 15, 2024 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE - (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR EACH RENEWAL.

SYLVIA G. PEREZ DBA JAIME'S TIRE
MALVEAUX SERVICES LLC HESSELBEIN TIRE SOUTHWEST
VENDOR'S NAME SHOP
& 14410 LUTHE RD. STE 103 4823 CORNER PARKWAY 3775 INTERNATIONAL BLVD.
ADDRESS HOUSTON, TX 77039 SAN ANTONIO, TX 78219 BROWNSVILLE, TX 78521
DESCRIPTION (346)269-2833 (210) 646-8448/EXT 111 (956) 546-0556
CHARLES MALVEAUX DAVID J. DOMINGUEZ DAISY GARCIA
TOTAL PRICE PR/YR TOTAL PRICE PR/YR TOTAL PRICE PR/YR
CAT A VEHICLE (CAR & TRUCK) (pg 11 of 37) $33,662.00 $45,726.95 $44,236.71
CAT A VEHICLE (CAR & TRUCK) (pg 12 of 37) $11,632.74 $12,568.18 $14,915.60
CAT B (PERSUIT PATROL) (pg 15 of 37) $121,600.00 $98,910.00 $98,910.00
CAT C OFF ROAD (IE: TRACTOR, GRADER, BACKHOE, TRUCK H/D (pg 15) $260,984.88 $312,925.68 #11 no-bid $332,595.84
TOTAL PRICE: $427,879.62 $470,130.81 $490,658.15
A. MISC. TIRES % OFF LIST PRICE 5% 0% 10%
B. MISC. TIRES % OFF LIST PRICE 5% 0% 10%
C. MISC. TIRES % OFF LIST PRICE 5% 0% 10%
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