TABULATION SHEET

CALDWELL COUNTRY
BID # 231002 - PURCHASE OF VEHICLES FOR CAMERON COUNTY DEPARTMENTS SUSTEE [LEET GROUP SILSBEE FLEET GROUP CHEVROLET GRAPVINE DL, L1C SPIKES FORD
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON October 31, 2023 AT 3:00 P.M. 1211 USHWY 96 N 1211 USHWY 96N PO BOX 27 2601 WILLIAM D, TATE 805 E, EXPRESSWAY US HWY 83
SILSBEE, TEXAS 77656 SILSBEE, TEXAS 77656 CALDWELL, TX 77836 GRAPEVINE, TX 76051 MISSION, TEXAS 78572

VEHICLE DESCRIPTION: DEPARTMENT ary  COLoR ADG-655-3831 A0%-553-3131 579-5671500 #17-3107500 956-5195521

CATEGORY A 2013 Toyois Tacoma 2023 Toyota Tacoms 2024 Chewiclel Colorado NOBID 024 FORD RANGER
2023 or Newer, MID-Slze, Crew Cab (4 daars), 2WD Plckup Truck Informatlon Technology 1 White NOBID $37,843.75 $33,705.00 NOBID $34,828.00
073 of Newer, MID-Sae, Crew Cab, IWD Fekup Trodk witommercial Bed Camoes information Technotogy 1 White NOBID NOBIO 536,231.00 NO B 540.175.00
2023 of Hewer, MIDSue, Cab (2 dogra), IWD Pickus Tratk Munterandie £ 0o i White NO MO $31A00.75 NOBID HOBD NO BID
2023 or Newer, MIT-Sie, Crew Cab {4 doon), AWD {448] Plekun Truck Altesnate Big/ntiscelaneoiun 1 White 537,843 75 Mo 80 537,005.00 NO BT 438 350.00
DELIVERY up to 365 days TED

CATEGORY B NOBID 2024 Toyola Tundra 2024 Chevralet Sliverado 2023 RAM 1500 CLASSIC 2024 FORD F150
2023 or Newer,FULL-SIze, 1/2 Ton, Single Cab (2 doors), 2WD, Long Bed, Plckup Truck V6 Malntenance & Ops. ] White NOBID NO BID $40,340,00 NOBID $38,500,00
2023 or Newer,FULL-Slze, 1/2 Tan, Single Cab (2 doors), 2ZWD, Long Bed, Pickup Truck V6 Malntenance & Ops 2 White NO BID NOBID $80,680.00 NOBID 577,000,00
2023 or Newer,FULL-Slze, 1/2 Tan, Single Cab {2 doors}, ZWD, Lang Bed, Pickup Truck v8 Malntenance & Ops H White NOBID NOBID $43,285.00 NO BID 539,867.00
2023 or Ngwer, FULL-Slie, 172 Ton, Single Cab (2 doors). IWD. Long Bed, Pichus Trock VB Malntenancs & Cps 2 White NO BT HOBID 5E4,5T0.00 NOBID 579,734.00
3023 or Newer FULL-Hte, 1/2 Ton, Crew Cab (4 doors), 4WD{ded), Regular Bed, Pickup Truck V6 HealthfEmdronmental 1 ‘White or Navy Slue NOBID NOBID 54918500 NOBID $49.00500
2023 or Newer,FULL-S1ze, 1/2 Tan, Crew Cab {4 doors), 4WD[4x4}, Regular Bed, Plckup Truck V6 Heallh/Environmental 3 White or Navy Blue NOBID NOBID §147,555.00 NOBID $147,075 00
2023 or Newer,FULL-Slze, 1/2 Ton, Crew Cab {4 doors), 4WD{4xd), Regular Bed, Plckup Truck V8 Health/Environmental 1 White ar Navy Blue NOBID NG BID 452,525.00 NOBID $50,395.00
2023 of Mewer FULL-Site, 112 Ton, Crew Cab (4 doon) 4WD{4), Ry Bed, Pishup Trutk VB Healthff e ghmental 3 Winite o0 Navy Blue NOBID O D 515757500 xOoBD 515316500
2023 or Newer FULL-Slze. 172 Ton, Crew Cab (& dooey), AWD{Sad), Long Bed, Piclup Truck v6 PWPCT1, 2284 1 White nr Navy Blue NO BID NOBID 4945500 NOBD 55191000
2023 or Newer,FULL-Slze, 1/2 Ton, Crew Cab {4 doors), 4WD{4x4), Lang Bed, Pickup Truck V& PWPCT1,2,3&4 4 White or Navy Blue NOBID NOBID $157,940.00 NOBID $207,640.00
2023 or Newer,FULL-Slze, 1/2 Ton, Crew Cab (4 doors), AWD{4x4), Long Bed, Pickup Truck Va8 PWPCT1,2,3&4 1 White or Navy Blue NOEBID NOBID $52,825.00 NOBID $50,835,00
023 or Newer FULL-Site, 172 Ton, Crew Cab (4 0oori] &WD[4sl. L Bed, Pr Trutk V8 PWPCTL S 384 L] While of Nivy Blue NO D O BT $211,300.00 WO BD M
2003 &1 tower, FULL-Sine, 1/2 Ton, Crew Cab {4 doors), 4WD|dsi). Long Bed, Pickip Trudh Ve Cormminien Pct), 2.3 64 1 White or Navy Blue NORID NOBID 44984500 NOBID $45,000.00
2023 or Newer,FULL-Slze, 1/2 Ton, Crew Cab {4 daors), 4WD(4x4), Long Bed, Plckup Truck V& Commisslon Pct1,2,3 &4 a While ar Navy Blue NO@8ID NOBID $199,380,00 NOBID $196,000 00
2023 or Newer FULL-Slze, 1/2 Ton, Crew Cab (4 daars}, AWD[dx4), Long Bed, Pickup Truck V8 CommlissionPct1,2,384 1 White or Navy Blue NO BID NOBID $52,825.00 NO BID $46,515,00
2023 of Newer JULL-Site, 172 Tom, Crew Cab (4 doon ) AWD{4 Bed, Pebugp Truck V8 Commhvon®et ). 7. 364 4 White or Navy Blue HOBD KO BID 5211,300.00 KO&n 2]5&“
2023 & Newer, JULL-Ste, 1/2 Ton, Single Cab [2 docesl 2WD, Long Bed, Fickup Trock Vé Miscallarous Depts, 1 Whsie or Novy Blue HOBIO NOBID 540, 250000 NOBID S30.90000
2023 or Newer,FULL-Slte, 1/2 Ton, Single Cab {2 doors), 4WD(4xa), Long Bed, Pickup Truck V6 Misceilanous Depls. 1 White or Navy Blue NOBID NOBID $44,34000 NOBID $43,515.00
2023 of Newer,FULL-Slze, 1/2 Ton, Single Cab {2 doors), 2WD, Lang Bed, Pickup Truck va Misceltanous Depls. 1 White or Navy Blue NOBID NOBID $43,285.00 NOBID $39,867.00
2023 or Newer, FULL-Slze, 1/2 Tan, Single Cab (2 doors}, 4WD{4x4), Long Bed, Pickup Truck VB Miscellanous Depts, 3 While or Navy Blue NOBID NOEBID $47,885.00 NOBID $44,R85.00
2023 or Nawer,FULL-Slze, 1/2 Tan, Crew Cab (4 doors), 2WD,Regular Bed, Pickup Truck V& Miscellanous Depls. 1 White or Navy Blue NO®ID 445,092 50 $47,815,00 NOEBID $45,145 00
2023 or Newer,FULL-Slze, 1/2 Ton, Crew Cab (4 doors), 4WD{dx4), Regular Bed, Plckup Truck V6 Miscellanous Depts. 3 White or Navy Blue NO BID $46,992,50 $49,185 00 NOBID $49,000,00
2023 of Newer,FULL-Sze, 1/2 Ton, Crew Cab (4 doors), 2WD,Regular Bed, Pickup Truck v8 Miscellanaus Depts 1 White or Navy Blua NOBID NOBID $50,419.00 NOBID 446,515 00
2023 or Newer,FULL-Slze, 1/2 Ton, Crew Cab (4 doors}, 4WD{4x4), Regular Bed, Plckup Truck VB Miscellanous Depts 1 White or Navy Blue NO BID NOBID $52,525.00 NOBID $50,395.00
2023 or Newer,FULL-Sze, 1/2 Ton, Crew Cab {4 doors), 2WD.Long Bed, Plckup Teuck V6 Mlacellanous Depts, ] White or Navy Blue NOBID NOBID $47,843.00 NOBID NO BID
2023 or Newer,FULL-Slze, 1/2 Tan, Crew Cab (4 doors), 4WD{4x4), Long Bed, Pickup Truck V& Miscellanous Depts 1 White or Navy Blue NOBID NOBID $45,845.00 NOBID $51,910,00
2023 or Newer,FULL-Slz¢, 1/2 Ton, Crew Cab {4 doors), 2WD,Long Bed, Pickup Truck VB Misceltanous Depts, 1 White or Navy Blue NOBID NOEBID $50,843 00 NOBID NOBID
2023 or Newed FUiL-Sie, 1/2 Ton Crew Cab (4 doon | AWD{14), Long Bed, Fickup Truck VB Bnceilinoys Depli. 1 White or Navy Blue NO DD NOBID $52.925.00 NO WG $30.,835 00
DELIVERY up to 355 days T80

2024 Chevrolet Siverado

CATEGDRY C 2024 Chevralet Sliverado 2500 2500 ADZRAM 2500 Ll Bl
2023 or Newer, 3/4 Ton, Crew Cab, 4x4, Long Bed, VB Gas Parks & Rec. ) White NOBID $49,907.75 $54,163.00 $51,216,00 $54,360.00
2023 or Newer, 3/4 Ton, Crew Cab, 4x3, Lang Bed, V8 Gas Parks & Rec H Dark Blue NO BID NOBID $54,163,00 $51,712.00 $54,360.00
2023 or Newer, 3/4 Ton, Crew Cab, 414, Acgular Bed, VA Gas Miscellanaus Depts, 1 White NO BID NOBID 453,963.00 $51,512.00 $54,150.00
2023 or Mewet, 34 Toa, Craw Cab dud, Regular Bed VEGn Micellanaul Depls. 1 Dark Bive NOBID WO BID 5396000 551.512.00 55415000
DELIVERY up to 365 days STOCK 2WELRS[130-165 T80

CATEGOAY D 2023 Dodge Ram 3500 Ofesel 0 Ch";;': . 2024 FORD F350
023 or Newer, 3 Ton, Crew Caly; 4u4, Long Bed, VE, Gas mhellanous Depts. 1 White or Nyvy Blue HOEID NOBD 55511300 NOBID S55.4E5.00
2023 or Newer, § Ton, Crew Cab, 4e4, Long Bed, Turba Dievel Miiceliancus Depts 1 White ar Navy Blug NO B 6644650 564 878,00 NOBID £65,890.00
2023 or Newsr, & Ton, Craw Citb, 2WD, Lok Bad, VE, Gas Miscelfanous Depts. 1] ‘White ot Pavy Blug NOEID NOBID 551.313.00 NOBD $53,035.00
2003 o tiewer, 1 Ton Crew Cab, 3D, Long Bed, Turbo Dieied Mhicellanous Drpts. 1 White of Niey Blue Ko HO B 1LY HO MO 63,090 00
DEUIVERY up to 365 daps. o

CATEGORY £ 2024 Ford Expedition 2074 Chanvralet Tahoe HO B0 I024 FORD EXPEDITON AT
023 or Newar, Full Shie SUY, 2WD Dutele Attorney 3 Black NOBID WO BID 55684500 NOBID £64,870.00
2029 ar Newer, Full Siie SUV, 2WD Juveniie Probation 3 White, Sliver or Gray HOBID NOBID 45684500 NOBID S66 87000
033 of Newaer, Full Size SUV, 2WD Juvenlls Probation 1 White, Sliver or Gray NORID NOBID $113,690.00 NOBID 5132,740,00
2023 or Newer, Full Size UV, 2WD Migellancus Dapls. 1 White RoBD 557,190,778 556,845 00 NOBID 566 170,00
2023 or Newet. Full Mre SUV, S1d Mricefanous Dealy. - Altethale 1 Wnite N0 B0 KO B0 $55.645.00 KO 80 56987000
DELIVERY up to 365 dayi T8D

2024 Chevrolet Epress 2024 FORD TRANSIT

CATEGORY F Cargo Van 2500 135" NOBID
2023 or Newer, Full Slze Cargo Van, 2WD, Bulkhead w/lockable door, no rear windaws Malntenance & Ops 1 White NOBID NOBID $44,920,00 NO BID £51,635 00
2003 o Mewer, Full Stre Catgo Van, JWD‘lu&Mld\rJ!ncumk dbot, na rea witrdows Misteiancus Depts 1 White ar Dark Blug NOBD NORID $34,920.00 WO WD 25163500
OELIVERY up 10 365 days 180

2024 Chevrolet Express

CATEGORY G Cargo Van 2500 155" NOBID NO BID
2023 or Newer, Mid-Size Cargo Van, 2WD, Bulkhead w/lackable door, no rear windows Malntenance & Ops 3 White NOBID NOBID $47,980,00 NO BID NOBID
2023 ot Hewer, Mid-Slie Catgo Van, IW0, Bulkhesd wiictiatle dost, na fear windowi Misceltanaut Depts 1 Wniteor Dark Giue NOBD KO Qo 54158000 RO BID NOBID
DELIVERY up to 385 days

CATEGORY H 2024 Toyota Highlander 2024 Chevrolet Equinox LS NOBID 2024 FORD ESCAPE
2023 or Newer, Medlum Slze, Crossover Miscelianous Depls, White NOBID $40,427,50 5$29,983.00 NOBID $31,000 00
2023 or Newer, Medlum Slze, Crossover Miscellanous Depts. Dark Navy Blue NOBID NO BID 529,983.00 NOBID $31,000.00

Awarded by Commissioners' Court
on 11/07/2023



2023 or Newer. Medium Slie, Cratiowes Mhcellanaus Brp‘l-- Alsinate Varlety of Colors NO BID NO BID NOBID NO B\D 531,000.00
DELIVERY up 1o 365 days Tan
CATEGORY | 2024 Toyota Corolla 2024 Chevrolet Mallbu LS NOBID NOBIO
2023 or Newer, Compact Sedan {small size 100-109 cublc feet) Malntenance & Ops 1 White NOBID $25,155,25 §27,753.00 NO BID NOBID
2023 or Newer, Compact Sedan {small size 100-109 cublc feel} Malntenance & Ops r ) White NOBID NOBID $55,506,00 NOBID NOBID
2023 or Newer, Compact Sedan {small size 100-109 cuhbic feet) Miscellanous Depts. White or dark Navy Blue NOBID NOBID $27,753.00 NOBID NOBID
2073 ar Newsr, Comnpact Sedan [small site 100-103 cubile leet] Migsallanous Depts. - Allernale Varlety of Colors NO BID HOBID NORID KO BID O BID
DELIVERY up to 363 duys
CATEGORY | 2024 Chevrolet Tahoe PPV NO BID NOBID
2023 or Newer, Full Slze, SUV, 4x4, Police Package, Marked w/add-an equip. section J-15 Conslable Pct. 3 1 White NOBID NOBID $93,005,00 NOBID NOBID
2023 or Newer, Full Size, SUV, ax4, Police Package, Marked w/add-on equip. section J-15 Constable Pct. 3 4 White NOBID NOBID $372,020.00 NOBID NOBID
2023 or Newer, Full Slze, SUV, 4x4, Pollce Package, Marked w/add-on equlp. secllon I-16 Constable Pct. 4 ) White NOBID NOBID $91,378.00 NOBID NOBID
2023 or Newer, Full Size, SUV, 4x4, Police Package, Marked w/add-on equlp. seclion J-16 Constable Pct. 4 ? White NOBID NOBID $182,756.00 NOBID NOBID
2023 or Newer, Full Slze, SUV, ax4, Pollce Package, Un-Marked w/add-on equlp. section J-17 Constable Pct. 4 1 Sterling Sliver NOBID NOBID $71,722.00 NOBID NO BID
2023 or Newer, Full Slze, SUV, 4x4, Pollce Package, Marked w/add-on equip. section }-18 Constable Pct. S i White NOBID NOBID $91,250 00 NOEBID NOBID
2028 of Newir, Tull Size, S0V, dud. Police Pacage, Marked w/ads on cqwp. teeton i-18 Canitable Pet & 2 White NOBID Ko nin 5182 580 00 NOEID NG B0
DELVERY up 15 365 days
CATEGORY X 2024 Toyota Highlander white 2024 Chevrolet Blazer LT NOBID 2023 FORD EXPLORER
2023 or Newer, Mid-Size, SUV, 2WD Electlons i White NOBID 540,872.50 $32,845.00 NOBID $40,740.00
2023 or Newer, MId-5lze, SUV, 2WD Purchasing 1 white NOBID $40,872 50 $37,845.00 NOBID $40,740.00
2023 or Newer, Mid-Slae, SUV, 2WD Juvenlle Probation ] White, Sliver or Gray NOBID $40,872,50 $37,845.00 NOBID $40,740,00
2023 o¢ Newer. Mid-Sue, SUV, IWD tuverdle Probatian 1 While, $3ver of Glby NOBID 540,872,540 51565000 [=1 48148000
DILIVERY up te 358 dayi THD-SOME IN STOCK
FO2A Ram 3500LAsmE
CATEGORYL Megacab 24 RAM 3500 MEGA CAB Nodip
2023 ar Newaer, 1 Ton [3500), Regitar Bed, Bdrga Cab, dnd, Single rear wheels, Turbo Diesel Emergency Mansgement 1 Black HOBID NOBID 04,400 00 $86,163.00 HOBID
2073 of Newet, 1 Tan (1500}, Regular Bed, Mega Cab, d4d, Doudie|Duliy] rear wheelt, Turbo Dieael Fue Manna! 1 Black NO BB KO BID %m@n 591,089.00 NO D
DELIVERY up ta 365 dan OIS0 DAY
2024 Ford FA50 Police
CATEGORY M Responder XL NOEBID NO 8ID
2023 or Newer, 1/2 Ton, Crew Cah, 4x4, Police Packags, Un-tiariad w/edd-on equip. section M-14 Constable Pct 4 i Sterling Sliver NO BID NOBID $68,765,00 NO BID NO&ID
2023 or Newer, 1/2 Ton, Crew Cab, 4x4, Pollce Package, Un-Marked w/add-on equlp. section M-15 Conslable Pct. 5 [} summlt White or Black NOBID NOBID $88,818,00 NOBID NOBID
2023 or Newer, 1/2 Ton, Crew Cab, 4x4, Pollce Package, Marked w/add-on equlp, sectfon M-16 Park Ranger 1 Summit White NOBID NOBID $78,415,00 NO BID NOBID
2023 or Newer, 1/2 Tan, Crew Cab, 4x4, Pollce Package, Marked w/add-on equip. sectlon M-16 Park Ranger 2 Summit White NOBID NOBID $156,830.00 NOBID NOBID
2023 or Newer, 1/2 Ton, Crew Cab, 4x4, Police Package, Un-Marked w/add-on equip. secilan M-14 Miscellanous Depts. 1 ‘White, Black or Gray NO BID NOBID NOBID NOBID NO BID
up to 365 days
ALTERNATE BID FROM GRAPEVING.
4X%2 Quad cab V6, vinyl seats not cloth 1 $35,652.00
AVAILABLE IN STOCK 5
4%4 Quad cab V6, vinyl seats, no daytime running lights 1 $43,218.00
AVAILABLE IN STOCK 10
4x4 crew cab v5, 51t 7 in bed, viny) sets, no running lights 1 $45,384.00
AVAILABLE IN STOCK 8
axd crew cab v8, clath seats, no deytime running lights 1 $48,876.00
AVAILABLE IN STOCK B
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SILVER OR GRAY



