ANNUAL BIDS - ROAD MATERIALS: LIME #25151L

AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON NOVEMBER 29, 2022 AT 11:00 A.M.
FROM: FEBRUARY 18, 2023 TO: FEBRUARY 17, 2024 W/OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL.

OPEN MARKET (COST ONLY) PRICE INCREASES ALLOWED

TABULATION

BIDDER'S NAME LHOIST NORTH AMERICA, LLC 8LACK DOG SERVICES LLC
AND 5600 CLEARFORK MAIN STREET 5111 N. 10th
ADDRESS SUITE 300 #195
FORT WORTH, TX 76109 MCALLEN, TX 78504
DESCRIPTION {830) 221-8581 {956) 607-5965
auscroupuostcow |  sswoocemowaicow |
Price Increase
Effective 02/18/2024
. A. Hvdrated Lime, Dry: UNIT PRICE per/S0 pound bag UNIT PRICE per/50 pound bag
MM, FREIGHT 24 TONS MINIMUM 10 BAGS
1. Zone 1 $11.91 S «— $123.00
2. 2one 2 $11.91 S94H— — $123.00
3 Zone3 $11.92 e R — $123.00
4.Z0ne g $12.05 $8:56 f — $123.00
5.ZoneS $12.05 5355 L $123 00
6. Material pick-up at store $10.00 $250 — $102.00
B. Hydrated Lime, Dry: UNIT PRICERErTan
MIN, FREIGHT 24 TONS
1, Zone 1 $334.30 $a81.47 «— NO BID
2.Zone 2 $334.30  $29t47  +— NO BID
3.20ne 3 $334.68 520182 — NO BID
- 4.Z0ne 4 $340.56 $29215 -— NO BID
S Zones $340.56 S¥LE NO BID
| C. Hydrated Lime Slurry: UNIT PRICRE/Ton
MIN. FREIGHT 8 TONS
1. Zonel $358.75 - NO BID
2. Zone 2 $361.84 +— NO BID
3.Zone3 $364.12 R — NQ 8iD
 4.Zoned $369.54 — NO BID
! 5.Zane 5 $369.54 -~— : NQ BID
i ALTERNATE: Commercial Lime Slurry: UNIT PRICE per/Ton
MM, FREGHT B TONS
1. Zone 1 $306.88  $273:29 -«
| 2.20ne2 $309.10  $27538 +—
. 3.Zone 3 $311.84 539766 _+—
4. Zone 4 $340.56 —5283-68 f—
! 5.Zone 5 $340 56 528368 +—
Demurrage 2+ hrs 85.00 pr/hr N/A!
| Layover charge per night $350 pr/night _N/Al
| Dry - Truck ordered and not used $2,500 r/truck N/Al
! Sluery - Truck ordered and not used $400.00  pr/ftruck N/AI
Wil impl a "Fuel Charge", see attached [Texas R&C F5C Table)
RECOMMENDATION R RECOMMENDATION:

| HEREBEERTIFY THBEOVE TOBE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED

12/ ;z/a'v%
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Renewed to 02/27/2025
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on 12/20/2022



dalia.loera
Highlight

dalia.loera
Line

dalia.loera
Line

dalia.loera
Line

dalia.loera
Line

dalia.loera
Line

dalia.loera
Line

dalia.loera
Line

dalia.loera
Line

dalia.loera
Line

dalia.loera
Line

dalia.loera
Line

dalia.loera
Line

dalia.loera
Line

dalia.loera
Line

dalia.loera
Line

dalia.loera
Line




