Renew to 03/29/25

TABULATION
ANNUAL BID ¥ 2430 - MOSQUNTO INSECTICIDE
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON: MARCH 7TH, 2023 AT 3:00 P.M. T B
.
FROM: MARCH 29, 2023 TO: MARCH 28, 2024 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL, Price Increase: Effective 03/28/24
VENDOR'S NAME CLARKE MOS0 ADAPCO Renickil North Amerlea tne , DBA Terget Speclalty Pradudds ES QB0 USA LLEDRA Vaalls
& /8 SIOWELLCT, U COLONIAL CENTER 38110 1225 N POST OAK RD, A7 riped Eanms ey 11
ADDRESS ST CHARLES IL 60174 LAKE MARY FL NG HOUSTOR, TX 77055 Hamingan, TX JBSS5
(a0 1208777 14071 RA510 £310) FLe B3 LTI PRI AT 12103 223043
SCRIPTION UM | ysannneuE LT e BRAND NEA UNIY PAICE BRAND NAVE AT RECE ERAND NOME 1INIT PRICE
DESCRIPTION ANRNY ME NP I LnaTone AND
1 18% Resmethrin, 84% Piparonyl Buloxde -5 galipail GaL
NO BID NO BD NO BID NO BID
2. 4% Resmelhnn. 12% Piperonyl Buloxide, « (Ruacy 10 use = RIU) S5 |
javdium ND HID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3, Qi - base P R1U, min 4% F in, 8% Piperony! GaL haand
|Butaxida - f55 gal Drum) 0 BID NO BID Paomons 540 52 NOBID
bi. O based Pyrelhraids - min, 1,5% O-basad Permelhrin, 7.5% ¢
{Piusronyl Bulaside - Roady 1 usa (55 gat Orum) | I 3532'98 NO B NO BID NQ B
] Oﬂ-_basod P RTU, mun, 4% F and 4% Prperanyl ca | Pamexmvas PormaScasu 4 4 :5'22:23_
Butonide - < B 1o Use (55 gal} Dnam $I6 45 el dnm) 53125 Panmde UL &4 $26 B $21.54
£, D1 besed F RTU, min 4% 1 ana 4% Fiperony | Ve s 4 (507 2.23
Buioxide - Ready lo Use - 2X 25 gatioad SALY_bom-KiV el $31.45 gt §31 40 Pen X1 48 3186 156
7. O-basad Pemethnn RTU, min. 4% Pemmelbrin and 4% Fiperany! Gal | Puma V44 PamaSyasa &4 -
Rulaxide - Reody la Use - { 275 qals) Minl Bulk $72 80 21501 1010y 231.00 $27.29 521.58
A. OU-basod F C * . 30% Feunaitinn 30% LD IR
Pipumnal;nﬂulom'du "% saiipal min- 0% 04l | Puim X ULV IR0 23 yles 0glar .
§21 .50 275 gl inla $90 00 Pgemannns 30-30 $£77.00 SEN 00
PermnaSuuee 3030
1. Oil-based Permethnn Goncanleate min 31% Permelnrin, 66% GAL | PainAULY 11-60 z:;‘:?::n;:u 5 —
Peuion| Quloxde - geiigal FAEE) agius $165.00 baimanara 31 56 £122.00 $132.24
10_Crioppates ¥ 5 leina) KIL - 55 natdam QAL | Mrguiatian % 513800 0 NO 81D NO BLD NO BID
V1 _Chlorpyrifos 3.5 ib/gal R S pal drum GAL N NO BID NQ BID NO BID
12 Altosid Brguols (220 cnl)~ 156 days  (Opon Markol Price o 8342.60 —-m —'suz_sﬂ
|increases allowed) $8184 NO BID 1840 SE1R40
13, Aliosid Briausle (400 cnl1— 30 days  (Gpen Markel Frice > 536.00 — $536.00 —$536.00 |
Incronsos allowed) §52000 RO RID 353000 ]
14 Alloaige Fro G 1.5% Melhcprene (24 prcs) xx days (Qpen - — $195.04
Marko! Price Increasa allossa) $391 Au NQ RIN 5194 88 $199.36
15 Altosida Pro G 1.59% ttelrspreny (12 pras) - ax days (Open P s 19 25
Markul Pricwn lngrease allored) swn,zg_' " NN BID 5396 28 §413 84
Symma Bn —_—
16 Bactmas Brgupts 1100 pelbey dug B | oncusalcunke 4106 47 NO 8ID [ — $102 25 €104
17 Brauels - 6% Bardis 1% Bacius inuri (200 on | [Femm oo ?321 A0
cni) - 45 day L bied 432000 31.400.00 Sumidary WSO $646.10 NO BID
= . Uraobat GGG " Ll
18, EPA Approved Diluonl OF for Mosquilo Control - 55 galfdum [.IT8 Faveokeh 01 2148 pro 218 21 i §13.97 £11.87
19, Aquabac (200G) Bacltus Thunngeiensis 2,88% BAG gTISS
NOBID 211500 Surmnt 11 Gianray $7837 Al
1. LOCAL VENDTH =
Optional BuyBoard 709-23
RECOMMENDATION —_— BuyBoard 706-23
slualon
—— I R Lol 2
3/21/73
Ver

Awarded by Commissioners' Court
on 03/28/2023



