TABULATION

ANNUAL BIDS - ROAD MATERIALS: CONCRETE # 2510
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON FEBRUARY 7, 2023, AT 3:00 P.M.

Renewed to 02/28/2025

FROM: AWARD DATE TO: FEBRUARY 28, 2024 W/OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL.

OPEN MARKET (COST ONLY) PRICE INCREASES ALLOWED

Price Incease as of 02/28/2024

BIDDER'S NAME CEMEX
AND 3710 S. EXPR. 281,
ADDRESS EDINBURG, TX. 78542
DESCRIPTION (956) 386-1452
price per/ cubic yard

1. A. Class A Concrete - 3000 P.S.1. Min.
1. Zone 1 — $465:80 $177.00
2. Zone 2 —> $165:80 $177.00
3. Zone 3 — $465-00 $177.00)
4. Zone 4 — $165:60$177.00
5. Zone 5 — §465:06-$177.00
2 yds minimum for all orders
B. Class B Concrete - 2000 P.S.1. Min.
1. Zone 1 — $459:60$171.00
2. Zone 2 — $159:86 $171.00
3. Zone 3 — $459:60 $171.00
4. Zone 4 — $468:60 $171.00
5. Zone 5 — §189:86-$171.00
2 yds minimum for all orders
C. Class C Concrete - 3600 P.S.1. Min.
1. Zone 1 — $172:06-5184.00
2. Zone 2 — $472:60$184.00
3. Zone 3 — $172:00-$184.00
4, Zone 4 — $+72-06 $184.00]
5.Zone 5 — §772:66 $184.00
2 yds minimum for all orders
D. Class D Concrete - 1500 P.S.I. Min.
1. Zone 1 NO BID
2.Zone 2 NO BID
3.Zone 3 NO BID
4.Zone 4 NO BID
5. Zone 5 NO BID
2.A.C t Tr t (Road Mixed)
1. Zone 1 NO BID
2. Zone 2 NO BID
3.Zone 3 NO BID
4. Zone 4 NO BID
5. Zone 5 NO BID
3. A. Cement Flowable Backfill 80-150 P.S.I.
1. Zone 1 — $125:60 $157.00
2. Zone 2 — $145:00 $157.00
3. Zone 3 — $145:66-5157.00
4. Zone 4 — $145:06- $157.00
5. Zone 5 — §445-00$157.00

2 yds minimum for all orders

Demurrage 2+ hrs
RECOMMENDATION —

| HEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED.

Feb. 09, 2023

BENJ - WORSHAM, P.E., P.T.O.E. DIRECTOR OF NSPORTATION

A1/ A3

DATE

CARLOS SANCHEZ, P.E. COUNTY ROAS-ENGINEER d

DATE

afaf 23

CHASING WGENT

DATE

02-09-2023 BY RCL

Awarded by Commissioners' Court
on 02/14/2023
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ACORDY DATE(MM/DDYYYY)
S CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE 0211012023
THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES BELOW.
THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.
IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed. If =
SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on this !g
certificate does not confer rights to the certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s). E

PRODUCER CONTACT %

Aon Risk Services Southwest, Inc. PHONE FAX 5

Houston TX OFfice TNy (866) 283-7122 AX oy (800) 363-0105 z

5555 san Felipe E-MAIL T

Suite 1500 |_ADDRESS:

Houston TX 77056 USA

INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #
INSURED INSURER A: National Union Fire Ins Co of Pittsburgh|19445
Cemex, Inc. INSURER B: AIU Insurance Company 19399
10100 Katy Freeway -
suite 300 INSURER C: XL Insurance America Inc 24554
Houston TX 77043 USA INSURER D:
INSURER E:
INSURER F:
COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: 570097812714 REVISION NUMBER:
THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLIGIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS. Limits shown ars as requestad
INSR TYPE OF INSURANCE %jﬂﬁ POLICY NUMBER A Y LIMITS
A | X | coMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY GL9584149 01/01/2023]01/01/2024] each 0cCURRENCE $4,500,000
SIR applies per policy terfis & condifions DAMAGE TO RENTED
CLAIMS-MADE OCCUR PREMISES (€5 i $4,500,000
X | $500,000 SIR MED EXP (Any one person) Excluded
PERSONAL & ADV INJURY $4,500,000]
GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: GENERAL AGGREGATE $4,500,000 E
POLICY ng.li Loc PRODUCTS - COMPIOP AGG $4,500,000 ®
»
OTHER: 8
A | AUTOMOBILE LiABILITY AL 7281095 01/01/2023|01/01/2024| COMBINED SINGLE LIMIT $5 000, 000 .
; y y
| AOS |_(Ea accident)

A | x | anvauTo AL 7281098 01/01/2023|01/01/2024 | BODILY INJURY ( Per person) ;
| ownep SCHEDULED VA BODILY INJURY (Per accident) z
[—— AUTOS ONLY e PROPERTY DAMAGE %

HIRED AUTOS NON-OWNED A 8
— onwy AUTOS ONLY {Ber pccidant) =
X | Phys. Dmg, E
¢ | x| umerercanas | x | occur US00106717LI23A 01/01/2023|01/01/2024 Each OCCURRENCE $5,000,000] ©
s B . . ki
EXCESS LIAB CLAMSMADE SIR applies per policy terps & condikions e $5,000, 000
oD | X |reTEnTiON
B | WORKERS COMPENSATION AND wC0808B0501 01/01/2023|01/01/2024| y | PER STATUTE [ IOTH
EMPLOVERS LIABILTY viu AOS except Alabama - $2,500,000

B | Grrceomemensoioneor [ ]wia| - |wcosossoso2 01/01/2023|01/01/2024| S EACHACCIOENT 500,

{Mandstory in NH) CA E.L. DISEASE-EA EMPLOYEE $2,500,000

gé%%éfé??é’ﬁ lgg eOrPERATlDNS below E L. DISEASE-POLICY LIMIT $2,500,000
DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS { LOCATIONS { VEHICLES (ACORD 101, A may be If more space Is required) I
CERTIFICATE HOLDER CANCELLATION

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE THE
EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELNERED [N ACCORDANCE WITH THE
POLICY PROVISIONS.

Cameron County AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

Attn: Dalia Loera

1100 E. Monroe St.
Brownsville TX 78520 USA

©1988-2015 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights reserved.

ACORD 25 (2016/03) The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD
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Dalia Loera

— ——
From: Dylbia Jefferies
Sent: Friday, February 10, 2023 2:14 PM
To: Dalia Loera
Subject: RE: Cemex, Inc. - Certificate Issuance - Aon Ref#23021026411736 - Cameron County

That insurance is fine.

Dylbia Jefferies Vega

Legal Counsel

Cameron County Commissioners Court
1100 E. Monroe Street

Brownsville, Texas 78520

{956) 550-1345 office

(956) 550-1348 fax
diefferi@co.cameron.tx.us

Attorney-Client Privileged Communication: The information contained in this message is privileged and

confidential. It is intended only to be read by the individual or entity named above or their designee. If the reader of
this message is not the intended recipient, you are on notice that any distribution of this message, in any form, is
strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately notify the sender and/or Cameron
County Legal Division by telephone at (956) 550-1345 and delete or destroy any copy of this message.

From: Dalia Loera <dalia.loera@co.cameron.tx.us>

Sent: Friday, February 10, 2023 12:49 PM

To: Trista Lorraine Valdez <TLValdez@co.cameron.tx.us>

Cc: Dylbia Jefferies <djefferi@co.cameron.tx.us>

Subject: Cemex, Inc. - Certificate Issuance - Aon Ref#23021026411736 - Cameron County

Hello,

Can you please have Dylbia review the Certificate of Liability Insurance?

This is for Bid #2510 Road Materials: Cement
Let us know.

Dalia

From: ACS Chicago <acs.chicago@aon.com>

Sent: Friday, February 10, 2023 12:37 PM

To: riskmanagementusa@cemex.com; rogerv.gonzales@cemex.com; victoriaa.egan@cemex.com; Dalia Loera
<dalia.loera@co.cameron.tx.us>

Subject: Client#440000000187 - Cemex, Inc. - Certificate Issuance - Aon Ref#23021026411736 - Cameron County
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