ANNUAL BID #2560 : ROAD FLEXIBLE BASE MATERIALS
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON MARCH 7, 2023 AT 3:00 P.M.
FROM: MARCH 16, 2023 TO: MARCH 15, 2024 W/OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL.
OPEN MARKET (COST ONLY) PRICE INCREASES ALLOWED

Renewed to 03/15/2025

TABULATION

VENDOR'S NAME FRONTERA MATERIALS GREEN DREAM INTL. MARTIN MARIETTA VULCAN MATERIALS
8 P.0. BOX 1449, 32 8th. ST., S# 607 4949 N. LOOP 1604 W, S# 135 P.O. BOX 791550,
ADDRESS ELSA, TX. 78543 ERIE, PA. 16501 SAN ANTONIO, TX. 78249 SAN ANTONIO, TX, 78279
DESCRIPTION (956) 373-0240 (814) 616-7800 (210) 208-4201 (210) 965-0419
A |FLEX . BASE TYPE "E" PERITON TRANSESSRTTAT'ON TOTALCOST [PERTON TRANSggSRTTAT'ON TOTAL COST |PERITON TRANSgggTTAT'ON TOTALCOST |PERTON TRANSgggTTAT'ON TOTAL COST
CALICHE - GRADE 4 Price Increase as of 03/15/2024
1. ZONE 1 PRITON $8.50 $9.71 $18.21 $21.34 $9.08 $30.42 $7.00 $11.21 —» $18.21 $38.00 $13.65 $51.65
2. ZONE 2 PRITON $8.50 $12.30 $20.80 | $24.92 $9.08 $34.00 $7.00 $11.21 —» $18.21 $38.00 $11.34 $49.34
3. ZONE 3 PRITON $8.50 $15.49 $23.99 |$25.96 $9.08 $35.04 $7.15 $13.06 —» $20.21 $38.00 $10.30 $48.30
4. ZONE 4 PR/TON $8.50 $16.60 $25.10 | $26.40 $9.08 $35.48 $7.75 $13.21 —» $20.96 $38.00 $8.23 $46.23
5. ZONE 5 PRITON $8.50 $17.64 $26.14 | $32.73 $9.08 $41.81 $7.50 $16.43 —» $23.93 $38.00 $8.23 $46.23
B. |CRUSHED LIMESTONE
1. ZONE 1 PR/TON NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2. ZONE 2 PRITON NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3. ZONE 3 PRITON NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4. ZONE 4 PR/TON NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5. ZONE 5 PR/TON NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
—

RECOMMENDATION BY COUNTY ENGINEER

| HEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED:

IGN AME,

TARL CSANCHEZ,

. PURCHASING AGENT

OUNTY ROADENGINEER

AT 3
bl

Awarded by COmmissioners' Court
on 03/14/2023

Tabulated by RCL






