

TABULATION

ANNUAL BID # 2580 - ROAD SURFACING MATERIALS
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON MARCH 7, 2023 AT 3:00 P.M.
FEOM: MARCH 16, 2023 TO MARCH 16, 2024 W. ORTION TO REI

FROM: MARCH 16, 2023 TO MARCH 15, 2024 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL OPEN MARKET (TRANSPORTATION_COST ONLY) PRICE INCREASES ALLOWED

BIDDER'S NAME	Waller County Asphalt, Inc.			Frontera Materials, Inc.				Vulcan Construction Materials, LLC			
AND ADDRESS	22010 Fairgrounds Rd.			P.O. BOX 1449.				P.O. Box 791550			
	Hemi	pstead, TX 77445			FLSA	A, TX. 78543			San Ant	onio, TX 78279	
DESCRIPTION	(979) 826-7075			(956) 316-8951				(210) 965-0419			
A. HOT MIX-	,	Transportation			(800	Transportation			1210	Transportation	
ASPHALTIC CONCRETE	PER/TON	Cost	Total Cost		PER/TON	Cost	Total Cost		PER/TON	Cost	Total Cost
1. Type "D" - Gravel / Limestone											
"Paving & Speed Humps"									101		
(1) Zone 1	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	-	\$80.00	\$7.05	\$87.05		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
(2) Zone 2	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	-	\$80.00	\$9.17	\$89.17		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
(3) Zone 3	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	-	\$80.00	\$11.04	\$91.04		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
(4) Zone 4	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	-	\$80.00	\$14.93	\$94.93		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
(5) Zone 5	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	-	\$80.00	\$15.97	\$95.97		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
(6) Hold for pick-up	NO BID			→	\$80.00		\$80.00		NO BID		NO BID
B. LIMESTONE ROCK ASPHALT (CLASS A)	PER/TON	Transportation Cost	Total Cost		PER/TON	Transportation Cost	Total Cost		PER/TON	Transportation Cost	Total Cost
1. Type "CC" - natural cold - coarse							7.00		1		1012.000
(a) Public Works Brownsville P1	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	—	\$66.00	\$81.42	\$147.42
(b) Public Works Brownsville P2	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		\$66.00	\$81.42	\$147.42
(c) Public Works San Benito P3	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		\$66.00	\$76.82	\$142.82
(d) Public Works Harlingen P4	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\rightarrow	\$66.00	\$75.44	\$141.44
(e) Zone 1	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	-	\$66.00	\$75.44	\$141.44
(f) Zone 2	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		\$66,00	\$76.82	\$142.82
(g) Zone 3	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		\$66.00	\$77.28	\$143.28
(h) Zone 4	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	-	\$66.00	\$79.35	\$145.35
(i) Zone 5	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		\$66.00	\$81.42	\$147.42
											* Alabida II
		Transportation				Transportation				Transportation	
2. TYPE "D" - natural cold - fines	PER/TON	Cost	Total Cost		PER/TON	Cost	Total Cost		PER/TON	Cost	Total Cost
(a) Public Works Brownsville P1 & P2	\$105.00	\$127.75	\$232.75		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	→	\$68.00	\$81.42	\$149.42
(b) Public Works San Benito	\$105.00	\$120.40	\$225.40		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		\$68.00	\$76.82	\$144.82
(c) Public Works Harlingen	\$105.00	\$117.25	\$222.25		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		\$68.00	\$75.44	\$143.44
(d) Zone 1	\$105.00	\$117.25	\$222.25	-	\$90.00	\$15.42	\$105.42		\$68.00	\$75.44	\$143.44
(e) Zone 2	\$105.00	\$117.25	\$222.25	→	\$90.00	\$16.32	\$106.32		\$68.00	\$76.82	\$144.82
(f) Zone 3	\$105.00	\$120.40	\$225.40	-	\$90.00	\$19.42	\$109.42		\$68.00	\$77.28	\$145.28
(g) Zone 4	\$105.00	\$120.40	\$225.40	-	\$90.00	\$22.92	\$112.92		\$68.00	\$79.35	\$147.35
(h) Zone 5	\$105.00	\$127.75	\$232.75	→	\$90.00	\$23.96	\$113.96		\$68.00	\$81.42	\$149.42

RECOMMENDATION BY COUNTY ENGINEER:	
I mad Chym	
GNACIO AMEZCUA, PURCHASING AGENT	
16 Dilas	
CARLOS A. SANCHEZ, COUNTY ROAD ENGINEER	

3/9/23 DATE 3/9/23

Tabulated by RCL



TABULATION

ANNUAL BID # 2580 - ROAD SURFACING MATERIALS
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON MARCH 7, 2023 AT 3:00 P.M.
FROM: MARCH 16, 2023 TO MARCH 15, 2024 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL OPEN MARKET (TRANSPORTATION COST ONLY) PRICE INCREASES ALLOWED

BIDDER'S NAME Waller County Asphalt, Inc. AND ADDRESS 22010 Fairgrounds Rd. Herripstead, TX 77445 DESCRIPTION (979) 826-7075				Frontera Materials, Inc. P.O. BOX 1449, ELSA, TX. 78543 (956) 316-8951				Vulcan Construction Materials, LLC P.O. Box 791550 San Antonio, TX 78279 (210) 965-0419														
												AGGREGATE FOR SURFACE										
														Transportation				Transportation			Transportation	
												TREATMENTS	PER/TON	Cost	Total Cost		PER/TON	Cost	Total Cost	PER/TON	Cost	Total Cost
1. Type P.E. Grade 3																						
(a) Zone 1	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	→	\$56.00	\$7.05	\$63.05	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID												
(b) Zone 2	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		\$56.00	\$9.17	\$65.17	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID												
(c) Zone 3	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		\$56.00	\$11.04	\$67.04	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID												
(d) Zone 4	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	-	\$56.00	\$14.93	\$70.93	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID												
(e) Zone 5	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		\$56.00	\$15.97	\$71.97	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID												
		Transportation				Transportation			Transportation													
2. Type P.E. Grade 4 Non Coated Aggregate	PER/TON	Cost	Total Cost		PER/TON	Cost	Total Cost	PER/TON	Cost	Total Cost												
(a) Zone 1	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	-	\$35.00	\$7.05	\$42.05	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID												
(b) Zone 2	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		\$35.00	\$9.17	\$44.17	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID												
(c) Zone 3	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		\$35.00	\$11.04	\$46.04	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID												
(d) Zone 4	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	-	\$35.00	\$14.93	\$49.93	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID												
(e) Zone 5	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	-	\$35.00	\$15.97	\$50.97	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID												
Aggregate for Surface Treatments Type		Transportation				Transportation			Transportation													
P.E. Grade 5	PER/TON	Cost	Total Cost		PER/TON	Cost	Total Cost	PER/TON	Cost	Total Cost												
(a) Zone 1	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	-	\$56.00	\$7.05	\$63.05	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID												
(b) Zone 2	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		\$56.00	\$9.17	\$65.17	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID												
(c) Zone 3	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	-	\$56.00	\$11.04	\$67.04	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID												
(d) Zone 4	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	-	\$56.00	\$14.93	\$70.93	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID												
(e) Zone 5	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	→	\$56.00	\$15.97	\$71.97	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID												
		Transportation				Transportation			Transportation	.,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,												
4. Type P.E. Grade 5 Non Coated Aggregate	PER/TON	Cost	Total Cost		PER/TON	Cost	Total Cost	PER/TON	Cost	Total Cost												
(a) Zone 1	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	-	\$35.00	\$7.05	\$42.05	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID												
(b) Zone 2	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		\$35.00	\$9.17	\$44.17	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID												
(c) Zone 3	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		\$35.00	\$11.04	\$46.04	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID												
(d) Zone 4	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		\$35.00	\$14.93	\$49.93	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID												
	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID				A STATE OF THE PARTY OF THE PAR															

RECOMMENDATION BY COUNTY ENGINEER:

I HEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED:

IGNA DO AMEZCUA, PURCHASING AGENT

CARLOS A. SANCHEZ COUNTY ROAD ENGINEER

3/9/23 3/9/23 DATE

Tabulated by RCL