TABULATION SHEET

ANNUAL BIDS - LUBES, OILS, GREASES & ANTI-FREEZE. # 1893
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON MARCH 12, 2025, AT 3:00 P.M.

FROM: MARCH 31, 2025 TO: MARCH 30, 2026 W/OPTION TO RENEW ONGE OR TWICE FOR ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL.

OPEN MARKET PRICE INCREASES ALLOWED.

VENDOR'S NAME ARGUINDEGUI OIL CO. II, LTD SAFETY-KLEEN SYSTEMS, INC.
AND 105 PENNZOIL LOOP 42 LONGWATER DRIVE
ADDRESS EDINBURG, TX 78542 NORWELL, MA 02061
MONTHLY {956)722-5251 (781)427-3060
DESCRIPTION USAGE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE
CATEGORY A:
1._|Engine Oil {Gas) 5WW30 API-SN-GFS 112 $1.760.00 $4.420.00
2 |Engine Qil {(Gas) 5W30 API-SH 1 $465.93 $569.18
2 |Engine Oil 10W30 1 $1.186.35 $1.659.90
4. |Engine OIl 10W40 1 NO BID NO BID
5. |Engine Oil (Diesel) 15W40-API-CG4 112 $2,342.50 $5,030.00
8. |Engine Oil (Diesel) 15W40-API-CG 1 $594.00 $600.89
7. |Gear Oil 85/140-85w-140 API-GL5 112 $586.45 _ $917.66
|e. |Dexron lll - A.T.F (or equivalent) 116 $638.17 $4,610.00
o |Dexron lll - A, T.F (or equivalent) 1/2 $250.25 $544.30
16| Dextron VI Transmission Oil 1 $4.073.33 $6.870.00
|11.|Fully Synthetic Oll W20 1 $1.166.00 $567.24
12 A.W. - Hydraulic Oil ISO .68 DENISON HFO (or equivalent) 116 $427.43 $518.30
13| Universal Tractor Fluid General Purpose J20C/C4 1/2 $594.17 $4.650.00
14.{Universal Tractor Fluid General Purpose J20C/C4 172 $235.32 $558.85
15| Grease-NLGI-2 Multi-Purpose EP2 Lithium Complex (or Equivalent) 172 $93.30 $225.60
16| Grease-NLGI-2 Multi-Purpose EPZ Lithium Complex (or Equivalent) 48 $295.46 $464.19
17.|Power Steering Fluid - Regular NO BID NO BID
All prices Inciude drums/bulk tanks. Vendor will provide al least (3) bulk dispenelng syslems
i alno charge.
TOTAL PRICE $14,709.66 | $32,208.11
CATEGORY B:
1. | Anti-Freeze-Winer/Summer-green-Regular - non freezing to 20 40 gals
degrees below zero Fahrenheit NO BID $162.40
2. | Anti-Freeze-Winter/Summer-DexCool 100% - non freezing to 20 66 qals
degrees below zerp Fahrenheit g NO BID $307.45
TOTAL PRICE $0.00 $469.85 |
CATEGORY C:
1. Degreaser & Tar Remover Arow Magnolia - ARCS-250 or J.B. - 55 gals NO BID NO BID
Citrus Sol Chem-Co. or equivalent
TOTAL PRICE $0.00 $0.00
| Imisc. Lubes. Oils, Greases 0% 7%
RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE
RECOMMENDATION:

Category A: Arguindegui Oil Co,, I, Lif.

‘Category B: Safety-Kleen Systems, Inc.

Category C: N/A

Awarded by Commissioners' Court
on 03/25/2025



