ANNUAL BID # 2004 : LIGHT BULBS & BALLASTS

AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON March 12, 2025 AT 3:00 P.
FROM: APRIL 9, 2025 TO: APRIL 8, 2026 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR ONE (1) YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL.

TABULATION

ATTE; BILL DUNCAN

(956) 546-2401

SPRINGFIELD, MO 65807

(417) 865-9200
ATTE; DOUGLAS SEARS

ATTE; JUDY HESKEL

VENDOR'S NAME ELECTRIC FIXTURE SUPPLY FSK SOLUTIONS, LLC (dba Daystar Distributing) LIGHTING N BEYOND LLC
& 810 EAST 11TH STREET 1723A S. WEST BYPASS 628 ROUTE 303
ADDRESS BROWNSVILLE, TX. 78522

BLAUVELT, NY 10913

(845) 513-0344

APPROXIMATE
QUANIILY - Price each Price per case Total price Price each Price per case Total price Price each Price per case Total price
DESCRIPTION - CATEGORY A ANNUAL
A-1Electronic L. LED T8 Tube 17-Walt Day Light 55,000 hrs, ., 4 fool 50 cases - 25 pel
e T R o892 000 | emasper | g 09 $200.00 $12,000.00 $6.60 $165.00 $9,900.00 $6.87 $171.75 $10,545.00
A-2 Electronic Lamps T8 Tube  17-Walt Day light 15,000 hrs. avg., 8 foot 3 cases <25 pe $246.00 10
Required: Philips, G.E., Sylvania or (squal) et | $10.00 $250.00 $1,250.00 $24.60 er case $3,075.00 $18.70 NIA $2,337.50
A-3 Electronic Lamps LED Corn Bulb 70 Watt 25 linch 25.80 $645.00 $30.36 N/A $759.00 20.28 N/A $507.00
A4 Electronic Lamps LED Corn Bulb 150 Watt 30 Each 530.00 $1,500.00 37.96 N/A 1.898.00 $35.33 NIA 1,766.50
A-5 Electronic Lamps LED Corn Bulb 250 Watt 25 liuch 540.00 $1,000.00 $49.50 N/A 1,237.50 75.27 N/A 1.881.75
A-6 Parking Lot LED Fixture lights 250 Watt 10 Fach $55.50 $555.00 310.00 N/A 3,100.00 $135.00 N/A 1,350.00
A-7 Parking Lot LED Fixture lights 500 Watt 10 Lachy $129.75 $1,297.50 32.00 N/A 1,320.00 NO BID N/A NO BID
A-8 Parking Lot LED Fixture lights 750 Watt 5 llsh 148.60 $743.00 246.00 N/A 1,230.00 NO BID N/A NO BID
A-Q Parking Lot LED Fixture lights 1000 Watt 3 Jach $235.00 $1,175.00 246.00 NI/A 1.230.00 NO BID N/A NO BID
A10 LED light bulbs Day Light 60 Watt 25 hoxes -8 pur $455.52
o $1.75 $14.00 $350.00 $37.96 12 per box $7,592.00 $1.65 $13.20 $105.60

A11 LED light bulbs Soft Light 60 Watt 15 hoxes -8 per $594.00

e $1.10 $8.80 $432.00 $49.50 12 per box $5,940.00 $1.66 $13.20 $105.60
GRAND TOTAL CATEGORY A: $20,647.50 $37,281.50 $18,598.95

VENDOR'S NAME ELECTRIC FIXTURE SUPPLY FSK SOLUTIONS, LLC (dbha Daystar Distributing) LIGHTING N BEYOND LLC
& 810 EAST 11TH STREET 1723A S. WEST BYPASS 628 ROUTE 303
ADDRESS BROWNSVILLE, TX. 78522 SPRINGFIELD, MO 65807 BLAUVELT, NY 10913
(956) 546-2401 (417) 865-9200 (845) 513-0344
ATTE; BILL DUNCAN ATTE; DOUGLAS SEARS ATTE; JUDY HESKEL
Al'PRUXIMATL
QUANIITY - Price each Price per case Total price Price each Price per case Total price Price each Price per case Total price
DESCRIPTION - CATEGORY B ANNUAL
-1 Eleclronic Lamps F32T8 TL741A or SP41 32-Watt Low Marcury, 20,000 hrs. 5 cuses =25 per $108.00 o
avg., 4 foot Requirad: Philips - Alle, G.E. - Ece, Sylvania or (equal) case $1.89 $47.25 $236.25 $3.00 36 PER CASE $1,995.00 $2.76 $69.00 $345.00
A-2 Electronic Lamps FO6T8 TL 741 or SP41 59-Watt 15,000 hrs. avg., 8 foot $330.00 125.25 0
Roauired: Philips, G.E.. Sylvania or (squal) $8.50 $127.50 $255.00 $13.75 24 PER CASE $412.50 $8.35 $125. $250.5
A-3 Lamps F40T12CWRSWM 34 — Watt Cool White, 4 foot - 20,000 hrs. avg. $162.00 ) 84.0 420.00
Required: Philips, G.E., Sylvania or (equal) $1.20 $30.00 $150.00 $5.40 30 PER CASE $675.00 $3.36 $ 0 $
A-4 Lamps FOET120WWM 60 — Watt Cool White, 8 foot - Slim-line - 12,000 hrs., % 318. 7.66 114.90 229 80
avi, Required: Philips. G.E., Sylvania or {ogual) $2.25 $33.75 $67.50 $10.60 $159.00 $ 90 $ $ $
A-5 Lamps High Output F96T12CW / HO 95-Watt 12,000 hrs. avg., B foot . 313.50 11.06 165.90 331.80
Required: Philips, G.E., Sylvania or {ogual $2.60 $39.00 $78.00 $10.45 $156.75 $ $ $ $
A-6 Compact Fluorescent w/ Enclosed Cover - Outdoor Bulbs 18 watt = 75 Watt , cuscs - . 204.00
9,000 hr. avg. par 38 co bulb flood light Requirsd: Phiips Earth light-Marathon | -**3=13P | g4.79 $26.85 $26.85 $8.50 ) 4iER pe $127.50 $7.99 $119.85 $119.85
wper lona life or teauall =
A-7 Ballasts: T8 -4 Lamp - 4 foot Electronic — ICN4P32SC 120/277 Volt Snap-on, 10 cach $14.80 $1 48.00 $21.50 NIA $21 5.00 $11.06 N/A $1 10.60
otor: bertson’s or {aqual) — : = =
A-8 Ballasts: T8 - 2 Lamp - 4 foot Electronic ~ ICN2P32SC 120/277 Volt Snap-on, 10 cach $14.80 $148.00 $17.10 NIA $471.00 $8.14 N/A $81.40
grison's or (nguall — N

A-9 Ballasts: 2 Lamp - B foot Electranic - REL2P58RH - 120 Volt Snap-on, 10 cach $1 8.40 $1 84.00 $36.00 N/A $360.00 $14.89 N/A $148.90
Mol rinon's or (equal E—
A10 Ballasts: 2 Lamp - 8 fool Electronic - REL2PS9RH - 277 Volt Snap-on, 10 cach $11.00 $110.00 $36.00 N/A $360.00 $14.89 N/A $448.90
Motorola. Robertson's or {equal} — N
A11 Ballasis; 2 Lamp - 8 foot Cool While - High Output - 96712 R25110TP - 120 10 cuch $14.20 $142.00 $45.00 N/A $450.00 $21.69 N/A $216.90
Volt Advanced or {agual) == . .
GRAND TOTAL CATEGORY B $1,545.60 $5.397.50 $2,403.65

RECOMMENDED AWARD



TABULATION

ANNUAL BID #2004 : LIGHT BULBS & BALLASTS
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON March 12, 2025 AT 3:00 P.M.
FROM: APRIL 9, 2025 TO: APRIL 8, 2026 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR ONE (1) YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL.

VENDOR'S NAME ELECTRIC FIXTURE SUPPLY FSK SOLUTIONS, LLC (dba Daystar Distributing) LIGHTING N BEYOND LLC
& 810 EAST 11TH STREET 1723A S. WEST BYPASS 628 ROUTE 303
ADDRESS BROWNSVILLE, TX. 78522 SPRINGFIELD, MO 65807 BLAUVELT, NY 10913
(956) 546-2401 (417) 865-9200 (845) 513-0344
- ATTE; BILL DUNCAN ATTE; DOUGLAS SEARS ATTE; JUDY HESKEL
ATROATGL TS

DESCRIPTION - CATEGORY C QUM_\I.I L].T . Price each Price per case Total price Price each Price per case Total price Price each Price per case Tolal prica
B-1 1000 Waus Metul Llatide Light 3ulb 3 cach $45.00 5225 00 $35.00 N/A $175.00 $33.81 N/A $169.05
B-2 1000 Walls Melal [ luhde Ballost 5 cach $139.75 698.75 $135.00 NIA $675.00 $205.93 N/A $1,029.65
1-3-400 Wants. Netud | lulide Light Tulb 5 cach 38 50 192.50 $19.00 N/A $95.00 $17.23 NiA $86.15
B-4 400 Wutts_Metal 1lalide Bullust 5 each §75.00 375.00 78 .00 N/A $390.00 $192.30 NIA $961.50
3-5 250 Waus Metl Lalide [ ight Bulb 5 each 510.50 $52 50 14 .50 N/A $72.50 $16 98 N/A $84 90
13-6 250 Watts Metal | lalide 1allost 5 cach 26.50 $132.50 64.40 NIA $322.00 $13037 N/A $651 85
3-7 150 Watts Metal i lalide Light Bulb 5 wuh $10.75 $53.75 15.90 $79.50 $16.63 N/A $83.13
3-8 150 Walts Metal Lialide ullast 5 cach $31.50 $157 50 6590 $329 50 $118.00 N/A $590 .00
1,2 70 Watts: Motal 1 lalide Light Thlbs 5 cach 12.75 $63.75 15.90 $79.50 $16.62 N/A $83.10
1310 70 Watis Metal 1Hulide Bullast 35 eash 26 A0 132.00 $49 50 $247.50 $67.51 N/A 137 55
GRAND TOTAL CATEGORY C $2.083.25 $2 465 .50 $4 076 88
IGRAND TOTAL CATEGORYA+B+C: $24 276.35 $45.144.50 $25,079.48
MISC. DISCOUNT OFF LIST PRICE 75% OFF 156% OFF 5% QFF
IXDDENDUM RECEIV 7 Addendum 1 & 2 Addendum 1 Addendum 1
|SPECIFICATION CHTERJA 4 Responsive & Responsible

RECOMMENDED'AWA
A

| HEREBY RTIFY/TH TOBE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED:,

Y- 1208
Pg.2 PEDRD HINOJOSA WERATIONS DIRECTOR DATE

o/
7 /oA

ROBERT ASING DIRECTOR

Awarded by Commissioners' Court
on 04/22/25





