ANNUAL BIDS - ROAD MACHINERY RENTAL # 1710
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON MAY 28, 2025, AT 3:00 P.M.

FROM: JUNE 4, 2025 TO: JUNE 5, 2026 W/OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL.
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TABULATION

COOPERATIVE OF AMERICA (PCA) CONTRACT #PCA-0D-420-26

BIDDER'S NAME ANDERSON EQUIPMENT COMPANY BIG D TDRACTOR CO. LLC DBA BLUE CAT
AND 700 W. INTERSTATE 2 711 E. NOLANA LOOP
ADDRESS PHARR, TX 78577 PHARR, TX 78577
DESCRIPTION (956)781-5895 (956)454-0123
ADDITIONAL ADDITIONAL
LY C
DALY | WEEKLY | MONTHLY ll)\‘;!rER c?r?g Rz‘;‘;nnlf DALY | WEEKLY | MONTHLY 2’;‘;;’:8,?; R‘é';'gbﬁ’:‘(
MONTH- MONTH-
PR/DAY PRI/DAY
A. EXCAVATOR - CAT 3200R EQUIVALENT NOBID | $2,000.00 | $ 5.950.00| NOBID | NOBID |$ 733.33 | $2.200.00 | $ 6.600.00 | $ _ 733.00 | NO BID
B. EXCAVATOR - CAT 330 OR EQUIVALENT NOBID | $3.000.00 | 5 8500.00| NOBID | NOBID |$ 1.063.33 | $3.190.00 | $ 9.510.00 | § 1.063.33 | NO BID
C. ROLLER CAPACITY 84" DRUM (12-13 TON) NOBID | §1.850.00 | § 550000 | NOBID | NOBID |§ 544.44 | $1,633.33 | $ 4.900.00 | 3 544.44 | NO BID
D. ROLLER (12-13) TON NOBID | §2.000.00 | 6.000.00| NOBID | NOBID |§ 54444 | $163333 |$ 4.900.00 | § 544.44 | NO BID
E, ROLLER 78" - 84"WIDTH DRUM (10-13) TON NOBID | $2.000.00 | $ 6.00000| NOBID | NOBID |$ 54444 | $1,633.33 | 5 4.900.00 | $ 544.44 | NO BID
F. ROLLER 50" - 60" WIDTH DRUM (6-4) TON NOBID | $1.200.00 | $ 3.600.00] NOBID | NOBID |S 488.89 | $1.466.67 | $ 4.400.00 | 5 488.89 | NO BID
G. ROLLER 78"- 84" WIDTH DRUM (10-13) TON NOBID | $1.700.00 | $ 5.00000| NOBID | NOBID |§ 544.44 | $1.633.33 | § 4.900.00 | § 544.44 | NO BID
H. MOTOR GRADER CAPACITY 27,000 Op. Wt./Lb. & 12{ NOBID | §4.000.00 | $12.000.00| NOBID | NOBID |§$ 744.44 | $2.233.33 | $ 6.700.00 | 3 744.44 | NO BID
I. BACHOE CAPCITY 23,800 Op. Wt./LB. S7THP NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID |$ 42222 | $1.26667 | $ 3.800.00 | § 42222 | NO BID
J. FRONT END LOADER 31,800 Op. WE/LB 172 HP NOBID | $2400.00| $ 7.00000| NOBID | NOBID |S 82500 | $2.475.00 | $ 7.425.00 | 825.00 | NO BID
K. BRUSH TRUCK NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID |$ 1.388.89 | $4,166.67 | $12.500.00 | $ 1.388.89 | NO BID
L. DUMP TRUCK NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID |§ 1.388.89 | $4.166.67 | §12.500.00 | § 1.388.89 | NO BID
M. WATER TRUCK NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NOBID |$ 494.44 | $1.483.33 | $ 4.450.00 | § _ 494.44 | NO BID
N. TOWING TRAILER NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NOBID |5 466.67 | 51,400.00 | $ 4.200.00 | §__ 466.67 | NO BID
0. TRACTOR MOWER WITH FLEX WING NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NOBID | NOBID
P. TRACTOR MOWER WITH SHREDDER NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NOBID | NOBID
Q. STREET SWEEPER NOBID | $1,000.00 | $ 3.00000| NOBID | NOBID |5 388.89| $1.166.67 | 5 3.500.00 | 5 388.89 | NO BID
R. OIL DISTRIBUTOR TRUCK NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID |3 1666.67 | $5.000.00 | $15.000.00 | 5 1.666.67 | NO BID

MISC % OFF LIST

0% DISCOUNT

0% DISCOUNT

SPECIFICATION CRITERIA

Responsive/Responsible

Responsive/Responsible

3% MAX. ANNUAL PRICE INCREASE.

Selection will be based on a combination;
1.Pricing

2.Product Availability
3.Frequency

AWARDED BY COMMISSIONERS' COURT ON 06/17/25
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TABULATION

ANNUAL BIDS - ROAD MACHINERY RENTAL # 1710
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON MAY 28, 2025, AT 3:00 P.M.

FROM: JUNE 4, 2025 TO: JUNE 5, 2026 W/OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL.

OMNIA PARTNERS CONTRACT #2019000318
BIDDER'S NAME EQUIPMENTSHARE HERC RENTALS INC.
AND 4952 LOGANS RUN CIRLE 27500 RIVERVIEW CENTER BLVD.
ADDRESS HARLINGEN, TX 78550 BONITA SPRINGS, FL 34134
DESCRIPTION (956)674-1413 {239)301-1344
ADDITIONAL ADDITIONAL
DAILY WEEKLY | MONTHLY %ﬁncgrfg R’(‘:'g;DEI’TAY DALY | WEEKLY | MONTHLY %'TLchc?ﬁg RAC':;D‘#Y
MONTH- MONTH-
PR/DAY PRIDAY

A. EXCAVATOR - CAT 3200R EQUIVALENT $810.00 | $2.185.00 | § 5495.00 | NOBID NOBID ||$ 1.384.25 | $2.864.50 | $§ 7.080.50 | § 1.384.25 | NO BID
B. EXCAVATOR - CAT 330 OR EQUIVALENT $1.022.00 | $2.584.00 | $ 6.760.00 | NO BID NOBID || 2.114.00 | $4.539.50 | $11.900.00 | $ 2.114.00 | NO BID
C. ROLLER CAPACITY 84" DRUM (12-13 TON) $628.00 | $1.629.00 | § 4.202.00 | NO BID NOBID ||$1.237.25|52688.35|% 567140 | § 1.237.25 | NO BID
D. ROLLER (12-13) TON - NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BiD NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
E, ROLLER 78" - 84"WIDTH DRUM (10-13) TON NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID
F. ROLLER 50" - 60" WIDTH DRUM (6-4) TON NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
G. ROLLER 78"- 84" WIDTH DRUM (10-13) TON $628.00 | $1.629.00 | $ 4,202.00 | NO BID NOBID |$ 1.064.00 | §2,266.25 | § 4.733.75| $ 1.064.00 | NO BID
H. MOTOR GRADER CAPACITY 27,000 Op. Wt./Lb. & 12 $1.881.00 | §4.553.00 | $10.745.00 | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
I. BACHOE CAPCITY 23,800 Op. Wt./LB. 97HP $341.00 | $ 919.00 | $ 2.053.00| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID
J. FRONT END LOADER 31,800 Op. Wt./LB 172 HP $782.00 | $2.311.00 | $ 5.436.00 | NOBID NOBID |[$ 1.540.70 | $3.389.75 | $ 9.569.00 | $ 1.540.70 | NO BID
K. BRUSH TRUCK NO BID NO BiD NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
L. DUMP TRUCK $751.00 | $2.542.00 | § 5.495.00 | NO BID NOBID |§ 1.127.00 | $2.922.50 | $ 6.072.50 | $ 1.127.00 | NO BID
M. WATER TRUCK $455.00 | $1,307.00 | $ 3.016.00| NOBID | NOBID [$ 93800 | $2,114.00 | § 3.736.25 | $  938.00 | NO BID
N. TOWING TRAILER NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |3 57575 $1.085.00 |8 1.92500|$ 575.75| NOBID
0. TRACTOR MOWER WITH FLEX WING NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
P. TRACTOR MOWER WITH SHREDDER NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Q. STREET SWEEPER $353.00 | $1.098.00 | § 2.450.00 | NO BID NOBID |$ 775.25| $1.410.50 | $ 3.255.28 | § 775.25 | NOBID
R. OIL DISTRIBUTOR TRUCK B NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BiD NO BID NO BID
MISC % OFF LIST , - 0% DISCOUNT 5% DISCOUNT

SPECIFICATION CRITERIA Mon-Responsive/Responsible = Responsive/Responsible

3% MAX. ANNUAL PRICE INCREASE.

Selection will be based on a combination;
1.Pricing

2.Product Availability

3.Frequency

AWARDED BY COMMISSIONERS® COURT ON 06/17/25
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ANNUAL BIDS - ROAD MACHINERY RENTAL # 1710
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON MAY 28, 2025, AT 3:00 P.M.

Page3of 3

TABULATION

FROM: JUNE 4, 2025 TO: JUNE 5, 2026 W/OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL.
BUYBOARD CONTRACT #740-24

BIDDER'S NAME NUECES POWER EQUIPMENT
AND 1 INDUSTRIAL WAY
ADDRESS SAN BENITO, TX 78586
DESCRIPTION (95612456372
ADDITIONAL
DAILY WEEKLY | MONTHLY %%‘cg:g R'(‘:':;D?;w
MONTH-
PRIDAY

A. EXCAVATOR - CAT 3200R EQUIVALENT $  700.00 | $2.300.00 | $ 6.300.00 |8 700.00| NO BID
B. EXCAVATOR - CAT 330 OR EQUIVALENT $ 1.100.00 | $3,300.00 | $ 9.900.00 | § 1.100.00 | NO BID
C. ROLLER CAPACITY 84" DRUM (12-13 TON) § 45000 | $1.377.00 | $ 413100 | $ 459.00 | NOBID
D. ROLLER (12-13) TON $ 47500 | $1.425.00 | $ 427500 | § 475.00| NOBID
E, ROLLER 78" - 84"WIDTH DRUM (10-13) TON $ 65250 | $1.95750 | § 587250 | § 652,50 | NO BID
F. ROLLER 50" - 60" WIDTH DRUM (6-4) TON $ 22950| § 68850 | § 2.06550 | % 229.50 NO BID
G. ROLLER 78"- 84" WIDTH DRUM (10-13) TON $ 42750 | $1.282.50 | § 3.847.50 | §  427.50 | NOBID
H. MOTOR GRADER CAPACITY 27,000 Op. Wt./Lb. & 124 § 750.00 | $2.250.00 | § 6.750.00 | §  750.00 | NO BID
I. BACHOE CAPCITY 23,800 Op. Wt./LB. 97HP $ 395.00 | $1,185.00 | § 3.555.00 | $  395.00 | NO BID
J. FRONT END LOADER 31,800 Op. Wt/LB 172 HP $ 787.50 | $2.362.50 | § 7.087.50 | $  787.50 | NO BID
K. BRUSH TRUCK NOBID | NOBID | NOBID |NOBID NO BID
L. DUMP TRUCK NOBID | NOBID | NOBID |NOBID NO BID
M. WATER TRUCK NOBID | NOBID | NOBID |NOBID NO BID
N. TOWING TRAILER NOBID | NOBID | NOBID |NOBID NO BID
0. TRACTOR MOWER WITH FLEX WING NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
P. TRACTOR MOWER WITH SHREDDER NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Q. STREET SWEEPER $ 350.00| $1.050.00| $ 3.150.00 | $§ 350.00 NO BID
R. OIL DISTRIBUTOR TRUCK NOBID | NOBID | NOBID |NOBID NO BID

MISC % OFF LIST

0% DISCOUNT

SPECIFICATION CRITERIA

Responsive/Responsihle

3% MAX. ANNUAL PRICE INCREASE.

1 HEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED.

Lo Boberts C. Luna Dalindbeca_

ROBERTO C. LUNA, PURCHASING AGENT DATE

PAEPARED 8 DLOERA

@/ M ¢/ Méf

CARLOS A. SXNCHEZ, PUBLIC WORKS D

Ton DATE

Selection will be based on a combination;
1.Pricing

2.Product Availability

3.Frequency

AWARDED BY COMMISSIONERS® COURT ON 06/17/25
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