e

TABULATION

ANNUAL BIDS # 2280-1 - GASOLINE/DIESEL FUEL - COUNTY & STORE SITES
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON JULY 10, 2024 AT 3:00 P.M.
FROM: OCTOBER 1, 2024 TO: SEPTEMBER 30, 2025 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE - EACH RENEWAL ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR.
PRICE INCREASES ALLOWED BASED ON O.P.I.S. INCREASES ONLY.

RENEW TO 11/30/26

| HEREBY CERTIF

VENDOR'S NAME A'LOEL PETROLEUM COMPANY, LLC CIRCLE K STORES, INC. OIL PATCH WEX BANK
& 290 N. 10TH ST. 1130 W. WARNER RD. 17716 STATE HWY 107 111 EAST SEGO LILY DRIVE, STE 250
ADDRESS BEAUMONT, TX 77702 TEMPLE, AZ 85284 COMBES, TX 78535 SANDY, UT 84070
DESCRIPTION (409)730-6595 (912)337-9915 {956)425-3931 (888)842-0075
OPTION 1 - OFIS + PRICE (commission.state tax and miscellaneous) COMMISSION AFTER (OPIS BASE+TAX=FREIGHT) GASOLINE COMMISSION AFTER (OPIS BASE+TAX=FREIGHT) GASOLINE
(OPIS=$N/A)+{Commission=$0.05)+(State Tax, - N
A1 |GASOLINE 87 OCTANE NO LEAD - ALL LOCATIONS - COUNTY SITES Freight, superfund, underground Fr(:i’F:'S‘Siz::S83;'(C‘;’:'"'Zs’°2'f:::_‘;)‘;'(zséa_';21':;-sa
fees=$0.50405)=50.55405 NO BID o S 20252 NO BID
(OPIS=$N/A)+(Commission=$0.06)+(Slale Tax,
A2 |GASOLINE 87 OCTANE NO LEAD - CONVENIENT STORE/OFF SITE Freight, superfund, underground NIA
fees=$0.53405)=50.59405 NO BID NO BID
COMMISSION AFTER (OPIS BASE+TAX=FREIGHT) DIESEL COMMISSION AFTER (OPIS BASE+TAX=FREIGHT) DIESEL
{OPIS=$N/A)*+(Commission=$0.08)+(State Tax, . Lo L
B1 |HIGH SULFUR (OFF ROAD) DIESEL - ALL LOCATIONS - COUNTY SITES Freight, superfund, underground ’(:Oe':."f“'? 6:;1”;@“’;’“'55“’";5[2'1"_);ésf‘;‘; ;;;‘1'
fees=$0.55405)=$0.63405 NO BID et ST, AT (e = NO BID
HIGH SULFUR (ON ROAD) DIESEL - COUNTY SITES & CONVENIENT (OPIS=8N/A)+(Commission=$0.07)+(Slafe Tax, (OPIS=$2 7094)+(Commission=$0.14)+(State Tax,
B2 | sToRE/OFF SITE Reiotfsuperitndunderground Freight, superfund, und d fees=$0.20)=$2.8494
fees=50.53405)=50.60405 NO BID (BT SR, M EEREE S (A0 NO BID
OFTION Il - RETAIL MINUS - PRICEICOMMISSION
DISCOUNT OFF RETAIL ‘Q
A1 |GASOLINE 87 OCTANE NO LEAD - ALL LOCATIONS - COUNTY SITES -0.0) N NO BID -0.03 NO BID
RETAIL PRICE MINUS $0.10 relail price minus $0 01 (0-499 gallons monthiy)
& PER GALLON DISCOUNT retail price minus $0.03 [500-2,998 gallons mont
FROM CIRCLE K SITES ONLY. i
A2 GASOLINE 87 OCTANE NO LEAD - CONVENIENT STORE/OFF SITE & DISCOUNT FROM WEX- NO BID
BANK 60 BASIS POINTS OFF X
é TOTAL PURCHASE retail price minus $0.08 (10,000+ gallons monthly)
w DISCOUNT OFF RETAIL PRICE @ all Valero 5,200 fuel
locations and 95% of all U.S. fueling locations
DISCOUNT OFF RETAIL Q
B1 [HIGH SULFUR {OFF ROAD) DIESEL - ALL LOCATIONS - COUNTY SITES == -0.001 NO BID -0.03 NO BID
& tetail price minus $0.01 (0-488 gallons monthi
ratail price minus $0.03 {500-2.999 gallons monthl
RFE’EQIEEEI_‘C:)E '\[")'Iggg S?\‘;o relail price minus $0.04 (3.000-4,999 gallons monthly)
FROM CIRCLE K SITES ONLY retall price minus $0.05 {5,000-6.999 gafions menthly)
N - ==L tall price minus $0.06 (7.000-9.999 galions monthi
B2 HIGH SULFUR (ON ROAD) DIESEL - CONVENIENT STORE/OFF SITE e 0.002 2 DISCOUNT FROM WEX NO BID w
BANK 60 BASIS POINTS OFF retail price minus $0.08 {10,000+ gallons montht
TOTAL PURCHASE
DISCOUNT OFF RETAIL PRICE @ all Valero 5,200 fuel
locations and 95% of all U.S. fueling locations
i o e allan - If the County awards fuel supply for County siles —
Category A lo low bidder olher lhan Convenience Slore — Category B (successful bidder) - what will
Category B bidder charge as an administrative fee lo provide / include Cameron County fuel sites ~
Category A in its’ manthly reports_ using exising Cameron Counly provided equipment 0.59405 NIA -0- -0-
Specificalion Criteria RESPONSIVE BID WITHDRAWAL RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE

/ot

PRIMARY
SECONDARY

Prepared by Roberto C Luna

Awarded by Commissioners Court

08/27/2024





