ANNUAL BID #2660 - UNIFORMS: SHERIFF'S / JAILER/ INMATES.
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON JUNE 25, 2025 AT 3:00PM
FROM: AWARD DATE TO: JUNE 30, 2026 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR W/ EACH RENEWAL.

BIDDER'S NAME

ACME SUPPLY CO., LTD

Charm-Tex

One World Marketing, LLC

AND YEARLY | 10 CEDAR SWAMP RD. STE. 7 1618 Coney Island Ave. 5456 Enchanted Path
ADDRESS APPROX GLEN COVE, NY 11542 : Brooklyn, NY 11230 Brownsville, TX 78526
DESCRIPTION (800)567-8025 : - — | (718)-252-8100 (956)-299-9919
QTY. UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE| UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE _TOTAL PRICE
A. INMATE COVERALLS & UNIFORMS
A-1. COVERALLS
White, Dark Blue S-XL 70 $15.00 $1,050.00 $14.50 $1,015.00 $14.89 $1,042.30 $29.50 $2,065.00
White, Dark Blue 2X 5 $15.00 $75.00 $14.50 $72.50 $14.89 $29.75 $29.50 $147.50
Orange. Green S-XL 600 $15.00 $9,000.00 $14.50 $8,700.00 $14.89 $8.934.00 $29.50 $17.700.00
Orange, Green 2X 100 $15.00 $1.500.00 $14.50 $1.450.00 $14.89 $1.489.00 $29.50 $2.950.00
Red, Silver, Tan S-XL 15 $15.00 $225.00 $14.50 $217.50 $14.89 $223.35 $29.50 $442.50
Red, Silver, Tan 2X 10 $15.00 $150.00 $14.50 $145.00 $14.89 $148.90 $29.50 $295.00
A-2. V-NECK SHIRTS
Orange. Red. Green S-2X 10 $6.00 $60.00 $6.75 $67.50 $6.72 $67.20 $13.50 $135.00
White, Blue. Silver, Tan S-2X 150 $6.00 $900.00 $6.75 $1.012.50 $6.72 $1.008.00 $13.50 $2.025.00
A-3. WORK PANTS (ELASTIC)

Orange, Red, Green (S-2X) S-2X 10 $7.00 $70.00 $7.58 $75.80 $6.84 $68.40 $13.50 $135.00
White, Blue, Silver, Tan (S-2X) S-2X 150 $7.00 $1,050.00 $7.58 $1,137.00 $6.84 $1,026.00 $13.50 $2.025.00

A. TOTAL $14.080.00 $13,892.80 $14,036,90 $27,920.00
B. INMATE SHOWER SANDALS 2000 NO BID $0.00 2.35 $4,700.00 $2.79 $5,580.00 $5.25 $10,250.00
DELIVERY PERIOD AFTER 5 DAYS =Lt oo e i 30 DAYS

RECEIPT OF ORDERS: seraenad jumpsuita/shids/irousers 7 lhrou‘gh 30

WARRANTY PERIOD OF ALL STANDARD 1 Year agains workmanship or fabir defecls

CLOTHING (BY CATEGORY)

30 Days Satisfaction

1 Year Frre of Mtg Defects

All Catagoaries (A-1 toA-3,B)

MISCELLANEOUS DISCOUNT

20%

15%

10%

5%

Responsive/Responsible

Responsive/Responsible

Responsive/Responsible

Responsive/Responsible




ANNUAL BID #2660 - UNIFORMS: SHERIFF'S / JAILER/ INMATES.
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON JUNE 25, 2025 AT 3:00PM
FROM: AWARD DATE TO: JUNE 30, 2026 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR W/ EACH RENEWAL.

Primary

secononRy

BIDDER'S NAME

Green Mountain Knitting

Hard Times Products

ICS Jail Supplies ,Inc

Mini Wing

AND YEARLY 25 Jonergin Dr 324 Broad St PO BOX 21056 2516 Via Teson Ste 216
ADDRESS APPROX Swanton ,Vermont 05488 Rome,GA 30161 Waco, TX 76702 P.V.E. CA 90274
DESCRIPTION (706)413-4614 (800)524-5427 (424)558-3867
QTYy. UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE
A. INMATE COVERALLS & UNIFORMS
A-1. COVERALLS
White, Dark Blue S-XL 70 $17.33 $1.213.10 $15.66 $4,384.80 $24.79 $1,735.30 $11.29 $790.3¢
White, Dark Blue 2X 5 $20.45 $102.25 $15.66 $78.30 $24.79 $123.95 $11.29 $56.45
Orange, Green S-XL 600 $17.33 $10.398.00 $15.66 $37.584.00 $24.79 $14.874.00 $11.29 $6.774.00
Orange. Green 2X 100 $20.45 $2,045.00 $15.66 $1,566.00 $24.79 $2,479.00 $11.29 $1.129.00
Red, Silver, Tan S-XL 15 $17.33 $259.95 $15.66 $939.60 $24.79 $371.85 $1129 $169.35
Red, Silver, Tan 2X 10 $20.45 $204.50 $15.66 $156.60 $24.79 $247.90 $11.29 $1.129.00
A-2. V-NECK SHIRTS
Orange, Red, Green S-2X 10 $8.74 $87.40 $6.55 $327.50 $11.75 $117.50 $5.49 $54.90
White, Blue, Silver, Tan S-2X 150 $6.74 $1.311.00 $6.55 $4,912.50| $11.75 $1,762.50 $5.49 $823.50
A-3. WORK PANTS (ELASTIC)
Orange. Red, Green (S-2X) $-2X 10 $9.21 $92.10 $6.88 $344.00 $11.25 $112.50 $5.79 $57.90
White. Blue, Silver, Tan (S-2X) S§-2X 150 $9.21 $13.815.00 $6.88 $5,160.00 $11.25 $1.687.50 $5.79 $868.50
A. TOTAL $29.528.30 $55.453.30 $23.512.00 $11.852.90
B. INMATE SHOWER SANDALS 2000 NO BID NO BID $86.73 $173.460.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00
DELIVERY PERIOD AFTER
3 Week 0-30D 30-60 Days ARO 60-90 Days ARO
RECEIPT OF ORDERS: eexs = =k >
|
WARRANTY PERIOD OF ALL N/A Any Defective Item , ICS will replace/repair without charge N/A
CLOTHING (BY CATEGORY) will be covered by HTP due to manufacturing defects
MISCELLANEOUS DISCOUNT N/A 0% 10% 0%
Responsive/Responsible Responsive/Responsible Respaonsive/Responsible Responsive/Responsible




ANNUAL BID #2660 - UNIFORMS: SHERIFF'S / JAILER! INMATES.
AS PER BIOS RECEIVED ON JUNE 25, 2025 AT 3:00PM

FROM: AWARD DATE TO: JUNE 30, 2026 W OPTY

ON TO RENEW ONCE OR TWACE ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR W/ EACH RENEWAL

BIDDER'S NAME Pride Enterprises Protecktiv LLC Texas FR Supply Victory Supply ,LLC
AND YEARLY 1463 Oakfield Dr, #126 9223 Fury Landing Ln 120 Cartwright Park Rd. Ste 102 7026 Indusirial Park Rd
ADDRESS APPROX Brandon, Florida 33511 Tomball, Texas 77375 Weatherford, TX 76088 Mount Pleasant, TN 38474
DESCRIPTION (770)876-8458 (682)290-6150 (888)376-1205
Qry. UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE__ | TOTAL PRICE | UNITPRICE | TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE
A. INMATE COVERALLS & UNIFORMS
A-1. COVERALLS
White, Dark Blue S-XL 70 $15.00 | $1,050.00 $13.35 $934.50! $53 00 $3.710.00 $14,97 $1,047.90
White, Dark Blue 2X § 81545 $77.25 $13658 $68.25 $53.00 $265.00 $14,97 $74 85
Orange, Green $-XL €00 $15.00 $9.000.00 $1335 $8.010.00 $53.00 $31.800.00) $14.97 $8,982.00|
Orange, Green 2X 100 $1545 $1.545.00 $13.55 $1,355.00 $53.00 $5.300.00 $14.87 $1,487.00
IRed, Silver, Tan S-XL 15 $15.00 $225.00 $1335 $200 25| $53 00 $795.00 NO BID NO BID
Red, Silver, Tan 2X 10 $15.45 $154 50 $13.865 $136 50 $53 00 $530 00 NO BID NO BID
A-2. V-NECK SHIRTS I
Orange, Red, Green S-2X 10 $8.38 $83.80 $4.95 $49.50 $32.00 $330 00 $6.34 $53 40
White, Blue, Silver, Tan S-2X 150 $8.38 $1.257.00 $4 95 $742.50 $33.00 $4.650 00/ $634 $951.00)
A-3. WORK PANTS (ELASTIC)
Orange, Red, Green (S-2X) S-2X 10 $8.38 $83 80 $520 $52.00 33500 $350 00 36 99 $69.90!
White. Blue, Sitver. Tan (S-2X) 5-2X 150 $8.38 $1.257.00 $5.20 $780.00 $35.00 3$5.250.00 X $1,048.00
e e 3
A TOTAL 314,733 35 $12.328 50 $53,280.00 $13,734,05
B. INMATE SHOWER SANDALS 2000 NO BID NO BID §3.85 $7,700.00 $6.50 $13,000.00 $2.44 $4 880.00
DREIE-:.:,EEI:’IY' gE'ggg—-———EARFgER 45 DAYS (ARO} 1st Order 60-750ays. There after 7 days 181 Order 45 Days, 14 Oays ther afler 7-10 Days ARO
WARRANTY PERIOD OF ALL 100% Satisfaction Guarenteed
CLOTHING (BY CATEGORY] _ = ki e o Gledly Refund Defectve Product
MISCELLANEQUS-ATSE£0UNT 0% 20% 10% 15%
; ; ; [/ Responsive/Responsible Responsive/Responsible Responsive/Responsible Responsive/Responsible

AWARDED BY COMMISSIONERS' COURT 08/12/25

CREATED Y AKTHONY





