ANNUAL BID #1700 - RENTAL EQUIPMENT SERVICES (EVENTS)
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON JULY 16, 2025 AT 3:00 P.M.

TABULATION

FROM: AUGUST 2, 2025 TO: JULY 31, 2026 W/OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE - EACH RENEWAL ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR .

VENDOR'S NAME UNITED RENTALS INC COASTAL EVENT RENTALS LLC
& P.O. BOX 840514 31047 HWY 100
ADDRESS DALLAS,TX 75284 LOS FRESNOS, TX 78566
(877)874-4468 {956) 434-2586
DESCRIPTION

A) 65KVA Prime output, portable trailer-towable Diesel Generator:

1. ONE (1) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 8 HOURS OF USAGE PER DAY) $1,418.76 NO BID

2. TWO (2) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 16 HOURS OF USAGE FOR BOTH TWO DAYS) $1,836.00 NO BID

3. THREE (3) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 24 HOURS OF USAGE FOR ALL THREE DAYS) $2,152.00 NO BID

B) 125KVA Prime output, portable trailer-towable Diesel Generator:

1_ONE (1) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 8 HOURS OF USAGE PER DAY) $1,598.08 NO BID

2 TWO (2) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 16 HOURS OF USAGE FOR BOTH TWO DAYS) $2,194.00 NO BID

3. THREE (3) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 24 HOURS OF USAGE FOR ALL THREE DAYS) $2,197.00 NO BID

C) -8 KW Portable trailer-towable Telescopic Light Tower 29 ft Minimum Height:

[1. ONE (1) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 8 HOURS OF USAGE PER DAY) NO BID $250.00

2. TWO (2) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 16 HOURS OF USAGE FOR BOTH TWO DAYS) NO BID $375.00

3. THREE (3) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 24 HOURS OF USAGE FOR ALL THREE DAYS) NO BID $500.00
I

D) 41,000 BTU Upright Propane Outdoor Heater:

1. ONE (1) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 8 HOURS OF USAGE PER DAY) NO BID $175.00

2. TWO (2) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 16 HOURS OF USAGE FOR BOTH TWO DAYS) NO BID $250.00

3. THREE (3) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 24 HOURS OF USAGE FOR ALL THREE DAYS) NO BID $350.00

E) Interlocking Steel crowd control Barricades: 8FT SECTIONS

1. ONE (1) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 8 HOURS OF USAGE PER DAY) NO BID $20,00

2. TWO (2) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 16 HOURS OF USAGE FOR BOTH TWO DAYS) NO BID $30.00

3. THREE (3) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN, 24 HOURS OF USAGE FOR ALL THREE DAYS) NO BID $40.00

F) Interlocking Plastic crowd control Barricades: 6FT SECTIONS

1. ONE (1) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 8 HOURS OF USAGE PER DAY} NO BID NO BID

2. TWO (2) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 16 HOURS OF USAGE FOR BOTH TWO DAYS) NO BID NO BID

3. THREE (3) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 24 HOURS OF USAGE FOR ALL THREE DAYS) NO BID NO BID
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ANNUAL BID #1700 - RENTAL EQUIPMENT SERVICES (EVENTS)
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON JULY 16, 2025 AT 3:00 P.M.

TABULATION

FROM: AUGUST 2, 2025 TO: JULY 31, 2026 W/OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE - EACH RENEWAL ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR .

VENDOR'S NAME

UNITED RENTALS INC

COASTAL EVENT RENTALS LLC

& P.O. BOX 840514 31047 HWY 100
ADDRESS DALLAS, TX 75284 LOS FRESNOS, TX 78566
(877)874-4468 (956) 434-2586
DESCRIPTION
G) Temporary Perimeter Chain-link Fence Panels:
1. ONE (1) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 8 HOURS OF USAGE PER DAY) NO BID $20.00
2. TWO (2) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 16 HOURS OF USAGE FOR BOTH TWO DAYS) NO BID $20.00
3. THREE (3) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 24 HOURS OF USAGE FOR ALL THREE DAYS) NO BID $20.00
H} Rectangular Folding Banquet Table: 6x30
1. ONE (1) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 8 HOURS OF USAGE PER DAY) NO BID $15.00
2. TWO (2) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN, 16 HOURS OF USAGE FOR BOTH TWO DAYS) NO BID $25.00
3, THREE (3) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN, 24 HOURS OF USAGE FOR ALL THREE DAYS) NO BID $30.00
1) _Rectangular Folding Classroom Table: 6x18
1. ONE (1) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 8 HOURS OF USAGE PER DAY) NO BID $20.00
2_TWO (2) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 16 HOURS OF USAGE FOR BOTH TWO DAYS) NO BID $30.00
3. THREE (3) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN, 24 HOURS OF USAGE FOR ALL THREE DAYS) NO BID $35,00
J} Metal Foldable chair (event chair}: White Color
1. ONE (1) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 8 HOURS OF USAGE PER DAY) NO BID $3.00
2 TWO (2) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 16 HOURS OF USAGE FOR BOTH TWO DAYS) NO BID $4.00
3. THREE (3) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 24 HOURS OF USAGE FOR ALL THREE DAYS) NO BID $5.00
K) Metal Foldable chair (event chair): Black or Black Color
1. ONE (1) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 8 HOURS OF USAGE PER DAY) NO BID $2.00
2. TWO (2) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 16 HOURS OF USAGE FOR BOTH TWO DAYS) NO BID $3.00
3. THREE (3) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN, 24 HOURS OF USAGE FOR ALL THREE DAYS) NO BID $4.00
L) Frame/Cable Tent: 10x20
1. ONE (1) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 8 HOURS OF USAGE PER DAY) NO BID §350.00
2. TWO (2) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 16 HOURS OF USAGE FOR BOTH TWO DAYS) NO BID $400.00
3. THREE (3) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 24 HOURS OF USAGE FOR ALL THREE DAYS) NO BID $450,00
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TABULATION

ANNUAL BID #1700 - RENTAL EQUIPMENT SERVICES (EVENTS)
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON JULY 16, 2025 AT 3:00 P.M.

FROM: AUGUST 2, 2025 TO: JULY 31, 2026 W/OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE - EACH RENEWAL ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR .

VENDOR'S NAME UNITED RENTALS INC COASTAL EVENT RENTALS LLC
& P.0. BOX 840514 |31 047 HWY 100
ADDRESS DALLAS,TX 75284 LOS FRESNOS, TX 78566
(877)874-4488 (956) 434-2586
DESCRIPTION
M) Frame/Cable Tent: 20x20
1 ONE (1) DAY RENTAL {BASED UPON MIN. 8 HOURS OF USAGE PER DAY) NO BID $400.00
2 TWO (2) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 16 HOURS OF USAGE FOR BOTH TWO DAYS) NO BID $450.00
3 THREE (3) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN, 24 HOURS OF USAGE FOR ALL THREE DAYS) NO BID $500.00
N) Frame & Anchor Tant: 1010
1 ONE (1) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 8 HOURS OF USAGE PER DAY) NO BID $200.00
2. TWO (2) DAY RENTAL [BASED UPON MIN. 16 HOURS OF USAGE FOR BOTH TWO DAYS) NO BID $250.00
3. THREE (3) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 24 HOURS OF USAGE FOR ALL THREE DAYS) NO BID $300.00
©0) Frame & Anchor Tant: 20620
1, ONE (1) DAY RENTAL [BASED UPON MIN. B HOURS OF USAGE PER DAY) NO BID $400.00
2 TWO (2) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 18 HOURS OF USAGE FOR BATH TWO DAYS) NO BID $450.00
3 THREE (3) DAY RENTAL (BASED UPON MIN. 24 HOURS OF USAGE FOR ALL THREE DAYS) NO BID $500.00
IMISCELLANEOUS RENTALS: PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT FROM VENDOR'S RENTAL CATALOG LIST 0% 10%

| HEREBY CERTIFY THE A & T4 PP #eORRECT BIDS RECEIVED:

ROBERTO : DATE " [
PBERTS S 7 - é 2-202 %5
/fw CARLOS HINOJOSR , DIRECTOR OF MARKETING AMPHITHEATRE DATE

Propared by AV
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