BID # 251201 - PURCHASE OF VEHICLES FOR CAMERON COUNTY DEPARTMENTS
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON December 10, 2025 AT 3:00 P.M.

Primary
Secondary

Tertiary

TIPS 240901

BuyBoard 724-23

VEHICLE DESCRIPTION:

BOGGUS TIPTON MOTORS,LLC

5780 N. Expressway 77/83
Brownsville,TX 78526
Rep- Victor Esoindola

956-410-0079

Boswell Elliff Ford

1401 W Bys Hw 77
San Benito, TX 78586
Rep- Robert Garcia
956-3999-2468

Caldwell Country Chevrolet II,LLC

800 E Hwy 21
Caldwell, TX 77836
Rep- Karen Cole
979-429-8844

Grapevine DCJ, LLC
2601 William Tate
Grapevine ,TX 26051
Rep-Dennis Thomas
817-410-7541

Gullo Ford of Conroe
925 1-45 South
Conroe ,TX 77301
Rep- Gary Adams
956-756-5500

CATEGORY A 2025 or Newer Mid-size Pickup truck, Crew Cab (4 doors), 2WD, Long Bed -Alternate Bid NO BID 2026 Ford Ranger / Maverick 2026 Chevy Colorado NO BID 2025 Ford Ranger
2025 or Newer Mid-size Pickup truck, Crew Cab (4 doors), 2WD, Regular Bed NO BID $31,002 / $27,995 $34,300.00 NO BID $34,545.00
2025 or Newer Mid-size Pickup truck, Crew Cab (4 doors), 2WD, Long Bed NO BID No Bid $34,300.00 NO BID NO BID
Alternate: 2025 or Newer Mid-size Pickup truck, Crew Cab (4 doors), 4x4, Regular Bed NO BID $34,231 / $28,350 $37,300.00 NO BID $37,845.00
2025 or Newer Mid-size Pickup truck, Crew Cab (4 doors), 4x4, Long Bed NO BID No Bid $37,300.00 NO BID NO BID
DELIVERY 45-50 Days 60-90 Days 120-150 Days NO BID 120 Days
CATEGORY B 2025 or Newer 1/4 Ton (1500) Single (2 door) and/or Crew Cab (4 door), Reg. or Long Bed, 2WD or 4x4, V6 or V8 2026 Dodge Ram 1500 2026 Ford 150 XL 2026 Chevrolet 1500 Silverado 2026 RAM 1500 2026 Ford F150 XL
2025 or Newer FULL-Size, 1/4 Ton, Single Cab (2 doors), 2WD, Regular Bed, Pickup Truck V6 NO BID NO BID $34,900.00 NO BID NO BID
2025 or Newer FULL-Size, 1/4 Ton, Single Cab (2 doors), 2WD, Long Bed, Pickup Truck V6 NO BID $37,775.00 $35,200.00 NO BID $35,890.00
2025 or Newer FULL-Size, 1/4 Ton, Single Cab (2 doors), 4X4, Regular Bed, Pickup Truck V6 NO BID NO BID $38,900.00 NO BID NO BID
2025 or Newer FULL-Size, 1/4 Ton, Single Cab (2 doors), 4x4, Long Bed, Pickup Truck V6 NO BID $38,300.00 $39,200.00 NO BID $40,100.00
2025 or Newer FULL-Size, 1/4 Ton, Single Cab (2 doors), 2WD, Regular Bed, Pickup Truck V8 NO BID $35,600.00 NO BID NO BID $37,880.00
2025 or Newer FULL-Size, 1/4 Ton, Single Cab (2 doors), 2WD, Long Bed, Pickup Truck V8 NO BID $35,800.00 $38,200.00 NO BID $37,950.00
2025 or NewerFULL-Size, 1/4 Ton, Single Cab (2 doors), 4X4, Regular Bed, Pickup Truck V8 NO BID $40,200.00 $42,400.00 NO BID $41,990.00
2025 or Newer FULL-Size, 1/4 Ton, Single Cab (2 doors), 4x4, Long Bed, Pickup Truck V8 NO BID $40,380.00 $42,500.00 NO BID $42,170.00
2025 or Newer FULL-Size, 1/4 Ton, Crew Cab (4 doors), 2WD, Regular Bed, Pickup Truck V6 $41,331.00 $38,900.00 $38,000.00 $38,600.00 $41,050.00
2025 or Newer FULL-Size, 1/4 Ton, Crew Cab (4 doors), 2WD, Long Bed, Pickup Truck V6 $41,970.00 NO BID $38,300.00 NO BID NO BID
2025 or NewerFULL-Size, 1/4 Ton, Crew Cab (4 doors), 4X4, Regular Bed, Pickup Truck V6 $44,134.00 $42,350.00 $41,000.00 $42,300.00 $44,220.00
2025 or Newer FULL-Size, 1/4 Ton, Crew Cab (4 doors), 4x4, Long Bed, Pickup Truck V6 $45,519.00 NO BID $41,300.00 NO BID $46,680.00
2025 or Newer FULL-Size, 1/4 Ton, Crew Cab (4 doors), 2WD, Regular Bed, Pickup Truck V8 NO BID $40,800.00 $41,000.00 $40,211.00 $43,120.00
2025 or Newer FULL-Size, 1/4 Ton, Crew Cab (4 doors), 2WD, Long Bed, Pickup Truck V8 NO BID NO BID $41,300.00 $41,633.00 NO BID
2025 or Newer FULL-Size, 1/4 Ton, Crew Cab (4 doors), 4X4, Regular Bed, Pickup Truck V8 NO BID $44,400.00 $44,000.00 $43,915.00 $46,280.00
2025 or Newer FULL-Size, 1/4 Ton, Crew Cab (4 doors), 4x4, Long Bed, Pickup Truck V8 NO BID $44,850.00 $44,300.00 $45,335.00 $46,790.00
Alternate Option Commercial Bed Camper
Regular Bed No Bid $3,900.00 $5,500.00 NO BID NO BID
Long Bed No Bid $4,500.00 $5,500.00 NO BID NO BID
DELIVERY: 45-50 Days 60-90 Days 120-150 Days 70-90 Days 120 Days
CATEGORY C 2025 or Newer 3/4 Ton (2500) Crew Cab, Regular & Long Bed, 4x4 & 2WD, Gas & Diesel Engine 2026 Dodge Ram 2500 2026 Ford 250 no bid 2026 2500 RAM 2025 Ford 250
2025 or Newer 3/4 Ton, Crew Cab (4 doors), 2WD, Regular Bed, Pickup Truck ,GAS $43,485.00 $45,850.00 NO BID $44,361.00 $48,130.00
2025 or Newer , 3/4 Ton, Crew Cab (4 doors), 4X4, Regular Bed, Pickup Truck GAS $46,137.00 $48,400.00 NO BID $46,765.00 $50,710.00
2025 or Newer , 3/4 Ton, Crew Cab (4 doors), 2WD, Long Bed, Pickup Truck ,GAS $43,666.00 $46,000.00 NO BID $44,561.00 $48,310.00
2025 or Newer , 3/4 Ton, Crew Cab (4 doors), 4x4, Long Bed, Pickup Truck ,GAS $46,318.00 $48,600.00 NO BID $46,965.00 $50,900.00
2025 or Newer , 3/4 Ton, Crew Cab (4 doors), 2WD, Regular Bed, Pickup Truck ,DIESEL $54,698.00 $55,350.00 NO BID $55,574.00 $57,840.00
2025 or Newer, 3/4 Ton, Crew Cab (4 doors), 4X4, Regular Bed, Pickup Truck, DIESEL $57,350.00 $57,860.00 NO BID $55,978.00 $60,415.00
2025 or Newer , 3/4 Ton, Crew Cab (4 doors), 2WD, Long Bed, Pickup Truck, DIESEL $54,879.00 $55,500.00 NO BID $55,774.00 $58,020.00
2025 or Newer , 3/4 Ton, Crew Cab (4 doors), 4x4, Long Bed, Pickup Truck, DIESEL $57,531.00 $58,100.00 NO BID $58,178.00 $60,610.00
Alternate Option 2025 or Newer 3/4 Ton Super Crew Cab ,4x4,Short Bed,Diesel ,Carpet Floors and Cloth Seats $57,350.00 $62,150.00 NO BID NO BID
Alternate Option Include 20 in Aluminum Wheels All Terrain Radials $69,450.00 NO BID NO BID
DELIVERY 45-50 Days 1-Jun-25 NO BID 75-100 Days 120 Days

AWARDED BY COMMISSIONERS COURT ON 12/30/25




BID # 251201 - PURCHASE OF VEHICLES FOR CAMERON COUNTY DEPARTMENTS
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON December 10, 2025 AT 3:00 P.M.

BOGGUS TIPTON MOTORS,LLC

5780 N. Expressway 77/83
Brownsville, TX 78526

Boswell Elliff Ford

1401 W Bys Hw 77
San Benito, TX 78586

Caldwell Country Chevrolet II,LLC

800 E Hwy 21
Caldwell, TX 77836

Grapevine DCJ, LLC
2601 William Tate

Grapevine ,TX 26051

Gullo Ford of Conroe
925 1-45 South
Conroe ,TX 77301

Primary Rep- Victor Esoindola Rep- Robert Garcia Rep- Karen Cole Rep-Dennis Thomas Rep- Gary Adams
VEHICLE DESCRIPTION: S:C‘:dary 956-410-0079 956-3999-2468 979-429-8844 817-410-7541 956-756-5500
ertiary
CATEGORY D 2025 or Newer 1 Ton, Single & Crew Cab, Long Bed, 2WD & 4x4, Dual Rear Wheels (Dully) - Service Body Flat Bed Opt. 2026 Dodge Ram 3500 2026 Ford F350 XL NO BID 2026 RAM 3500
2025 or Newer 1 Ton, Single Cab, Long Bed, 2WD, regular rear wheels , vinyl floor & seats, Diesel Engine $40,497.00 $51,800.00 NO BID NO BID $54,495.00
2025 or Newer 1 Ton, Single Cab, Long Bed, 2WD, dual rear wheels (Dully), vinyl floor & seats, Diesel Engine $41,828.00 $53,089.00 NO BID NO BID $55,870.00
2025 or Newer 1 Ton, Crew Cab, Long Bed, 2WD, regular rear wheels, vinyl floor & seats, Diesel Engine $55,165.00 $56,400.00 NO BID $55,421.00 $59,370.00
2025 or Newer 1 Ton, Crew Cab, Long Bed, 2WD, dual rear wheels (Dully), vinyl floor & seats, Diesel Engine $56,496.00 $57,400.00 NO BID $56,797.00 $60,260.00
2025 or Newer 1 Ton, Single Cab, Long Bed, 4x4, regular rear wheels ), vinyl floor & seats, Diesel Engine $54,361.00 $54,750.00 NO BID NO BID $57,460.00
2025 or Newer 1 Ton, Single Cab, Long Bed, 4X4, dual rear wheels (Dully), vinyl floor & seats, Diesel Engine $55,692.00 $55,960.00 NO BID NO BID $58,795.00
2025 or Newer 1 Ton, Crew Cab, Long Bed, 4x4, regular rear wheels, vinyl floor & seats, Diesel Engine $57,815.00 $59,450.00 NO BID $58,289.00 $62,330.00
2025 or Newer 1 Ton, Crew Cab, Long Bed, 4x4, dual rear wheels (Dully), vinyl floor & seats, Diesel Engine $59,147.00 $60,750.00 NO BID $59,665.00 $63,660.00
Alternate Service Truc{1 Ton, Crew Cab,Flat Bed, Service Body Option,4x4, Diesel,Dual rear wheels,vinyl floor $74,885.00 $81,000.00 NO BID
DELIVERY 45-50 Days 60-90 Days NO BID 75-100 Days 120 Days
CATEGORY E 2025 or Newer Full Size SUV, 2WD & 4x4, Regular & Long Wheel Base (must seat a minimum of 8 people), Gas Engine 2026 Jeep Grand Wagoneer 2026 Ford Expedition 2025 Chevy Tahoe/Suburban 2026 Jeep GrandWagoneer | 2025 Ford Expedition
2025 or Newer Full Size SUV, 2WD, Regular Wheel Base $57,938.00 $56,450.00 $63,500.00 $60,093.00 $59,650.00
2025 or Newer Full Size SUV, 2WD, Long Wheel Base $60,725.00 $59,200.00 $65,900.00 $62,940.00 $62,450.00
2025 or Newer Full Size SUV, 4x4, Regular Wheel Base $61,508.00 $59,200.00 $66,500.00 $63,663.00 $62,450.00
2025 or Newer Full Size SUV, 4x4, Long Wheel Base $65,248.00 $61,950.00 $68,500.00 $67,403.00 $65,240.00
DELIVERY 45-50 Days 60-90 Days 90-120 Days 75-120 Days 150
. 2026 Ford Transit 15
CATEGORY F 2025 or NewerFull Size 15 people capacity Passenger Transit Van, 2WD, (High Roof Alternate Option), Gas Engine NOBID 2026 Transit T350 NO BID NO BID Passenger
2025 or Newer Full size 15 people capacity passenger van, 2WD, Side slide door, regular roof, Gas engine NO BID $55,250.00 NO BID NO BID $57,551.00
Alternate 2025 or Newer Full size 15 people capacity passenger van, 2WD, Side slide door, Gas engine, High Roof Alternate NO BID $56,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
DELIVERY 60-90 Days NO BID NO BID 180 Days
CATEGORY G 2025 or Newer Medium Size Cargo Van, 2WD, Gas Engine 2026 1500 Ram Cargo Van 2026 Ford Transit NO BID NO BID 2025 Ford Transit Cargo
2025 or Nower Medium Size Cargo Van, 2WD, Bulkhead with lockable door $39,529.00 $45,100.00 NO BID NO BID $51,334.00
Alternate Medium size transit cargo van, high/extended roof, 2wd, bulkhead with lockable door. per vehicle: 2026 3500 Ram Cargo Van $45,419.00 $49,800.00 NO BID NO BID $52,350.00
DELIVERY 45-50 Days 60-90 days NO BID NO BID 180 Days
CATEGORY H 2025 or Newer Medium size Crossover vehicle 2026 Dodge Durango 2026 Ford Bronco Sport 2026 Chevy Equinox NO BID NO BID
2025 or Newer Medium size Crossover vehicle $33,021.00 $30,558.00 $29,400.00 NO BID NO BID
DELIVERY 45-50 Days 60-90 days 120-150 Days NO BID NO BID
CATEGORY | 2025 or Newer Compact Sedan (Small size 100-109 cubic feet) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2025 or Newer Compact Sedan (Small size 100-109 cubic feet) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
DELIVERY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CATEGORY J 2025 or Newer Full Size SUV, Police Package, 4x4, Un-Marked/Marked Units, Gas Engine 2026 Durango Pursuit NO BID 2025 Chevy Tahoe PPV NO BID NO BID
2025 or Newer Full Size, SUV, 4x4, PPV UNMARKED $48,355.00 NO BID $61,700.00 NO BID NO BID
2025 or Newer Full Size, SUV, 4x4, PPV MARKED $48,355.00 NO BID $61,700.00 NO BID NO BID
DELIVERY 45-50 Days NO BID 150-180 Days NO BID NO BID
CATEGORY K 2025 or Newer Mid-Size SUV, 2WD & 4x4, 2026 Dodge Durango 2026 Ford Explore Active 2026 Chevrolet Traverse Dodge Durango NO BID
2025 Mid-Size, SUV, 2WD, $33,626.00 $35,450.00 $44,100.00 $35,715.00 NO BID
2025 Mid-Size SUV, 4x4, $34,894.00 $37,300.00 $44,100.00 $37,932.00 NO BID
DELIVERY 45-50 Days 60-90 Days 180 ARO 75-110 NO BID

AWARDED BY COMMISSIONERS COURT ON 12/30/25




BID # 251201 - PURCHASE OF VEHICLES FOR CAMERON COUNTY DEPARTMENTS
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON December 10, 2025 AT 3:00 P.M.

VEHICLE DESCRIPTION:

BOGGUS TIPTON MOTORS,LLC

5780 N. Expressway 77/83

Brownsville, TX 78526
Rep- Victor Esoindola
956-410-0079

Boswell Elliff Ford

1401 W Bys Hw 77

San Benito, TX 78586
Rep- Robert Garcia
956-3999-2468

Caldwell Country Chevrolet II,LLC
800 E Hwy 21
Caldwell, TX 77836

Rep- Karen Cole
979-429-8844

Grapevine DCJ, LLC
2601 William Tate
Grapevine ,TX 26051

Rep-Dennis Thomas
817-410-7541

Gullo Ford of Conroe
925 1-45 South
Conroe ,TX 77301

Rep- Gary Adams
956-756-5500

CATEGORY L 2025 or Newerl Ton (3500), Mega Cab, Regular Bed, & 4x4, Single and Double (Dully Rear Wheels) 2025 RAM 3500 2026 FORD F350 XL NO BID 2025 RAM 3500 Mega cab NO BID
2026 1 Ton (3500), Mega Cab, Regular Bed, 4x4, Single Rear Wheel, $73,692.00 $61,250.00 NO BID $77,427.00 NO BID
2025 1 Ton (3500), Mega Cab, Regular Bed, 4x4, Double (Dully Rear Wheels) $74,979.00 $62,550.00 NO BID $79,600.00 NO BID
DELIVERY 45-50 Days 60-90 Days NO BID 80-100 Days NO BID
. 2026 4x4 1/2 Crew Cab
CATEGORY M 2025 1/4 Ton (1500) Pickup Truck, Crew Cab, Regular Bed, 4x4, Police Package Unmarked/Marked Units 2026 Ram 1500 2026 Ford F150 Police Intrecepter 2026 Chevrolet 1500 Silverado NOBID Police
2025 or Newer1/4 Ton Pickup Truck, Crew Cab, Regular Bed, 4x4, PPV, unmarked $41,464.00 $46,900.00 $50,900.00 NO BID $48,560.00
2025 or Newerl1/4 Ton Pickup Truck, Crew Cab, Regular Bed, 4x4, PPV, marked $41,464.00 $46,900.00 $50,900.00 NO BID NO BID
DELIVERY 45-50 Days 90-120 Days 120-150 Days NO BID 120 Days
Addendums Received 1 1 0 1 0
p -1I llf'. Primary
.;' f \ Secondary
| HEREBY CERTIFY THE ABOVE TO BE THE CORRECT BIDS RECEIVED: = 5 % Tertiary
s
ad, 12/17/2025

ROBERTO C. LUNA, PURCHASING AGENT

AWARDED BY COMMISSIONERS COURT ON 12/30/25
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