
• TABULATION 

BUILDING SUPPLIES: ELECTRICAL -ANNUAL BID# 2000-2GEN 
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON: JANUARY 4, 2023 AT l l :00 A.M. 

PRIMARY 
SECONDARY 
TRETIARY 

FROM: JANUARY 23, 2023 TO: JANUARY 22, 2024 WI OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR (ONE) ADDITIONAL YEAR WI EACH RENEWAL. 

VENDOR ELECTRIC FIXTU RE SU PPLY INC. National Electric & Hardware Wholesale Electric Supply Co,foc 
ADDRESS 810 E. 11th. St. 3220 Ruben Torres Sr Blvd 8500 E Parmer Ln. Bldg#S ,Suite 560 

BROWNSVILLE. TX 78522 BROWNSVILLE. TX. 78526 Manor .TX 78653 
DESCRIPTION (956) 546-2401 (956) 548-6677 512-789-0893 

Rep Rep:Rosa Paci Rep:Chris A uilar 
PRIMARY VENDOR - ELECTRICAL U/M Qty pr/yr, Unit Pric Total pr/ yr. Unit Price Total pr/ yr. Unit Price Total pr/ yr, 

I. FUSES 
1 F.RS-.R-30 600 V RK TD 30 EA $7.00 $210.00 $14,94 $448.20 $13.61 $408.30 
2 SC-15 600V CLASS G 30 EA $1.50 $45.00 $9.75 $292.50 $7.86 $235.80 
3 FRN-R-30 250V TD 60 EA $5.00 $300.00 $7.64 $458.40 $6.07 $364.20 

4 SC-30 300V CLASS G 30 EA $1.75 $52.50 $9.75 $292.50 $14.71 $441.30 

5 SC-20 600V CLASS G 20 EA $1.75 $35.00 $12.44 $248.80 $8.29 $165.80 

6 KTK-R-15 600V MINITURE 30 EA $8.00 $240.00 $13.83 $414.90 $16.13 $483 .90 

7 KTK-10 600V MlNlTURE 50 EA $2.50 $125.00 $10.33 $516.50 $12.80 $640.00 

8 MDL-3 250V SMALL DIM 3A 250V SLOW BLOW 30 EA $0.50 $15.00 $4.37 $131.10 $1.14 $34.20 

9 FRN-R-60 250V RK5 TD 60A 60 EA $6.00 $360 00 $12.64 $758.40 $11.14 $668.40 
10 KTK-R-10 600V MlNITURE 30 EA $8.00 $240.00 $13 ,94 $418.20 $16.13 $483.90 
11 FRN-R-45 250V RK5 TD 20 EA $2.60 $52.00 $18.47 $369.40 $11.14 $222.80 
12 FRN-R-150 250V RK5 20 EA $11.36 $227,20 $59.99 $1,199.80 $54,99 $1.099.80 
13 FRS-R-100 600V RK TD 30 EA $19.00 $570.00 $54.53 $1,635.90 $50,19 $1,505.70 
14 FRS-R-200 600V RK5 20 EA $20,00 $400.00 $94,89 $1,897.80 $96.51 $1,930,20 

SUB-TOTAL ITEM l. - $2,871.70 SUB-TOTAL ITEM I $9,082.40 SUB-TOTAL ITEM I S8,684.30 

Pittsburgh Electrical lnsultion 
600 Magnetek Dr 

Cameron County .Texas 78526 
956-554-3690 

Rep: 
Unit Price Total pr/ yr. 

$67.76 $2,032.74 

$29.95 $898.38 

$31.56 $1,893.36 

$56.10 $1.682.91 

$31.53 $630.66 

$75.12 $2,253.54 

$75.38 $3,769.13 

$469.06 $14,071.86 

$52.26 $3.135.36 
$19.60 $587.85 
$812.71 $16,254. 10 
$301.20 $6,023.93 
$ 195,51 $5,865.35 
$460,35 $9,206.92 

SU!l-TOTAL ITEM I $68,306.08 
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BUILDING SUPPLIES: ELECTRICAL - ANNUAL BID# 2000-2GEN 
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON: JANUARY 4, 2023 AT 11:00 A.M. 
FROM: JANUARY 23, 2023 TO: JANUARY 22, 2024 WI OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR (ONE) ADDITIONAL YEAR W/ EACH RENEWAL. 

VENDOR ELECT RI C FIXTURE SUPPLY INC. National Electric & Hardware Wholesale Electric Supply Co,lnc 
ADDRESS 810 E. 11th. St, 3220 Ruben Torres Sr Blvd 8500 E Panner Ln, Bldg#5 ,Suite 560 

BROWNSVILLE, TX. 78522 BROWNSVILLE, TX. 78526 Manor ,TX 78653 
(956) 546-2401 (956) 548-6677 512-789-0893 

( Continued) Primary Vendor - Electrical U/M Qty pr/yr Unit Pric Total pr/ yr. Unit Price Total pr/ yr. Unit Price Total pr/ yr. 
II PIITI L"n. u, • •u•r:-n ITI.' r,,:, ~. <,not, n L• , , 

1 S!' 20AM P-120V 50 EA $5.00 ~.ou.uu $8,65 ~4j2,:i0 $12.31 -sor,.50 
-, 2P 30AMP-240V JO EA $15.00 ~'OJU,UU $28.65 ~159.50 $26.95 :SlSUlS.50 
1 2P 40AMP-240V 30 EA $12.00 )j0U.W $23.48 ~ ,v,..40 $26.95 )lSU~.50 

2P 50AMP 240V 30 EA $12.00 )j6U.UU $23.48 ~ ,v,..40 $26.95 )~U~.:>U 
2P 70AMP-240V 20 EA $28.00 )4UU.UU $39.65 ~ •».OU $26.95 $539.UU 
3P 30AMP-208/240l480V 20 EA $45.00 :b~UU.00 $83.14 )l ,uuL,80 $477.74 $9,)54.80 
JP 40AMP-208l240l480V 15 EA $40.00 ~l"ltllJ,UO $101.79 :SI ,)26.8) $477.74 $7,IM. IU 
3P 50AMP-208!240l480V 15 EA $40.00 )0UU.0U $101.79 :Sl ,JL0:-8") $477.74 '"$7.,66.10 
3P 60AM P-208l240l480V 15 EA $50.00 $/)U.UU $105.56 lil,)lf3.4U $477.74 '"$7J6o. IO 

SU B-TOTAL ITL' M II $4,0/U.0U I Sub ·1 otal Item 11 ))l,/ll-',70 I Sub Iota! Item II ;:).l"f,0_,_,.10 -
.Ill EMERGENCY LIGHT FIXTURES I 

CCS WHT EMERGENCY L!GffnNG tJNIT 10 EA $12.40 SIZ4.UU No Bid No Hie! $23,00 li230.00 

SU B-TOTAL .,. • • ,.,, 111 ~ SIZ4.UU I Sub-Total 11 t.JVI Ill 1Su6-1 Ota! I IEM'lll '.liZ.311,UU 
1--

"' iY '" r-.,-,--,-~ J 4' Umt l'nc l otal pr/ yr. Umt !'nee llolal pr/ yr. Unit !'nee ·1 otal pr7 yr. 
312 BULK. YELLOW WIRE CONNECTORS 500 BAG 20(10 EA t0 QR S160.UU No Bid Nn o;a )U.u" )~lS.2~ 

-, 51 2 llULK RED WIRE CONNECTORS 500 BAG 2000 EA to 10 ~Ll/l .U0 NoR;,l "'-°'" so:m, 'TI 10.58 
1 30-273 SIZE 731l ORANGE WIRE CONNECTORS IOOO EA to 16 l>loU.UU No o;a 1'1~ OCJ so;nd ~l./0 
~ ¼ •• ELECTRICAL METALJ_IC TUBING 2000 FT SO R9 l>t,,ou.uu No ,,;a >.!~ n , a $1.13 S2Jhl'.4U 
, I" ELECTRICAL METALLIC TUBING IOOO FT tl,I l>l ,) I U.UU NoD;A 1',Jh OCJ $1.94 $1.937.10 
e 112 ·• EMT ELECTRICAL METAl,LIC TUBING 3000 FT $050 l>l .lSUU.UU No n ;A No n,a S0.64 SJ ,Q7 I .~u 

½" DfECAST SFr SCREW JOO EA tO l, l>45.UU No n;A Nn n,a $0.30 )~U.K4 
s ½" ONE IIOLE ELECTRICALMETAU.ICTUBING 300 EA tQ,I, li4).UU No n:A >.!~ nCJ so.u~ )Ll.36 
g V500 RACEWAY WIREMOLDTUBING 300 FT tQ 1? ~.lo.OU No n;A >.!~ n,a SI.lo 'lt. 11x.uu 

1 r ¼" ONE HOLE ELECTRICAL METALLIC TUBING 300 EA tQ_l6 ~48.UU No Bid 1'1~ Q;A SO. lo )'l~.I8 
i 318"'' B.)(METAWC CABLE CONNECTORS 100 EA to i;o lioU.UU No R;rl No B;n $0.74 )/'l. I5 
? ¾" EMT OIECAST SET SCREW CONNECTORS 300 EA $0 ?5 $7).UU No R;rl NnRin $0,32 )~O.oY 

:! ½" EMT DIECAST SET SCREW CONNECTORS 300 EA ~o ?11 )OU.OU No R;rl No Rjrl :i;u.:lo $11.n 
1 , V504 WIRF.MOLD TUBING 2 HO! E STRAPS 50 EA QO'i $2.SU No R;r NnRjrl :i;Q.44 l>ZL.Ul 
, CR20 NEMA5 20A IVORY DUPLEX ·100 EA " l'i $I35 ,UU No R;, Nn o;; $I.oj l>lo.l.Ul 

'/2" LJO!JID TITE FI.EXIBI.E TUBING 300 EA ~l RS )))).00 No R;r 1'Jn o:..l )1.22 ).500.Ul 
I V700 RACEWAY WIREMOLDTUBING 100 FT 0 15 $1:>,00 No R;, l\Jn o:..l $1.~t $1 Yo.0l 
I I" EMT DIECAST COMPRESSION COUP LINS 50 EA ~o ?S )I2,)U NoBirl l\Jn 0:..1 liQ,55 ~L /.4) 
I 518" RAISE SINGLE POLE PLASTER RINGS 50 EA "0 ?" )JU.UU NoBirl l\Jn 0:..1 $U.os ~, ... 7:l 

' W' EMT CONN[\CTORS SET SCREW STEEL 100 EA "0 :!? )jZ.UU No i,;,1 1'.Jn DCJ :SU.26 ~2)."/4 
, 1 4 X 4 BLANK COVER PLATES 1()0 EA ._0 QR )'18.UU No Rirl 1'.Jn n;a :SU.'1> ~'OL.UU 
' ' ½" REGULAR HANDYBOXES WITH KNOCKOUTS 100 FA <i;0 '' )LL.UU No <>irl ~o n:a $1.12 lil.ll.4(> 

Pittsburgh Electrical lnsultion 
600 Magnetek Dr 

Cameron County ,Texas 78526 
956-554-3690 

Unit Price Total pr/ yr. 

S11.23 )I.U0J.4j 
S36.80 Sl,104.uu 
S33.45 $1 ,UUj.6I 
SJJ.45 $l,UUj.6J 
$73.19 $1.463.72 

$125.45 $2.'.>09.07 
$125.45 $I.oo .lSU 
SJ25.45 l>l.881.lSU 
$125.45 l>J.~8I .80 

jSuo Total Item II '.lil.l,1,u.~b I 

I 
S59.97 ~!>YY.72 

1Sub-1otal ll"t.M m ~,,,,,.n 

Umt Pnce ·1 otal pr/ yr. 
)lSo.7& )0., .. 

$100.46 )IU.U) 
)L)j_9g :i,,m.M 
$253.20 )LL) .34 

)'lj0.62 $659.JU 
$14'1.9 1 )/L.'00 
$12).26 $18. ,, 

)'1/ .0) $7.06 
$4.52 $0.54 

:b)L.62 $8.42 
$125.26 ) I). I) 
$"325.83 )~l .'10 
$125.zo ~D.U, 

$1.l4 W.Ut 
$5.40 )"/.Z! 

~Ll).LU )JU~.l I 
~).U'l )U.lt 

$1'/4./1 )4.l .0~ 
$I'19.'l.l ~,~.'!'! 

~'01.L'I $l.l ,2U 
$U8,LO $1.l'.>.)I 
:,qqj.4J li'I/.)) 
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BUILDING SUPPLIES: ELECTRICAL - ANNUAL BID# 2000-2GEN 
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON : JANUARY 4, 2023 AT 11 :00 A.M. 
FROM: JANUARY 23, 2023 TO: JANUARY 22, 2024 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR (ONE) ADDITIONAL YEAR W/ EACH RENEWAL. 

ELECTRIC FIXTURE SUPPLY INC. National Electric & Hardware Wholeule Electric Supply Co,Inc 
810 E. I Ith. St. 3220 Ruben Torres Sr Blvd 8500 E Parmer Ln. Bldg#5 ,Suite 560 

BROWNSVILLE, TX 78522 BROWNSVILLE, TX. 78526 Manor ,TX 78653 
\Lon1muca.I rnmarv venaor - l!.lec1ncaI (Y'.lo) '.l4o-14UI (Y'.loJ '.l4M-ool't '.ll:l-/M'.H.IMY.l 

IIV. MI<:C'l?I ,I •.NH\11<: ll<'n\ U/M IJIY pr/yr. Uml rnc1 total pr/ yr. umt rnce I otal prr yr. Umtrnce ·1 otal pr/ yr. 
?3 STNGLE GANG 13LANK COVERS 100 EA $0. IS )D.UU No R;rl No Bid ~1.u, ~IUY.UU 
, DUPLEX RECEPTACLE OUTLET COVER 100 EA ~n ?0 )LU.OU No Bid No R;n $U . .l4 ).l'f.UU 
?'i ¾" EMT DIE CAST SET SCREW CONNECTORS \00 EA tn ?Q )LU.OU No R;n NoR;n $0.32 $.Jl.23 
11 Y," CONDU IT CLIPS KADDY 50 EA too, $2.50 No R;rl No R;n ;1.u ).>o.Yr 
o Y," SINGLE GANG KO HANDY BOXES 50 7 A ~0 l O $1'.l.U0 No R;rl No Bid ,1.32 )00.2.l 
?l 4 X 4 JUNCTION BOXES ½" & ¾" KO - SMALLOW 50 EA t? ,o $12'.l.0U No R;rl No R;n ,1.U9 ).l'f.)4 
og 4 X 4 JUNCTION BOXES ½" & ¾" KO - DEEP 50 EA <A,_ :SLIZ.)U NnRirl Nn o;a ;1.32 :soo.22 
lC JJ + SUP'ER ¾ X 66 FT 3M TAPE 20 EA t8 7<; )I /).OU Nn Rirl Nn o:a ,l,lS) ).ll .UU 
l t 120V EYE PHOTO CONTROL FIXED POSITION 10 EA ti, 00 l,l)U.OU Nn o:a l\JnD;A li 14,/2 $I4'/ .LU 
l? SINGLE POLE 12U/277V SP20 A 5() EA t4 7, :Sn/.)U NnRirl Nn o:a :s-L.3.l )I 10 . .JU 
l1 WIREMOI D SINGLE GANG BOXES - SHALLOW 10 EA io ,o )5.UU Nn Birl Nn o:a $11.:.14 l>l 12.'>U 
34 5/8" GROUND ROD 10 EA ,:19_75 >L7 /,)U NnR;rl Nn Rirl >L .UU Jl.£.JV.UU 

l ~ •C6-IPC CRIMl' ON COAX CONNECTORS 50 EA io o, l>L.)U NoRirl Nn n:a l,U.'/C> )JS.vu 
l, VS! I 2-IN 90D W[REMOLD FLAT ELBOWS ro EA (Q ?<; $.L.)U No Rirl Nn R;rl :s-:z.)o l>D,ou 
~ 4 X 4 Y,' & ¼" KO EXTRA DEEP JUCTION 30 EA _tn so )D.UU No Bid No R;n 08.!U ):.14.l.uu 
1 518" GROUND ROD CLAMPS l/1 EA ta no $'fU.U0 No R;rl No R;, ,2.,., )L) . .>u 

l ¼" PVC FEMAI.ECONNECTORS 50 EA tn n6 ):J.U0 No R;rl No Bi moo l>.l.l.uu 
Al 2" PLASTIC INSULATION BUSHINGS 30 EA ~n ~o )L'<.00 No R;rl No R;, oU.44 )l.l.LU 

4 1 WJREMOLD FLUSH EXTENSION BOXES Ill EA $0 45 $4,:,U No R;rl No R;n $9.87 ),o. ,u 
4~ SINGLE RECEPTACLE NEMA6-20R WHIT/IV 50 EA $0 40 $20.00 No Rid No R;a l,0.U) )'IUL.)lJ 

41 25DTP-4 IV 10 FOOT POWER POLES 5 EA $4475 l>LLJ.I) No R;a No R;a )LOU, I) l,l,JUJ. /) ,.,. V517 2-314 WIRF.MOLD INTERNAL ELBOWS 5 EA rn <o )L . .lU No R;a No R;n l,J. J0 l,l).,v 
4'i V518 ?-118 WIREMOLD EXTERNALFJ_BQWS 5 EA $050 )L,)U No R;n No R;n )L.,L )l'f.uv 
,! 165 4 OCT 2-1 18 D OCTAGON JUNCTION BOXES '/2 20 EA ~n ~o $Io.U0 No R;rl No R;n )j.'10 )0,.)3 

4 35-YELLOW ¼ X 66FT MARKING TAPE 10 EA $9.00 l>,u.00 NoR;rl No 1,;,. )L.u, l>Lo.,u 
A 35-ORANGE ¾ X 66IT MARKING TAPE 10 EA $9.00 l>,u.00 No R;n No id li'l.0'1 :i,Lo.,u 

• 35-BROWN ¾ X 66FT MARKING TAPE 10 EA tQ (l(l :i,,u.0U NoR;n No id :Sl.o, )Lo.,u 

5 DUPLEX NF.MAS I5R REC.EPTAC'.U OlITLETS so EA tn 50 $L.>.00 No R;n Nol id l,l.09 li.>4.)U 

5 PSA lJ PLASTIC ANCHOR KITS W t SCREWS 10 EA i1 50 )i.l.UU NoR;rl Nol ,;,. )Ll.3.l l,2!.J,jU 
, 2-IN SNAP-IN KO BLANK IO EA tO ?O ~2.00 No R;rl No ,;,. l,3.,o l>.l~.ou 
H SINGLE D\JPLF.X RECEPTACLE OOTLET 30 EA $0 16 ~4.80 No R;n No 1;,1 $1..l l )'>.>.JU 

54 REGUI.AR RESIDENTIAL 36" RANGE HOOD 5 EA pn ,n $I02,:,U No R;n No R;rl no ma no bid 
5'i SINGLE RECEPTACLE NEMA5-20R WHIT/JV 50 EA so 50 $L.> .0U No R;.i No R;n $0.42 ).>LI.VU 

'ii ¼" EMT DIE CAST COMPRESSION CONNECTORS 50 EA $0 15 $7,j0 No R;n No R;n )U,OS l,Jl.7'.l 
,7 125V 40A TIMER 7 DAY 3 EA $7 4'\ >LL,j) No R;rl No .,;,, )01.01 )L'f) .01 

58 WIREMOLD SINGLE GANG BOXES - SHALLOW 5 EA $0.55 $2.75 No Bid No Bid $11.24 $56.20 

SUB-TOTAL ITEM IV $9.029.15 Sub-Total ITEM IV Sub-Tollll ITEM IV Sl2.764.6S - ~ TOTAi ITFMS I II 111 & IV $16.694.85 Total Items 1,11 $18,876.10 Total Items 1,11,111,IV SS6.312 .0S 
I Miscellaneous Cn111lu11 orscoul 1 II crvke 80 % off list. (A.D,& F 7011/.,) , (B.C& K& L40% Off 

"if.I ~ 
Remonslvc / Responsible Responsive I Responsible Responsive/ Responsible 

RECOMMENDATIO 

IHEREBYCERTIFY • ETII ' JE/J;0)S:;;EIV l:.O; --7" , ___::> •_ _'7 /-/ti ,~~ 

RO0ERTO C. LU! ~ I G MANAGER P ATE C l'ED"~ "" .. , ~71 • U~ INTENANCE DIR.E OR DATE 

Pittsburgh Electrical lnsultlon 
600 Magnetek Dr 

Cameron County ,Texas 78526 
Y'.lo-'.l'.l4-.loYU 

Uml l'nce I otal prl yr. 
)146.94 :s I4,o,.>.'.l'.l 
~IYU. I9 :SJ9,UJ0.IU 
).lLJ.8.l ).lL,.l0L.9) 
)LUL.L/ :SJU,I J.l .08 
~oqJ.o, )'>L,U0'>.Z) 
).lU'>.L'> :SJ:,,Z!Z,LU 
)4.l.l.'.lU )Ll,01.l.LU 

~LL. D ~44L.98 
))9.8j l,)98 . .l' 
:i,·; I.LJ l>l ,Ub .4) 
l>L~ . .J8 l>L0> . 8.L 

l,)b.vo :i.,ou.oJ 
l,Uo. D l>o.ou,.4.l 

l,b.5 I l>()) . 61 

l,4.l.l.'.lU )J.l ,UU.J. I2 
)8q,.44 ~s ... ,,._.io 
l>IIZ:fb )),0.l 1.8) 
)16.l.42 )4,,uL.4) 

)L0.'/4 )LOI .JO 
)16.7.> )~j /.)U 

l,00,,.Qj )J.,..,o.J I 
l,0. I~ ,..,v,0~ 
)l . .ll ,,,,,., 

li.loo.,,, )/,jj,,_.,v 
)j.'10 .. , ... u. 
$.l.4o l,J'I.0L 
:f.l.4o ).l'l.62 

$JL0.8.l $b,441.iu 
ld).22 )3)2.24 

)o,.>.l l $8,9.ll.!U 
) "2.lU )0.l .!4 
l>.l.3I )10.)0 

)l'>,9) ~l'<t ,jU 
$11:L.~2 )),O'>U, /.l 
)LJ.> ,7I )IOI.I'> 

$23.47 $117,36 
Sub-Total ITEM IV $234,391.14 

Total Items l,11,111.1\ $317,087.80 

Non Responsive /Non Responsible 
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