
TABULATION SHEET 
ANNUAL BID #2515L ROAD MATERIALS : LIME 

AS PER RECEIVED ON FEB 11,2026 AT 3:00PM 

FROM: FEB 18,2026 TO FEB 17, 2026 W/OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE -EACH RENEWAL ON(1) ADDITIONAL YEAR 

VENDORS Lhoist North America of Texas,LLC 
5600 Clearfork Main St. Ste 300 

ADDRESS Fort Worth, TX 76109 
830-358-3270 

A. Hvdrated Lime, Orv oer 50#Baa 

1. Zone 1 $12.67 

2. Zone 2 $12.67 

3. Zone 3 $12.68 
4. Zone 4 $12.81 
5 Zone 5 $12.81 

Material pick-up at store $10.50 

B. Hydrated Lime, Dry 

1. Zone 1 $351.85 

2 Zone 2 $351.85 

3. Zone 3 $352.24 

4. Zone 4 $357.40 
5. Zone 5 $357.40 

C. Hvdrated Lime-Tvoe B Commerc,al Lime Slunv 
1. Zone 1 
2. Zone 2 
3. Zone 3 
4. Zone 4 II 
5.Zone 5 /' I 
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$334.27 
$336.67 
$339.62 
$348,05 
$355.34 

Synolo Materials, LLC 
3149C Center Pointe Drive 

Hidalgo, Texas 78539 
956-627-6181 

No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 

No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 

$316.00 
$318.00 
$320.00 
$323.00 
$325.00 

Terra Firma Materials LLC. 
9312 E Curve Rd. 

Edinburg, TX 78539 
Hidalgo, Texas, 78542 

No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 

S345.00 
$345.00 
$345.00 
$345.00 
$345.00 

$325.00 
$325.00 
$325.00 
$325.00 
$325.00 

PRIMARY 
SECONDARY 
TERTIARY 

VCCS,LLC 
10966 Business 83 
La Feria, TX 78559 

956-404-5787 

$13.50 
$14.00 
$14.50 
$15.00 
$15.00 
$13.00 

$272.00 
$274.00 
$276.00 
S278.00 
$280.00 

$308.00 
$312.00 
$316.00 
S320.00 
$324.00 

AWARDED BY COMMISSIONER COURT ON 03/10/26




