TABULATION

PRIMARY

ANNUAL BID #2560 : ROAD FLEXIBLE BASE MATERIALS SECONDARY

AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON FEBRUARY 19, 2026 AT 03:00 P.M. TERTIARY

FROM: MARCH 16, 2026 TO: MARCH 15, 2027 W/OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL.

OPEN MARKET (COST ONLY) PRICE INCREASES ALLOWED

VENDOR NAME FRONTERA MATERIALS MARTIN MARIETTA RIO GRANDE HAULING VULCAN CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS,LLC DIRT ROCKS
& P.O. Box 1449 4949 N.LOOP 1604 STE 135 1952 S.PRICE RD 10101 REUNION PLACE STE 500 9708 South Padre island Dr,STE A-106
ADDRESS Eisa ,TX 78543 Bexar, TX 78249 Brownsville, TX 78521 San Antonio, TX 78216 San Antonio, Tx. 78249
Contact Info Brandon Henry Eduardo Aldape Fabian De La Garza Analily Cedezma Robby Pederson
956-316-8954 956-546-3750 956-986-2775 210-547-6046 1-833-347-8769

A. |FLEX . BASE TYPE "E"
CALICHE - GRADE 4 Material Price Transportation Cost |Material Price Transportation Cost|Material Price | Transportation Cost |Material Price Transportation Cost Material Price Transportation Cost
1.ZONE 1 PRIC.Y $8.00 $10.54 $9.50 $10.46 $9.75 $9.00 NO BID NO BID $11.00 $27.50
2. ZONE 2 PRIC.Y. $8.00 $13.28 $9.50 $10.46 $9.75 $10.00 NO BID NO BID $11.00 $23.10
3. ZONE 3 PRIC.Y. $8.00 $16.88 $9.75 $12.30 $9.75 $12.00 NO BID NO BID $11.00 $20.90
4. ZONE 4 PRIC.Y. $8.00 $17.92 $10.50 $12.30 $9.75 $14.00 NO BID NO BID $11.00 $17.60
5. ZONE § PRICY. $8.00 $20.00 $10.25 $15.68 $9.75 $15.00 NO BID NO BID $11.00 $22.00

B. |CRUSHED LIMESTONE
1. ZONE 1 rrey. |[NO BID NO BID $44.00 $13.37 $38.00 $8.00 $38.00 $7.55 $32.92 $8.50
2. ZONE 2 ercy.  |NO BID NO BID $44.00 $12.58 $38.00 $9.00 $38.00 $7.50 $32.92 $8.50
3. ZONE 3 rrcy.  |NO BID NO BID $44.00 $8.48 $38.00 $10.00 $38.00 $7.50 $32.92 $10.50
4.ZONE 4 rrcy.  |NO BID NO BID $44.00 $7.76 $38.00 $12.00 $38.00 $4.75 $32.92 $12.50
5. ZONE 5 M\ |rrey.  |[NO BID NO BID $44.00 $6.19 $38.00 $12.00 $38.00 $4.75 $32.92 $12.00
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AWARDED BY COMMISSIONERS COURT ON 03/10/2026





