TABULATION

PRIMARY

ANNUAL BID # 2580 - ROAD SURFACING MATERIALS
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON FEBRUARY 19, 2026 AT 03:00 P.M.

FROM: MARCH 16, 2026 TO MARCH 15, 2027 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL.
OPEN MARKET (COST ONLY) PRICE INCREASES ALLOWED

BIDDER'S NAME VULCAN MATERIALS MARTIN MARIETTA BLADES GROUP FRONTERA MATERIALS

AND ADDRESS P.0. BOX 791550, 4949 N.Loop 1604 W Suite 135 3609 W. PALMA VISTA DRIVE, P.0. BOX 1449,

DESCRIPTION SAN ANTONIO, TX. 78279 Bexar Texas 78249 PALMVIEW, TX. 78572 ELSA, TX. 78543

Contac Name: ANALILY LEDEZMA Eduardo Aldape Tamra Wash Brandon Henry

210) 547-6046 (210) 208-4201 (833)568-6001 {956)316-8951
A- xg;an\Ile C CONCRETE PERITON Transportation Cost PERITON Transportation Cost PER/TON Transportation Cost PERI/TON Transportation Cost
1. Type "D" - Gravel | Limestone
"Paving & Speed Humps™
(1) Zone 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 74.54 $12.92
(2) Zone 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 74,54 $11.98
(3) Zone 3 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 74.54 $9.67
(4) Zone 4 NQO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 74.54 $7.81
(5) Zone 5 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOQO BID NO BID 74.54 $12.50
B. | LIMESTONE ROCK
ASPHALT (CLASS A) PERITON Transportation Cost PERI/ITON Transportation Cost PERITON Transportation Cost PERI/TON Transportation Cost
1. Type "CC" - natural cold - coars
(a) Public Works Brownsvi $81 42 $79.70 $68.68 $232.30 NO BID NO BID
(b) Public Works Brownsvi $81.42 $79.70 $67.09 $228.30 NO BID NO BID
(¢) Public Works San Benl } $76.82 $79.70 $65.51 $226.10 NO BID NO BID
(d} Public Works Harlinget $75.44 $79.70 $64.51 $224.25 NO BID NO BID
{e) Zone1 $75.44 $79.70 $65.11 $241.25 NO BID NO BID
(f) Zone 2 $76.82 $79.70 $65.51 $246.30 NO BID NO BID
(g) Zone 3 $77.28 579.70 $67.49 $244.10 NO BID NO BID
(h) Zone 4 $79.35 579.70 $69.57 §246.30 NO BID NO BID
(i) Zone 5 $81.42 $79.70 $71.66 $260.70 NO BID NO BID
Price includes delivery

2. TYPE "D" - natural cold | _ PER/TON Transportation Cost PER/TON Transportation Cost PER/TON Transportation Cost PERITON Transportation Cost
(a) Public Works Brownsvi|514 (L §81.42 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
(b) Public Works San Benl| $76.82 NQ BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
(c) Public Works Harlinge NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NQ BID NO BID
(d) Zone 1 3 NO BID NO BID NO BID NQ BID $90.00 $16.88
(e) Zone 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $20.00 $17.71
() Zone 3 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $90.00 $18.40
{g) Zone 4 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $90.00 $19.79
(h) Zone 5 NQO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $90,00 $28.13
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TABULATION

PRIMARY
SECONDARY
TERTIARY
ANNUAL BID # 2580 - ROAD SURFACING MATERIALS
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON JANUARY 29, 2019 AT 11:00 A.M.
FROM: MARCH 16, 2019 TO MARCH 15, 2020 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL.
OPEN MARKET (COST ONLY) PRICE INCREASES ALLOWED
BIDDER'S NAME VULCAN MATERIALS MARTIN MARIETTA BLADES GROUP FRONTERA MATERIALS
AND ADDRESS P.O. BOX 791550, 4949 N.Loop 1604 W Suite 135 3609 W. PALMA VISTA DRIVE, P.0. BOX 1449,
SAN ANTONIO, TX. 78279 Bexar Texas 78249 PALMVIEW, TX. 78572 ELSA, TX. 78543
ANALILY LEDEZMA Eduardo Aldape Tamra Wash Brandon Henry
(210) 524-3567 (210) 208-4201 (956) 432-0600 {956) 316-8952
DESCRIPTION
= ?gs :fn?é\;stOR Suh PER/TON | Transportation Cost | PER/TON | Transportation Cost | PER/TON| Transportation Cost | PER/TON | Transportation Cost
1. Type P.E. Grade 3 I
(a) Zone 1 NO BID NO BID $52.00 $65.11 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
(b) Zone?2 NOBID NO BID $52.00 $65.51 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
(c) Zone3 NO BID NQ BID $52.00 $67.49 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
(d) Zone 4 NO BID NOBID $52.00 $69.67 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
(e) Zone5 NO BID NO BID $52.00 $71.66 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2. Type P.E. Grade 4 Non Coated
(a) Zone 1 NO BID NO BID $35.00 $65.11 NOBID NOBID NO BID NOBID
(b) Zone 2 NO BID NO BID $35.00 $65.51 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
(c) Zone3 NO BID NOBID $35.00 $67.49 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
(d) Zone4 NO BID NO BID $35.00 $69.67 NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID
(e) Zone5 NO BID NOBID $35.00 $71.66 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3. Type P.E. Grade §
(a) Zone1 NO BID NO BID $55.00 $65.11 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
(b) Zone 2 NO BID NO BID $55.00 $65.51 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
(c) Zone3 NO BID NO BID $55.00 $67.49 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
(d) Zone 4 NO BID NO BID $55.00 $69.67 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
(e) Zoneb NO BID NO BID $55.00 $71.66 NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4. Type P.E. Grade 5 Non Coated
(a) Zone1 NOBID NOBID $38.00 $65.11 NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
(b) Zone2 NO BID NO BID $38.00 $65.51 NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
{c) Zone3 NO BID NO BID $38.00 $67.49 NOBID NOBID NO BiD NO BID
(d) Zone 4 NOBID NOBID $38.00 $69.67 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
(e) Zone5 NOBID NO BID $38.00 $71.66 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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