ANNUAL BID # 2430 - MOSQUITO INSECTICIDE
AS PER BIDS RECEIVED ON: MARCH 4TH, 2026 AT 3:00 P.M.

FROM: MARCH 29, 2026 TO: MARCH 28, 2027 W/ OPTION TO RENEW ONCE OR TWICE FOR (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR WITH EACH RENEWAL.

TABULATION

PRIMARY
SECONDARY

VENDOR'S NAME Veseris ADAPCO
& 402 N Frontage Rd.77 100 COLONIAL CENTER , S#170
ADDRESS Harlingen, TX 78550 LAKE MARY, FL. 32746
361-945-2161 (407) 328-6519

DESCRIPTION UM | BRAND NAME UNIT PRICE BRAND NAME UNIT PRICE

1. 18% Resmelhrin, 54% Piperonyl Butoxide -5 gal/pail GAL NO BID NO BID
2. 4% Resmethrin, 12% Piperonyl Butoxide - (Ready to use = RTU) 55 gal/drum GAL NO BID NO BID
3. Oil - base Permethrin RTU. min 4% Pemmethrin, 8% Piperonyl Butoxide - (55 gal Drum; GAL NO BID NO BID
4, Oil-based Pyrethroids - min. 1.5% Qil-based Permelhiin, 7.5% Piperonyl Butoxide - Ready lo use (55 gal Drum) GAL NO BID NO BID
5. Oil-based Permethrin RTU, min_4% Permelhrin and 4% Piperonyl Butoxide - - Ready lo Use (55 gal) Drum GAL | ML Kontrol 44 $22.98 PermaSease 44 (55g! drum) $20.68
6. Oil-based Permethrin RTU, min. 4% Permethrin and 4% Piperonyl Butoxide - Ready to Use - 2 X 2.5 galipail GAL| ML Kontrol 44 $22.98 PE"“"’SE"M (2x2 55g1 Rt
7. Oil-based Permelhrin RTU, min 4% Permeihrin and 4% Piperonyl Buloxide - Ready 1o Use - { 275 gals) Mini Bulk GAL ML Kontrol 4-4 $22.98 PermaSease 44 {2754 tote) $20.25
8. Oil-based Permethrin Concentrate, min. 30% Permethrin, 30% Piperonly Butoxide - S gal/pail GAL | ML Kontrol 30-03 $91.86 Pem;aos;a:: :g;nglz::tgl 84 $73.94
9 Oil-based Permelhrin Concentrate min 31% Permelhrin, 66% Piperonyl Butoxide - per/gal GAL | ML Kontrol 31-67 $140.29 Perrr;aOS:Iz:: ggguglz:ftgl - $139.98
10. Chlorpyrifos 1.5 Ib/gal RTU - 55 gal drum (o NO BID NO BID
11, Chlorpyrifos 1.5 Ib/gal RTU - 2 5 gal drum CAL NO BID NO BID
12. Altosid Briquets {220 cnt) — 150 days (Open Markel Price Increases allowed) 8x | Altesid XR Briquets $893.20 NO BID
13, Altosid Briquets (400 cnl)-30days (Open Market Price Increases allowed) BX \ltosid 30 Day Briquef $572.00 NO BID
14 Altoside Pro G 1.5% Methoprene (24 pr cs)- xx days (Open Markel Price Increase allowed) cs NO BID NO BID
15. Alloside Pro G 1.5% Methoprene (12 prcs) - xx days (Open Markel Price Increase allowed) cs Altosid Pro-G $533.16 NO BID
16. Bactimos Briquels (100 pr/box) - 30 days BX |Mosquito Dunks 5x2i $106.38 NO BID
17_Briquels - 6% Bacilus Sphaericus, 1% Bacillus thuringiensis (200 cnl) - 45 day CH NO BID NO BID
18. EPA Approved Diluent Oil for Mosquito Control - 55 galfdrum GAL | MaxPar G2-60 Oil $10.29 \ GIGS equi $19.98
19. Aquabac (200G) Bacilus Thuringeiensis 2.86% . BAG NO BID $84.00
1 - INTERLOCAL VENDOR o~ /1 Optional Optional
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